

EXHIBIT 4

Selection Criteria

Slip.Transaction Dat 1/1/2011 - 5/13/2011
 User.Selection Include: Ralph Kalfayan, Ashley Polyascko, Erica Stewart
 Clie.Selection Include: Antelope
 Clie.Selection Include: Antelope
 Slip.Classification Open
 Clie.Selection Include: Antelope

Rate Info - identifies rate source and level

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
80627	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.80	400.00	320.00
1/3/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Conference with Jeff Dunn and Stephanie Hedland regarding notice and requests to rejoin the class. Meeting with David to discuss same. Further preparation of changes to website.		0.00		
78148	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.10	400.00	840.00
1/10/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Research in preparation for motion for final approval and motion for attorneys fees.		0.00		
78339	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/11/2011		Discovery	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Formatted discovery and filed documents.		0.00		
78342	TIME	Ashley	1.50	125.00	187.50
1/11/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Spoke with class members regarding the notice that was sent out.		0.00		
80628	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	1.10	400.00	440.00
1/11/2011		Discovery	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Preparation of interrogatories and request for documents related to billing. Review of filings.		0.00		
78253	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/11/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Spoke with class members regarding notice that was sent out.		0.00		

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Page 2

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Description		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
78256	TIME	Erica	6.00	125.00	750.00
1/12/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Updated and organized time and expense chart.			0.00		
78254	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/12/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Spoke with class members regarding notice that was sent out.			0.00		
78250	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	4.90	400.00	1960.00
1/12/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Research regarding motion for fees and costs. Review of all cases in support of 1021.5 and case map same.			0.00		
78245	TIME	Ashley	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/12/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Spoke with class members in regards to their questions regarding the notice that was sent out.			0.00		
78382	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	7.80	400.00	3120.00
1/13/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Initial preparation of declaration in support of fee motion. Research case authority regarding same.			0.00		
78255	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/13/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Spoke with class members regarding the notice they received.			0.00		
78257	TIME	Ashley	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/13/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Created Chart with list of all filings in the case including discovery.			0.00		
78258	TIME	Ashley	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/13/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Answered calls from class members regarding notice that was sent out.			0.00		
78293	TIME	Ashley	5.00	125.00	625.00
1/13/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Worked on chart for pages produced.			0.00		

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Page 3

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Description		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
78252	TIME	Ashley	1.50	125.00	187.50
1/13/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Put together documents for Gar House to post on the avgroundwater website.			0.00		
78292	TIME	Erica	7.30	125.00	912.50
1/14/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Spoke with class members and answered questions regarding the notice that was sent out. Continued working on charts for time and expense reports.			0.00		
78294	TIME	Ashley	3.00	125.00	375.00
1/14/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Worked on chart for pages produced.			0.00		
78295	TIME	Ashley	7.00	125.00	875.00
1/14/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Worked on Expense chart and chart of Ralph and David's filings.			0.00		
78383	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	5.50	400.00	2200.00
1/14/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Further preparation of fee motion and declaration in support thereof. Research same.			0.00		
78384	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	7.40	400.00	2960.00
1/17/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Further preparation of declaration in support of fee motion. Review of all filings.			0.00		
78337	TIME	Erica	5.30	125.00	662.50
1/17/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Worked on expense chart for declaration.			0.00		
78340	TIME	Ashley	5.30	125.00	662.50
1/17/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Worked on expense chart for declaration.			0.00		
80629	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.20	400.00	1280.00
1/18/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
Further preparation of declaration in support of fee motion. Telephone conference with class members.			0.00		
78341	TIME	Ashley	7.00	125.00	875.00
1/18/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Worked on Expense Charts for Declarations; worked			0.00		

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
	Posting Status	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
	Description	Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
	on Declaration for expenses. Spoke with A.V. Class members regarding the Class Notice				
78343	TIME	Erica	3.00	125.00	375.00
	1/18/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	Antelope	0.00		
	G:29777	2/15/2011	0.00		
	Returned Class Members messages regarding the Notice received; Worked on internal expenses for time/expense chart.				
78381	TIME	Ashley	8.00	125.00	1000.00
	1/19/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	Antelope	0.00		
	G:29777	2/15/2011	0.00		
	Worked on declaration and expense reports. Put together all of the cal express bills, reporters bills and outside copy service bills. Spoke with class members regarding notice that was sent out.				
80630	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	4.10	400.00	1640.00
	1/19/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with Class Members. Further preparation of motion and declaration in support of fee motion.				
78380	TIME	Erica	4.00	125.00	500.00
	1/19/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	Antelope	0.00		
	G:29777	2/15/2011	0.00		
	Organized time and expenses, update chart with all time billed in case. Answered calls and spoke with class members regarding notice received.				
80631	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	4.10	400.00	1640.00
	1/20/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with class members and email same. Further preparation of declaration and motion in support of fees.				
78521	TIME	Erica	4.00	125.00	500.00
	1/20/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	Antelope	0.00		
	G:29777	2/15/2011	0.00		
	Continued working on time and expense reports. Spoke with class members regarding the notice.				
78519	TIME	Ashley	4.00	125.00	500.00
	1/20/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	Antelope	0.00		
	G:29777	2/15/2011	0.00		
	Worked on expenses. Spoke with class members regarding notice.				
78431	TIME	Ashley	8.00	125.00	1000.00
	1/21/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	Antelope	0.00		
	G:29777	2/15/2011	0.00		
	Worked on Expense Declaration including knox charges. Answered calls from class members				

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Page 5

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
	Posting Status	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
	Description	Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
	regarding the notice that was sent out.				
78522	TIME	Erica	4.00	125.00	500.00
	1/21/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	
	Continued charts. Answered calls from class members, mailed maps.		0.00		
80632	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.30	400.00	1320.00
	1/21/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Final preparation of declaration and review of motion for final approval of settlement. Telephone conference with class members. Telephone conference with Chris Sanders from Sanitation district.		0.00		
78523	TIME	Erica	4.00	125.00	500.00
	1/24/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	
	Worked on filing for Santa Ana and Los Angeles Superior Court. Organized for attorney service. Spoke with class members regarding notice.		0.00		
78446	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	7.70	400.00	3080.00
	1/24/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	
	Final preparation of motion for attorneys fees, order in support thereof, declaration in support thereof, and schedule of expenses in support thereof. Attention to Notice of Lodgment. Telephone conferences with Greg James regarding his declaration. Meeting with David to discuss motion and Ps and As. Telephone conference with Class members.		0.00		
78448	TIME	Ashley	10.00	125.00	1250.00
	1/24/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	
	Worked on Expense Declaration and Notice of Lodgment for Motion for Reimbursement for Attorneys' Fees.		0.00		
78524	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
	1/25/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	
	Answered calls from class members regarding the notice that was sent out.		0.00		
78454	TIME	Ashley	2.00	125.00	250.00
	1/25/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	
	Spoke with class members regarding the notice that was sent out.		0.00		
78455	TIME	Ashley	2.00	125.00	250.00
	1/26/2011	General	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011	Antelope	

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Description		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
		Spoke with class members regarding notice that was sent out. Mailed copy of map to multiple class members.	0.00		
78526	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/26/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Answered calls from class members regarding notice.	0.00		
78515	TIME	Ashley	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/27/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Spoke with class members regarding notice.	0.00		
78527	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/27/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Answered more calls from class members regarding questions and concerns with the notice received.	0.00		
78514	TIME	Ashley	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/28/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Spoke with class members regarding notice.	0.00		
78525	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/28/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Spoke with class members regarding notice.	0.00		
80633	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.10	400.00	840.00
1/28/2011		Conference	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
		Conference call with Jeff Dunn and other PWS Doug Evertz, and Tom Bunn and David Z regarding discovery on class counsel. Telephone conference with [REDACTED] regarding same. Preparation of memo to the file and research issue raised in call.	0.00		
78614	TIME	Erica	1.00	125.00	125.00
1/31/2011		General	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Spoke with class members regarding notice received.	0.00		
78535	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.08	400.00	1232.00
1/31/2011	12:39 PM	Research	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29777	2/15/2011 Antelope	0.00		
		Research discovery of counsel related to fee petition. Telephone conference with [REDACTED] regarding developments. Telephone conference with Greg James re regarding developments.	0.00		
80634	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	5.50	400.00	2200.00
2/1/2011		Conference	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
		Exchange of emails with PWS regarding ex parte to	0.00		

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
	push back dates and conduct discovery on counsel.(.4) Preparation of responses thereto. (.2) Research case law for discovery regarding fees. (4.1) Telephone conference with Greg James regarding hearing. (.3) Exchange of emails with co-counsel. (.5)				
80685	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	8.60	400.00	3440.00
2/2/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Research and preparation of opposition to ex parte application based on conference call on Friday. (3.3) Outline of oral argument. (2.9) Discussion with David regarding same. (.5) Receipt of ex parte application. (.4) Research and review their case authority. (1.0) Exchange of emails with Mike M and Greg J, (.5)		0.00		
80686	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	8.80	400.00	3520.00
2/3/2011		Ct. appearance	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Preparation for Hearing. (1.8) Appearance at ex parte application by PWS to continue fee petition and respond to discovery. (1.0) Travel time to Los Angeles by train. (4.5) Meeting with PWS after ex parte. (1.0) Discussion with David and Greg regarding same. (.5)		0.00		
78654	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	1.40	400.00	560.00
2/4/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873 3/17/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Preparation of notice of ruling. Review of court's minute order. Discussion with David Z regarding hearing. Receipt and review of emails from class members.		0.00		
78657	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
2/7/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873 3/17/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Review of correspondence from landonwer class member. Respond to same.		0.00		
78684	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.90	400.00	360.00
2/7/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873 3/17/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with class members and return of email to class members.		0.00		
78695	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	1.70	400.00	680.00
2/10/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873 3/17/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with Willis Class members. Review of filings including oppositions by Fife and Zimmer.		0.00		

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Page 8

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
78840	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.10	400.00	840.00
2/11/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873	3/17/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Research cases in support of discovery of opponent's billing.		0.00		
78841	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.40	400.00	160.00
2/16/2011		Conference	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873	3/17/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with Bill Brunick regarding status of case.		0.00		
80687	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	8.40	400.00	3360.00
2/17/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Final preparation of reply brief in support of Final approval motion. (3.2) Preparation of Declaration in support thereof. (1.2) Multiple exchange of emails with opposing counsel regarding meet and confer re discovery. (1.4) Telephone conference with landowner counsel regarding status of trial proceedings. (.6) Respond to landowner class emails. (.6) Research discovery of fee opponent bills under CPRA. (1.4)		0.00		
80688	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	5.30	400.00	2120.00
2/18/2011	10:45 AM	7/11/2011 Conference	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Preparation for conference call with all PWS regarding discovery meet and confer. (2.4) Conference call with all PWS regarding same. (.4) Telephone conference with Ms. Walker regarding ex parte and location of settlement hearing. (.2) Exchange of email with Jeff Dunn. (.2) Discussion with David regarding status. (.4) Further preparation of stipulation for City of Lancaster. (1.1) Email to Doug Evertz regarding same. (.2) Preparation of notice regarding new hearing location. (.4)		0.00		
78874	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	4.40	400.00	1760.00
2/21/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29873	3/17/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Further research and preparation for hearing on motion to compel and motion for final approval of settlement.		0.00		
80689	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	8.40	400.00	3360.00
2/22/2011		Case management	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Review of Weeks declaration. (.4) Preparation of statement of items in dispute for motion to compel. (1.5) Preparation of declaration in support thereof. (1.2) Final preparation of brief regarding motion to compel. (1.4) Preparation for oral argument. (2.3) Further review of cases. (1.2) Review of comments from class members. (.4)		0.00		

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Description		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
80690	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	8.20	400.00	3280.00
2/24/2011		Ct. appearance	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
Appearance in court regarding motion for final approval and ex parte application for order shortening time. (1.0) Lengthy meeting with all Willis class landowners pre and post hearing. (3.0) Travel to and from Los Angeles. (4.0) Telephone conference with landowner counsel regarding results of hearing. (.2)			0.00		
80691	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	1.20	400.00	480.00
2/25/2011		Conference	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
Exchange of email with Doug Evertz regarding stipulation. (.2) Telephone conference with Doug Evertz regarding stipulation. (.2) Preparation of orders. (.8)			0.00		
80692	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.30	400.00	1320.00
2/28/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
Preparation of correspondence to class members that visited 2/24/11 hearing. (.3) Review of billings. (1.2) Research LA hourly rates and Countrywide petition. (1.8)			0.00		
78976	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.70	400.00	1080.00
3/1/2011		Conference	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Exchange of emails with Stef regarding class list (.2). Telephone conference with class members (.5). Research billing rates issue (2.0).			0.00		
79047	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
3/2/2011		Case management	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Exchange of emails with Doug Evertz regarding stipulation.			0.00		
79062	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.90	400.00	360.00
3/3/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Telephone conference with Class members regarding settlement (.5). Preparation of letter to counsel regarding mediation (.4).			0.00		
79064	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.40	400.00	960.00
3/4/2011		Case management	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Exchange of emails with Warren Wellen regarding mediation (.2). Telephone conference with mediator's office (.2). Preparation for mediation, summarizing argument, proposals, billings, and research background of mediator (2.0).			0.00		

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Description		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
79190	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	4.50	400.00	1800.00
3/7/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Receipt and review of opposition brief to motion to compel from PWS (.5). Research cases (2.0). Preparation of reply brief (2.0).			0.00		
79191	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.60	400.00	1440.00
3/8/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Further preparation of reply brief to motion to compel (2.0). Research cases (1.6).			0.00		
79121	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	8.00	400.00	3200.00
3/9/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Receipt and review of all opposition briefs related to fee petition (2.0). Review of opposition to privilege motion to compel (1.0). Preparation of reply (2.0). Research cases relative to all motions (3.0).			0.00		
79138	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	10.50	400.00	4200.00
3/10/2011		Ct. appearance	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Appearance at mediation before Jerry Kurland (3.5). Travel to mediator's office in Santa Monica with DZ (2.0). Meeting with counsel before prior to and after mediation (1.0). Travel from Santa Monica (2.0). Research cases of PWS re fees (2.0)			0.00		
79142	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.60	400.00	1440.00
3/11/2011		Briefing	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Further preparation of reply brief to motion to compel billing of PWS (1.5). Research cases (1.5). Telephone conference with class members [REDACTED] regarding status (.6).			0.00		
79187	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	6.00	400.00	2400.00
3/13/2011		Ct. appearance	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Travel to Los Angeles on hearing for motion to compel PWS billing records (2.5). Review of cases (2.5). Preparation for oral argument (1.0).			0.00		
79188	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	11.50	400.00	4600.00
3/14/2011		Ct. appearance	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948	4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
Appearance at hearing on motion to compel (1.0). Preparation for hearing (1.0). Travel back to San Diego (2.5). Preparation of reply brief in opposition to BBK brief on attorneys fees motion plus declaration (8.0).			0.00		

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
79189	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	7.80	400.00	3120.00
	3/15/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Final preparation of reply brief to BBK opposition (2.0). Further research of authorities (2.0). Preparation of declaration in support thereof (1.0). Research cases and statutes (2.5). Email response to landowner class member Pamela [REDACTED] (.3).				
79202	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.30	400.00	120.00
	3/16/2011	Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with [REDACTED] Family Trust beneficiary regarding terms of settlement.				
79274	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
	3/17/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Email Bill Brunick regarding draft proposal.				
79284	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	7.80	400.00	3120.00
	3/18/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with mediator Jerry Kurland regarding mediator's proposal (.3). Receipt and review of supplemental brief from BBK regarding IFLOW and other issues (.5). Research history of case (2.0). Research case authorities for prevailing party and other elements of 1021.5 (5.0).				
79287	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	7.60	400.00	3040.00
	3/21/2011	Briefing	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Review of filings by Bolthouse and other landowners (.4). Research cases in support of elements under 1021.5 (3.0). Preparation for hearing on motion for fees and preparation of outline (2.0). Exchange of emails with Ms. Walker regarding case (.2). Preparation of declaration in support of supplemental reply and checked attached billings and prior emails (2.0)				
79299	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	9.50	400.00	3800.00
	3/22/2011	Hearing	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Preparation for oral argument (1.0). Travel time to San Diego after hearing (2.5). Meeting with Greg James and David Z prior to hearing (1.5). Attendance at hearing on motion for attorneys fees (1.5). Meeting with all counsel after hearing (1.0). Travel to San Diego (2.5)				
79311	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.40	400.00	160.00
	3/24/2011	Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
	Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011 Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with class member Robert				

7/12/2011
9:48 AM

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP
Slip Listing

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
	regarding status of case (.2). Email from Bill Brunick with copy of judgment (.2).				
79359	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
3/28/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with class member James		0.00		
79368	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.80	400.00	320.00
3/30/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with class member regarding class settlement (.2). Email from class member Tony and call back regarding class settlement (.2) Receipt and review of orders from court (.4).		0.00		
79386	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.40	400.00	160.00
3/31/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:29948 4/14/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Exchange of email with Jeff Dunn regarding open items (.2) Review of access database (.2)		0.00		
80693	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.60	400.00	240.00
4/1/2011		Class Notice	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Revise website (.2) Email revisions and receipt of confirmation. (.2) Email court regarding declaration (.2)		0.00		
79514	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.40	400.00	160.00
4/6/2011		Case management	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:30006 6/1/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Exchange of email from AVEK and Warren Wellen.		0.00		
79742	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	1.40	400.00	560.00
4/26/2011		Case management	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:30006 6/1/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Emails from Jeff and Stefanie (.2) Finalize request to enter judgment (.2) Review of emails from other counsel (.2) Review of Dunn declaration regarding service (.2). Telephone conference with Mike Davis regarding judgment (.2). Preparation for hearing (.4)		0.00		
79808	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
4/29/2011		Conference	0.00	T@1	
Billed	G:30006 6/1/2011	Antelope	0.00		
	Telephone conference with class member (.2)		0.00		
79947	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	1.40	400.00	560.00
5/2/2011		Case management	0.00	T@1	
WIP		Antelope	0.00		
	Receipt and review of Wood class filings (1.4)		0.00		

Slip ID	Dates and Time	User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
		Client	Est. Time	Bill Status	
		Reference	Variance		
79948	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	3.60	400.00	1440.00
	5/3/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Further review of Wood class filings and judgment and comparison to Willis class (1.5). Telephone conference with Greg James (.4). Preparation of email to PWS (.4). Exchange of email with counsel regarding strategy to employ (.5) Email Eric Garner regarding wood agreement (.3) Preparation of memo to file regarding strategy (.5)		0.00		
79952	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.20	400.00	880.00
	5/4/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Review of all other basin adjudications per declaration of Eric Garner to respond to argument that water usage to Wood class is de minimis (1.2). Research terms of Accord for small pumper class (1.0)		0.00		
79960	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.80	400.00	320.00
	5/5/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Email from Eric Garner regarding Wood settlement (.2). Receipt of letter from Mike Davis requesting list (.2) Email to PWS requesting response (2). Email with David regarding same (.2).		0.00		
80012	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
	5/9/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Exchange of emails with Stefanie regarding class list.		0.00		
80013	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	0.20	400.00	80.00
	5/10/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Exchange of emails with Stefanie regarding response to Mike Davis.		0.00		
80014	TIME	Ralph Kalfayan4	2.70	400.00	1080.00
	5/11/2011	Case management	0.00	T@1	
	WIP	Antelope	0.00		
	Meeting with Dave Z to discuss order on fees and Wood class motion for approval (.5). Review of Copa De Oro filing (.5) Research entry of order versus judgment (1.2). Review of all other oppositions to Wood motion for preliminary approval (.5)		0.00		
Grand Total					
		Billable	344.48		105919.50
		Unbillable	0.00		0.00
		Total	344.48		105919.50