

# **EXHIBIT 6**

**Law Office of Greg James  
HCR 79, Box 11  
712 Owens Gorge Road  
Mammoth Lakes, California 93546  
760-935-4148**

May 13, 2011

Krause, Kalfayan, Benick & Slavins  
625 Broadway, Suite 635  
San Diego, California 92101  
Attention: Ralph B. Kalfayan, Esq

---

Summary of Legal/Consulting Services Rendered by Greg James from  
January 24, 2011 to May 13, 2011

Antelope Valley Groundwater Adjudication

---

Professional Services

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/24/11	Review draft P&As in support of motion for atty's fees and email suggestions to D. Zotnick	1.50	400	600.00
01/25/11	Review final motions for approval of settlement agreement and for award of attys fees filed in the AV case	1.00	400	400.00
01/31/11	Telephone call w/ R. Kalfayan re request of attys for the water purveyors to postpone the hearing on the Class' motion for atty fees and to commence discovery	0.30	400	120.00
02/01/11	Research right of a party opposing a motion for atty fees to conduct discovery and email results of the research to R. Kalfayan	0.80	400	320.00
02/01/11	Telephone call w/ R. Kalfayan re response to request to postpone hearing on motion for atty fees	0.30	400	120.00
02/02/11	Review water purveyors motion for a continuance of the atty's fees motion, research cases cited and assemble materials for appearance at 2-3-11 hearing	1.10	400	440.00
02/03/11	Attend ex parte hearing in AV case requested by water purveyors	1.00	400	400.00
02/03/11	Travel time from Toms Place to Los Angeles to Toms Place to attend ex parte hearing in LA Superior Court requested by water purveyors	10.00	150	1,500.00
02/03/11	Meeting w/ R. Kalfayan in advance of ex parte hearing on AV case requested by water purveyors	1.50	400	600.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
02/04/11	Review minute order from AV ex parte hearing and draft and send notes summarizing the ex parte hearing and the follow-up meeting with the attys for the water purveyors to R. Kalfayan	0.50	400	200.00
02/14/11	Telephone call w/ R. Kalfayan re water purveyors' objections to discovery propounded by the Willis Class	0.30	400	120.00
02/15/11	Review opposition to final approval of settlement agreement filed by AVGA (Fife)	0.30	400	120.00
02/15/11	Research Calif Public Records Act in relation to public water suppliers objections to Willis Class discovery re atty's fees and email results of research to R, Kalfayan	0.80	400	320.00
02/18/11	Telephone call w/ R. Kalfayan re his upcoming teleconference with the attys for the water purveyors	0.30	400	120.00
02/20/11	Research discoverability of attys billing records and email results of research to R. Kalfayan	1.50	400	600.00
02/22/11	Research cases pertaining to form of judgment in the AV case (final v interlocutory) in preparation for hearing on approval of final settlement	2.00	400	800.00
02/23/11	Travel time from Bishop to L.A. to Bishop to attend hearing on final approval of AV settlement agreement	9.00	150	1,350.00
02/24/11	Meeting w/ R. Kalfayan in advance of hearing on final approval of AV settlement agreement	1.00	400	400.00
02/24/11	Participate in meetings with members of the Willis Class prior to, and following, the hearing on the final approval of the AV settlement agreement	1.70	400	680.00
02/24/11	Attend court hearing on final approval of the AV settlement agreement	0.40	400	160.00
03/07/11	Review draft mediation brief re attys fees and email suggested revisions to D. Zotnick	1.10	400	440.00
03/10/11	Telephone call w/ R. Kalfayan re opposition to motion for award of attorney's fees	0.50	400	200.00
03/10/11	Attend mediation with Gerald Kurland on motion for award of attorney's fees	4.00	400	1,600.00
03/10/11	Review briefs in opposition to motion for award of attys fees	2.30	400	920.00
03/15/11	Review atty fees cases cited in opposition to motion for award of attys fees, review and revise draft response to opposition, draft supplemental declaration, draft portions of response to opposition	6.90	400	2,760.00
03/19/11	Telephone call w/ R Kalfayan re response to most recent opposition to motion for attys's fees	0.50	400	200.00
03/22/11	Travel time from Bishop to L.A. to Bishop to attend Court hearing on AV attys fees motion	10.00	150	1,500.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/22/11	Attend Court hearing on attys fees motion	1.10	400	440.00
03/22/11	Meeting w/ R. Kalfayan in advance of Court hearing on attorneys fees motion	1.00	400	400.00
05/03/11	Review Woods Class settlement for potential conflict with Willis Class settlement and exchange emails w/ R. Kalfayan with thoughts	2.50	400	1,000.00
05/05/11	Review responses from E. Garner to emails questioning whether the Woods Class settlement violated the Willis Class settlement and discuss with R. Kalfayan via email	0.80	400	320.00
05/06/11	Review Court order awarding attys fees	0.40	400	160.00
05/12/11	Telephone call w/ R. Kalfayan and D. Zotnick re potential responses to Woods Class settlement	0.80	400	320.00
Summary of Hours				
	Greg James	67.20 hr		
	TOTAL: Professional Services	67.20		\$ 19,630.00

---