

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	Enforce Settlement Agreement (2.0); research cases and analyze discoverability of Court-appointed expert materials and draft email regarding same (1.5)		
4/15/2015	RBK Conference Meeting with Lynne to discuss merits of motion to enforce settlement (1.0). Telephone conference with Mike Mc:Lachlan regarding status of case and status of depositions (.3).	1.30 500.00/hr	650.00
	LB General Research and analyze cases in support of opposition to SPPS (4.5); draft Motion to Enforce Willis Settlement Agreement (3.0); review emails regarding deposition of class representative David Estrada (.2)	7.70 500.00/hr	3,850.00
4/16/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Further preparation of brief in support of motion to enforce Willis Class judgment (2.0). Email with Mike M regarding location of deposition. (.2).	2.20 500.00/hr	1,100.00
	LB General Draft and review emails with Archdiocese of Los Angeles regarding Notice of Wood Class Settlement received by Archdiocese in error (1.0); discuss same with Allan Graf, outside counsel for Archdiocese (.3); analyze Notice of Wood Class Settlement regarding alleged applicability to Archdiocese and for impact on Willis Class (3.0); draft Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement (1.5).	5.80 500.00/hr	2,900.00
4/17/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with David Estrada to discuss status of case (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB General Research and analyze case law regarding writs of mandate and enforcement of settlement agreements (6.5); edit draft Motion to Enforce (1.0)	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
	RBK Travel Travel to and from Newport Beach (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
4/19/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of witness list and exhibit list for opposition to SPPS (1.0).	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/20/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Telephone conference with Danielle from Chino Basin regarding our opposition to SPPS (.5) Preparation of memo to file and email other counsel (.2). Further emails regarding filing of new complaint against PWS (.4). Meeting with counsel regarding strategy for witness list (.5). Lengthy telephone conference with Mike M regarding opposition to SPPS (.5). Email exchange with consultant Rod Smith (.5).	2.60 500.00/hr	1,300.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Memo regarding Docket Numbers and Dates for Stipulation and Judgments.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
	LB General Draft and review emails from R. Kalfayan and Greg James regarding strategy for enforcing settlement agreement with Public Water Suppliers (1.5); review and analyze physical solutions (3.0).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
4/21/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further preparation of witness and exhibit list (.9). Conference with Lynne to discuss strategy (.4).	1.30 500.00/hr	650.00
	LB General Review and edit draft CMC statement and research potential need to renew motion to add Archdiocese of Los Angeles	3.50 500.00/hr	1,750.00
4/22/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference call with Greg and Lynne to discuss strategy and filing of petition for writ of mandate and post conference discussions with Lynne (1.0). Conference with real property experts regarding diminution in real property values and research websites. (1.0)	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB General Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Greg James regarding possible filing of separate lawsuit to enforce settlement agreement with Public Water Suppliers (2.0); research pleadings and produced documents to compile draft witness and exhibits lists for Willis Class (5.0)	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
4/23/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Research real property experts in order to oppose SPPS (2.4). Conference call with Steve Roach regarding AV case (.4). Email to Lynne and Greg regarding valuation experts (.3). Review of witness list from John Tootle (.1).	3.20 500.00/hr	1,600.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/23/2015	LB General Analyze Cal Water's witness and exhibit list and discuss same with R. Kalfayan (1.5) ; Edit Willis Class witness and exhibit lists (2.0); [REDACTED] (3.0)	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
4/24/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further preparation of witness list and exhibit list (.5). Review of other PWS witness list (.5). Review and execute retainer agreement with appraisal expert (.4).	1.40 500.00/hr	700.00
	LB General Edit draft witness and exhibit lists for Willis Class	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
4/27/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of other parties witness and exhibit list and further preparation of Willis Class witness list and exhibit list (2.0). Email to client regarding opposition to SPPS (.2). Conference call with expert Brian Gray regarding case (.4). Telephone call to James Waldo (.1). Conference with Lynne regarding communications with class members (1.0). Further review of filings regarding witness and exhibit lists and further conference with Lynne (1.5).	5.20 500.00/hr	2,600.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Willis Class Witness List and Exhibit List (3.5); review and analyze witness and exhibit lists of other parties (2.5); speak with Willis Class Member Lloyd Lewis regarding his inability in 2014 to obtain a permit to build a well to pump groundwater (.4); discuss conversation with R. Kalfayan (.1); draft memorandum regarding conversation with Mr. Lewis (.5)	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
4/28/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of status conference statement (.5). Meeting with Lynne to discuss same (.5).	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
	LB General Research case law regarding CCP Section 1033.5 and payment of expert witness fees as costs (3.5); edit CMC Statement (1.0)	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
4/29/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with Rod to discuss case and opinions (1.0).	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
	LB General Research case law regarding CCP Section 1033.5 and payment of expert witness fees as costs (2.0); draft and finalize CMC Statement	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	(2.5).		
4/29/2015 RBK	Travel Travel to Lake Elsinore to meet with Rod Smith (1.5). Travel back to San Diego (1.5).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
4/30/2015 RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Review of website and suggestions for changes and edit letter to Jeff Dunn (1.3). Review and research filing of motion to enforce due process. (1.5).	2.80 500.00/hr	1,400.00
LB	General Research case law regarding CCP Section 1033.5 and payment of expert witness fees as costs	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
5/1/2015 LB	General Research cases regarding payment of expert witness fees pursuant to CCP section 1033.5 (3.0); draft Motion for Order of Payment of Expert Witness Fees (4.0).	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
5/4/2015 RBK	Hearing Preparation for CMC hearing and conference with Lynne regarding same (1.0). Notices from court regarding hearing (.3). Further preparation for conference (1.0). Appearance at conference before Judge Komar (1.5). Post conference email to counsel (.3). Initial preparation of motion to enforce due process rights of the class (1.5).	5.60 500.00/hr	2,800.00
LB	General Prepare for and participate in CMC telephonic hearing (4.5); review pleadings and transcripts relating to Willis Stipulation of Settlement and Willis Judgment (3.0).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
5/5/2015 RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of three point approach to the case for counsel to review (.5). Receipt and review of Minute Order from Court (.2). Conference with Lynne regarding approaches and motions (.5). Email and letter from BBK regarding meeting (.2). Further preparation of due process motion (4.0). Email from BBK (.2) Conferences with Lynne regarding motions for Due process and enforcement (1.9).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/5/2015	LB General Discuss case strategy with R. Kalfayan (.5); analyze cases regarding enforcement of settlement agreements (3.0).	3.50 500.00/hr	1,750.00
5/6/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Telephone conference with Mike M regarding meet and confer (.3). Telephone conference with Bill Brunick (.3). Meeting with Shaun to discuss case (1.5). Further preparation of due process motion (1.5).	3.60 500.00/hr	1,800.00
	LB General Research cases and prior pleadings in support of Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement with Public Water Suppliers	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
5/7/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with Bill and partners (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	RBK Travel Travel to San Bernardino to meet with AVEK (2.0). Travel back to San Diego (2.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
5/8/2015	RBK Research Research case law in support of motion to enforce due process and preparation for meet and confer with Public Water Suppliers (2.0)	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB General Prepare for Meet and Confer Settlement Conference	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
5/10/2015	LB General Prepare for Meet and Confer Settlement Conference	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
5/11/2015	RBK Travel Travel to BBK Los Angeles to attend court ordered meet and confer (2.5). Travel back to San Diego (2.5).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
	LB Travel Travel to Los Angeles for Meet and Confer Settlement Conference; return to San Diego.	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	LB General Attend Meet and Confer Settlement Conference at offices of Best, Best & Krieger (3.0); meet with R. Kalfayan during breaks in Meet and	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	Confer Settlement Conferences to discuss strategy (1.5)		
5/11/2015	RBK Mediation Meeting with all counsel at BBK (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
5/12/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of due process motion and legal research regarding same (8.).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Research cases and analyze Willis Settlement Agreement and SPPS regarding Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement with Public Water Suppliers.	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
5/13/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Further preparation of due process motion.	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	LB General Research cases regarding civil litigants' right to cross-examine witnesses (2.0); draft and finalize Case Management Statement (2.0); draft email to District 40 counsel regarding updating AV groundwater web site (.4); discuss same with R. Kalfayan (.1); review and analyze CMC Statements filed by other parties (2.0); review and analyze findings from Phase VI Trial (2.0)	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
5/14/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further edits to CMC statement, response to US regarding federal reserve rights, and response to District 40 regarding prove-up and review of docket (7.2). Conference all with Greg regarding same (.8).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Research cases regarding civil litigants' right to cross-examine witnesses (.5); Draft and finalize Addendum to Case Management Statement, Notice to Appear and Be Heard, Response to CMC Statement of United States, and Response to CMC Statement of District 40 and other Stipulating Parties (8.5); preparation for and teleconference with General Counsel of Archdiocese of Los Angeles and outside counsel for Archdiocese regarding status update on case (.5).	9.50 500.00/hr	4,750.00
5/15/2015	RBK Ct. appearance Meeting with Lynne to discuss court appearance and issues therein (1.). Appearance in court call (.9). Further review of filings including Phelan's filing regarding opposition to Wood Class motion (.5).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	Meeting with counsel to discuss case (1.). Email with experts regarding case (.6)		
5/15/2015 LB	General Prepare for and attend CMC telephonic hearing (2.5); draft and finalize withdrawal of objection to Federal Reserve Right based on Judge's ruling during CMC (1.0); review and respond to email from District 40 counsel regarding IT problem with AV groundwater website emails to KKBS (.2); work with IT department to correct problem (.2); draft memorandum to outside counsel for Archdiocese of Los Angeles regarding expert witnesses (1.0); discuss same with R. Kalfayan (.1).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
5/16/2015 LB	General Review emails from R. Kalfayan regarding SPPS and expert witnesses and respond to same.	0.30 500.00/hr	150.00
5/18/2015 RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Conference with expert David Sunding (.6). Conference with Lynne regarding motions (1.0). Further preparation of due process motion (2.1). Further preparation of motion to recover costs (1.4). Email to the Archdiocese regarding status of case (.5).	5.60 500.00/hr	2,800.00
LB	General Teleconference with expert Dr. Sunding regarding proposed work on case (.5); discuss tasks of various expert witnesses with R. Kalfayan (.3); research case law regarding Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement (2.2).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
IK	Litigation Strategy Work Reviewing and organizing landowner discovery.	5.50 200.00/hr	1,100.00
5/19/2015 RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Email from class member and conference call with class member regarding right to pump (1.). Search for expert driller witness (.5). Conference with Lynne regarding motion to enforce (.5). Further preparation of due process motion (3.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
LB	General Edit letter to District 40 counsel regarding expert witnesses (.2); teleconference with Willis Class Member Kamran Kamalyan regarding his inability to get permit to build well to pump groundwater (.3); discuss same with R. Kalfayan (.2); edit Motion to Enforce Due Process (1.0)	1.70 500.00/hr	850.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/20/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Email to and from Tom Bunn regarding Mr. Wildermuth (.2). Further preparation of all three motions enforce due process, settlement agreement, and costs. (3.6).	3.80 500.00/hr 1,900.00
	LB	General Research and draft Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement with Defendant Public Water Suppliers.	8.00 500.00/hr 4,000.00
	IK	Litigation Strategy Work Reviewing and organizing landowner discovery.	5.40 200.00/hr 1,080.00
5/21/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Email to Rowena regarding filings (.2). Further review and finalized same (3.0).	3.20 500.00/hr 1,600.00
	LB	General Draft and finalize Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement, Motion to Enforce Due Process, and Motion for Order of Payment of Expert fees (8.5) ; draft and finalize declaration in support of same (.5); analyze pleading filed by Tapia regarding request for Court approval to continue pumping water (.3)	9.30 500.00/hr 4,650.00
5/22/2015	LB	General Research Antelope Valley newspaper and online articles regarding AV Groundwater settlement news and admissions of Public Water Suppliers' officials	1.50 500.00/hr 750.00
	IK	Litigation Strategy Work Reviewing and organizing landowner discovery.	5.70 200.00/hr 1,140.00
5/25/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Telephone conference with class member (.5). Research and Strategy regarding the three motions (1.0).	1.50 500.00/hr 750.00
5/26/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Email to David Sunding regarding Wildermuth (.2). Conference with expert regarding maps and GIS data files (.4). Email from Class member (.2). Conference with class members (.5). Conference with Lynne (.4). Email from Court regarding hearing dates (.1).	1.80 500.00/hr 900.00



		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/27/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Conference with expert driller (.3).	0.30 500.00/hr 150.00
	IK	Litigation Strategy Work Organizing files in Drop Box along with declarations.	5.50 200.00/hr 1,100.00
5/28/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Search and contact with experts for physical solution (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr 1,000.00
	LB	General Review list of possible expert witnesses regarding physical solution issues	0.30 500.00/hr 150.00
5/29/2015	IK	Litigation Strategy Work Organizing files in Drop Box.	4.30 200.00/hr 860.00
6/2/2015	LB	General Review and analyze Oppositions of PWS to three motions, including case law cited therein (2.0)	2.00 500.00/hr 1,000.00
6/3/2015	LB	General Review and analyze oppositions of PWS to three motions, including case law cited therein (3.0); research case law and facts in support of Replies re three motions (5.0)	8.00 500.00/hr 4,000.00
6/4/2015	LB	General Research case law and facts in support of Replies re three motions and draft portions of Reply briefs re Motion to Enforce, Motion re Due Process, and Motion re Expert Witness Fees (5.5)	5.50 500.00/hr 2,750.00
6/5/2015	LB	General Draft reply briefs regarding: Motion to Enforce, Motion Regarding Due Process and Motion regarding Expert Witness Fees (6.0)	6.00 500.00/hr 3,000.00
6/8/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Conference call with Mike M regarding SPPS (.3). Research and review Opposition briefs to Motion to enforce, due process, and experts (2.5). Preparation of reply to Motion for due process (4.5).	7.30 500.00/hr 3,650.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6/8/2015	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters.	0.50 100.00/hr	50.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Reply briefs re Motion to Enforce, Motion Re Due Process, and Motion re Expert Witness Fees (8.5)	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
6/9/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Research and prepare for oral argument on all three motions (4.0). Emails to counsel (1.0). Meeting with Lynne to discuss case (1.).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	LB General Conference with RBK to discuss case (1.0); research and prepare for hearing re three motions (3.5)	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
6/10/2015	LB Litigation Strategy Work Draft and finalize CMC Statement (2.0); prepare for hearing re three motions (4.5)	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
6/11/2015	LB General Review expert witness lists filed by other parties (1.0)	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
6/12/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review and edit expert designation, review and edit objection to reply brief from PWS, review of filings from other parties regarding expert witness list (6.0). Telephone conference with Willis experts (1.0). Meeting with Lynne to discuss and prepare strategy for hearing (1.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Review and analyze United States' Post-Trial Statement (2.5); draft and finalize Response to District 40's Objections to Reply re Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement (2.0); review and research expert witness lists filed by other parties (2.0); meet with Ralph to discuss and prepare strategy for hearing (1.0); draft and finalize Response to CMC of PWS (1.5)	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
6/14/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for oral argument related to the motion to enforce due process and motion to recover expert witness fees (4.).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
6/15/2015	RBK Hearing Meeting with Greg and Lynne to prepare for hearing (3.). Appearance at hearing on three motions and CMC (2.0). Post hearing meeting with	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	counsel (1.0).		
6/15/2015	LB Hearing Meeting with Ralph and Greg to prepare for hearing (3.0); appear at hearing on three motions and CMC (2.0); post hearing meeting with Ralph and Greg (1.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	LB Travel Travel to San Jose to appear at CMC and hearing on three motions (2.0); return travel to San Diego (2.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	RBK Travel Travel to San Jose to appear at CMC and hearing on three motions (2.0). Travel to San Diego (2.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
6/16/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with Alan Graf and Lynne Brennan regarding status of case (.7). Research and preparation of discovery (3.5).	4.20 500.00/hr	2,100.00
	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters	0.50 100.00/hr	50.00
	LB Conference Conference with RBK & Allan Graf regarding status of case (0.7); draft discovery (3.0)	3.70 500.00/hr	1,850.00
6/17/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Research in preparation for Phase VI Trial.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters.	0.50 100.00/hr	50.00
	LB General Draft and finalize RFPs, Interrogatories, RFAs, Form Interrogatories (7.0)	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
6/18/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Research in preparation for Phase VI Trial.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6/18/2015	LB General Draft and finalize RFAs and Form Interrogatories (4.5)	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
6/19/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Research in preparation for Phase VI Trial.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters.	1.50 100.00/hr	150.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	2.00 100.00/hr	200.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Amended Supplemental Disclosure of Expert Witnesses (0.5); draft and finalize Amended Disclosure of Witnesses and Exhibits (0.5); draft and finalize Notice of Deposition of Court-Appointed Expert Thompson (3.0)	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
6/22/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of landowner records, Diamond Farming (4.). Preparation of status conference statement (2.).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	3.50 100.00/hr	350.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Response to Post-Trial Statement of United States (2.5); review and analyze Notice re Clarification of Briefing re Federal Reserve Right and determine response to same (0.5)	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
6/23/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with Lynne regarding case (.5). Emails regarding same (.5).	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	4.50 100.00/hr	450.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6/23/2015	LB General Conference with Ralph regarding case (0.5); emails regarding same (0.5)	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
6/24/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with Lynne regarding call from BBK.	0.50 500.00/hr	250.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	6.00 100.00/hr	600.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Response to Borax and Bolthouse Farm's Notice re Clarification of Briefing Re Federal Reserve Right (3.5); conference call with Jeff Dunn and Warren Wellen (0.3); discuss same with Ralph (0.5); draft letter to Dunn and Wellen re conference call (0.5)	4.80 500.00/hr	2,400.00
6/25/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Emails regarding case (.5).	0.50 500.00/hr	250.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	6.00 100.00/hr	600.00
	LB E-mail Emails regarding case (0.5)	0.50 500.00/hr	250.00
6/26/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of discovery from landowners (4.). Conference with Lynne regarding strategy (1.0). Review of notices of deposition (1.0). Initial preparation of motion to decertify (2.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	5.00 100.00/hr	500.00
	LB Conference Conference with RBK regarding strategy (1.0)	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
6/29/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further preparation of motion to decertify (2.). Review of Wood Class, Willis, and opt out list and compare the two (2.). Attention to expert	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	work and contact experts (2.0). Preparation of PMK notices (2.).		
6/29/2015	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters.	1.25 100.00/hr	125.00
6/30/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with class members (2.0). Conferences with other opposing counsel (2.0). Preparation of PMK notices (2.). Research conflict issues (2.) Review of all notices to class members and further contact with class members (.9)	8.90 500.00/hr	4,450.00
	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters.	5.25 100.00/hr	525.00
7/1/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of notices of depositions and request for documents (4.0). Research and preparation of depo outlines (1.0) Meeting with counsel to discuss case (1.). Conference with Greg (.3).	6.30 500.00/hr	3,150.00
	RG Trial Hearing - prepare files for possible water wasters.	4.00 100.00/hr	400.00
7/2/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Email from Wendy Wang and response to email (.2). Email from Fife regarding harassment and response thereto (.4). Conference call with class members and review of class lists (2.0). Review of discovery from all overlying landowners and public water suppliers (4.).	6.60 500.00/hr	3,300.00
	RG Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	3.50 100.00/hr	350.00
7/3/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with Jordan Kear (1.0).	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00
	RBK Travel Travel to Santa Barbara to meet with Expert Jordan Kear (5.0). Travel back to San Diego (5.0)	10.00 500.00/hr	5,000.00
7/6/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Multiple conferences with David Niddrie regarding writ and appeal issues (2.0). Research same (2.0). Conference call and email with	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	overlying landowner counsel (1.). Preparation of motion to decertify (2.).		
7/6/2015	RG Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	1.50 100.00/hr	150.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Prepare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	3.00 100.00/hr	300.00
	LB Litigation Strategy Work Draft CMC Statement (1.5); research case law and underlying facts regarding Motion to Withdraw Based on Conflict of Interest (6.0)	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
7/7/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference call with Jeff Dunn, Warren Wellen, and Wendy Wang (.5). Preparation of status conference statement (1.). Conference call with Rich Zimmer (.3). Review of Bolthouse records (.4). Further preparation of motion to decertify (2.). Exchange of emails with experts (.4). Conference with Lynne regarding strategy in case (1.5).	6.10 500.00/hr	3,050.00
	RG Trial Hearing - Prepare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	2.50 100.00/hr	250.00
	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	4.00 100.00/hr	400.00
	LB Litigation Strategy Work Draft and finalize CMC Statement (4.0); review and analyze CMC Statements of PWS and other Stipulating Parties (1.5); conference with Ralph regarding case strategy (1.5); conference call with Jeff Dunn and Warren Wellen (0.5)	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
7/8/2015	RG Trial Hearing - Prepare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	2.50 100.00/hr	250.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/8/2015	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	2.00 100.00/hr	200.00
	LB General Research case law and underlying facts and draft Motion to Withdraw based on Conflict of Interest (7.5)	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
7/9/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of CMC statement and review of other recently filed CMC statements (1.4). Meeting with expert Brian Gray (2.3). Preparation of motion to decertify (2.5). Preparation of conflict motion (.4). Review of objections to discovery (.3). Email exchange with Warren Wellen regarding class member and discovery meet and confer (.2).	7.10 500.00/hr	3,550.00
	RG Trial Hearing - Prepare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	1.50 100.00/hr	150.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Response to CMC Statements of PWS and Landowners (2.0); Research case law and draft Motion to Withdraw Based on Conflict of Interest (5.5); review and analyze Wood Class Motion for Final Approval of Settlement (1.5)	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
7/10/2015	CB Trial Hearing - Compare Willis Class List to Wood Class List for duplicate listings.	2.00 100.00/hr	200.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Motion to Withdraw Based on Conflict of Interest including declarations in support thereof (11.5); prepare for and attend CMC (1.0)	12.50 500.00/hr	6,250.00
7/11/2015	LB General Review and analyze Wood Class Ex Parte Application for Motion to Strike Willis Class Motion to Withdraw or to Continue Hearing- (0.2)	0.20 500.00/hr	100.00
7/13/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with expert Rod Smith (2.0). Emails with experts (1.). Further and edit and review of ex parte applications (1.0). Review of Mike M	5.50 500.00/hr	2,750.00



		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	ex parte application and review of file and preparation of response to Mike M email (1.5). Conference call with Tom Bunn (.2).		
7/13/2015 LB	General Draft and finalize Ex Parte Application for Order Shortening Time including declaration in support thereof (3.5); research and draft Second Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement with PWS (4.5)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
RBK	Travel Travel to and from Claremont (3.0).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
7/14/2015 RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Emails with Rowena regarding schedule (.2). Meeting with Lynne to discuss motion to enforce (.8). Preparation of Motion to Enforce 2 (8.0)	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
LB	General Research and draft Second Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement with PWS (8.0); meeting with Ralph to discuss Motion to Enforce (0.8)	8.80 500.00/hr	4,400.00
7/15/2015 RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of Second Motion to Enforce settlement and exhibits (4.5). Review of expert reports and communication with experts (2.4). Research case law (2.5).	9.40 500.00/hr	4,700.00
LB	General Draft and finalize Second Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement with PWS (8.5)	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
7/16/2015 RBK	Hearing Appearance at two ex parte hearing (.5). Preparation for hearing and meeting with counsel before hearing (1.0). Further conference with counsel (1.0).	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
LB	General Prepare for and attend ex parte hearing regarding Motion to Withdraw Based on Conflict of Interest (2.0); conference with Ralph after hearing to discuss conflict issue further (1.0); review pleadings and factual record regarding opposition to Wood Class Motion for Final Approval	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
	of Class Settlement (5.0)			
7/17/2015	RBK	Litigation Strategy Work Conference with expert Jordan Kear (.5). Conference with Lynne to discuss strategy (1.0). Conference with David to discuss class list and conflict issues (1.0). Review of Motion for final approval for SP class (1.). Telephone conference with witnesses (.5). Preparation of opposition to Final Approval motion by Mike M (5.0)	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
	LB	General Conference with expert Jordan Kear (0.5); conference with Ralph to discuss strategy (1.0); conference with Writ Specialist David Niddrie to discuss conflict of interest issues between Willis and Wood Classes (1.0); research case law and draft opposition to Wood Class Motion for Final Approval of Class Settlement (4.0); finalize Re-Notice of Deposition of Thompson (0.2)	6.70 500.00/hr	3,350.00
7/20/2015	RBK	Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Further preparation of opposition to Wood Class Motion for Final Approval (6.5)	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
	LB	General Research case law and draft Opposition to Final Approval of Wood Class Settlement (8.0)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
7/21/2015	RBK	Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Telephone conference with Willis Class member (.4). Preparation of metering section of opposition brief to motion for final approval and conversation with expert witness Jordan Kear (1.5). Preparation of fairness and notice section of opposition brief and research all cases in support thereof (3.0). Finalize brief (3.3). Email regarding deposition of court appointed expert (.3).	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
	LB	General Draft and finalize Opposition to Final Approval of Wood Class Settlement including declarations in support thereof (8.5)	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
7/22/2015	LB	General Prepare for trial (6.5)	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
7/23/2015	LB	General Prepare for trial (7.0)	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/24/2015	RBK Deposition Preparation for deposition of Court appointed expert (2.0). Telephone conference with Archdiocese (.3). Review and research Ps and As filed by PWS regarding opposition to Second Motion to Enforce (2.5). Telephone conference with class member (.3).	5.10 500.00/hr	2,550.00
	LB General Review and analyze PWS' Opposition to Second Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement (2.0); prepare for deposition of Court-appointed expert Thompson (5.5); review and analyze Tejon Ranch's Limited Response to Willis Class' Opposition to SPPS (0.5)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
7/26/2015	RBK Deposition Preparation for deposition (2.5).	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
	LB Travel Travel to Santa Barbara for deposition of Court-appointed expert Thompson (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	LB Deposition Prepare for Thompson deposition (2.5).	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
	RBK Travel Travel to Santa Barbara for deposition of Court appointed expert (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
7/27/2015	RBK Deposition Deposition of court appointed expert Tim Thompson (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	LB Deposition Prepare for and attend deposition of Court-appointed expert Thompson (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	LB Travel Travel back to Santa Barbara from San Diego (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	RBK Travel Travel back to San Diego from Santa Barbara (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/28/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of filings by PWS regarding second motion to enforce (1.0). Research and preparation of reply brief (6.7).	7.70 500.00/hr	3,850.00
	LB Litigation Strategy Review and analyze Wood Class Opposition to Motion to Withdraw Based on Conflict of Interest (1.5); research case law and draft Reply Motion re Second Motion to Enforce Settlement Agreement (6.5)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
7/29/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Further preparation of reply brief in support of second motion to enforce (5.9). Telephone conference with class member (.2). Meeting with Lynne to discuss strategy (1.0).	7.10 500.00/hr	3,550.00
	LB Litigation Strategy Research case law, draft and finalize Reply Motion re Second Motion to Enforce (8.0); meeting with Ralph to discuss strategy (1.0)	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
7/30/2015	LB Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Prepare for trial (8.5)	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
7/31/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Conference with experts (.7). Review of exhibits (5.1). Preparation for trial on Monday (4.9).	10.70 500.00/hr	5,350.00
	LB Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Research case law, draft and finalize Motion in Limine No. 1 re Thompson Expert Report (6.5); finalize Motion in limine No. 2 re Reasonable and Beneficial Use (0.5); prepare for trial (2.5)	9.50 500.00/hr	4,750.00
8/1/2015	LB General Prepare for Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial (5.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
8/2/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with Counsel and preparation for trial (4.5).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
	LB Trial Prepare for Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial, including prepare cross-examination of Court-appointed expert of Tim Thompson (6.5).	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/2/2015	LB Travel Travel to Los Angeles for Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	RBK Travel Travel to Los Angeles for trial (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
8/3/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at trial (6.5). Post trial meeting with counsel and preparation for next day of trial (3.0).	9.50 500.00/hr	4,750.00
	LB Trial Prepare for Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial with R. Kalfayan (1.5); attend and participate in Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial (4.5); meet with certain Stipulating Parties to discuss possible settlement (.5); prepare for Day 2 of Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial, including Second Motion to Enforce Willis Settlement Agreement (4.5).	11.00 500.00/hr	5,500.00
8/4/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at trial regarding Wood Class allocation and Second Motion to Enforce (2.0). Post meeting with counsel (.5).	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
	LB Trial Prepare for Day 2 of Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial (1.5); attend and participate in Day 2 of Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial (2.5); discuss litigation strategy following Day 2 of Phase VI/Physical Solution Trial with R. Kalfayan (1.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
	LB Travel Return travel to San Diego (2.5).	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
	RBK Travel Travel from Los Angeles (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
8/5/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Email from MM regarding motion to amend judgment and research regarding same (2.5). Telephone conference with class members (1.0). Telephone conference with experts (1.0). Conference with Lynne regarding strategy (1.0).	5.50 500.00/hr	2,750.00
	LB General Discuss litigation strategy with R. Kalfayan and Greg James - 1.0; discuss trial outcome with Allan Graf, outside counsel for Archdiocese of Los Angeles - .4; discuss trial outcome with Class Representative	1.70 500.00/hr	850.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	David Estrada - .3		
8/6/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of docket and research materials in preparation for trial (8.0)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
8/7/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference all with Phelan regarding trial (.4). Further preparation for trial (5.5).	5.90 500.00/hr	2,950.00
8/10/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further research and briefing of conflict motion (4.5).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
	LB General Develop and analyze possible settlement proposals for Willis Class - 1.0; discuss possible settlement proposals for Willis Class with Rob Parris, acting as mediator and discuss same with R. Kalfayan, Greg James, Allan Graf, and David Estrada -2.0; review and analyze Leisure Lake Mobile Estates' Answer - .4; review and analyze Wood Class' Opposition to Willis Class' Motion to Withdraw, including cases cited therein - 4.0; review and analyze Public Water Suppliers' Opposition to Willis Class' Motion to Withdraw - .3	7.70 500.00/hr	3,850.00
8/11/2015	LB General Continue discussing possible settlement proposals for Willis Class with Rob Parris, acting as mediator and discuss same with R. Kalfayan and Greg James - 1.5; analyze and discuss Groundwater Sustainability Act with Greg James - .5; conduct legal research and analyze effects of appeals - 1.5; conduct legal research regarding conflicts of interest - 4.0	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
8/12/2015	LB General Continue discussing possible settlement proposals for Willis Class with Rob Parris, acting as mediator and discuss same with R. Kalfayan and Greg James - .8; analyze prior court filings regarding class definition of Willis Class and conduct legal research regarding conflicts of interest in support of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance - 6.5	7.30 500.00/hr	3,650.00
8/13/2015	LB General Review and analyze Court's Minute Orders for August 3 and 4 - .2; review and analyze Tejon Ranch's brief, including cases cited therein, analyzing whether class action in this adjudication is an in rem proceeding - 3.0; analyze hearing transcripts regarding Willis Class definition - 1.5; conduct legal research regarding conflicts of interest in	7.20 500.00/hr	3,600.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	support of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance - 2.5		
8/14/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Review of Oppositions to Motion to Withdraw (1.0). Preparation of reply and related declaration and review of docket (6.5).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
	LB General Conduct legal research regarding conflicts of interest in support of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance - 8.5	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
8/16/2015	LB General Analyze Rutter Group regarding Code of Professional Responsibility and class action cases in particular - 3.5	3.50 500.00/hr	1,750.00
8/17/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Preparation of declaration and reply brief to motion to withdraw based on conflict and conference with Lynne to discuss same.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Review and edit declaration of Ralph B. Kalfayan in support of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance - .5; review Trial Briefs of Phelan Pinon Hills and District 40 - 1.0; discuss settlement conference details with R. Kalfayan, Greg James, and Allan Graf - .3; review draft reply brief insert of R. Kalfayan - .3; conduct legal research and draft Reply Brief in support of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance - 6.0	8.10 500.00/hr	4,050.00
8/18/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Final preparation of brief and my declaration in support thereof for Motion to Withdraw based on conflict. Review of Mike's opposition and PWS opposition.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Reply Brief in support of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance - 7.0	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
8/19/2015	LB General Preparation for trial.	2.90 500.00/hr	1,450.00
8/20/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with Lynne regarding conflict motion (1.0)	1.00 500.00/hr	500.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/20/2015	LB General Discuss District 40's refusal to negotiate in good faith with the Willis Class with Archdiocese (.2).	0.20 500.00/hr	100.00
8/21/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for hearing on motion to withdraw (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	LB General Meet with valuation expert Steve Roach - 1.5; prepare for August 25 hearing regarding Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance 2.0	3.50 500.00/hr	1,750.00
8/24/2015	RBK Ct. appearance Preparation for oral argument (6.5).	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
	LB General Prepare for August 25 hearing regarding Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance (7.5).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
	RBK Travel Travel to San Jose (1.5).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
	LB Travel Travel to San Jose for hearing regarding Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance (1.5).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
8/25/2015	RBK Ct. appearance Appearance regarding Motion to Withdraw (2.0). Pre and post meeting with counsel (3.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
	LB Ct. appearance Prepare for August 25 hearing regarding Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance (2.0); attend August 25 hearing regarding Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance (1.5).	3.50 500.00/hr	1,750.00
	RBK Travel Travel back to San Diego (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB Travel Return travel from San Jose (1.5).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00



		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/26/2015	RBK Conference Conference call with David Estrada (.4). Email from MM (.2). Conference with Lynne regarding strategy (.9).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
	LB General Discuss litigation strategy, including whether to file a Writ, with R. Kalfayan - 1.0; discuss August 25 hearing with David Estrada and Allan Graf - .5; review Court's Minute Order - .1	1.60 500.00/hr	800.00
8/27/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with Mike M regarding case (.4). Conference with Niddrie regarding writ (1.0). Conference with Lynne regarding settlement (1.0). Review of orders (.2).	2.60 500.00/hr	1,300.00
	LB General Review and analyze email from Greg James regarding possible Writ regarding conflict of interest issue and respond to same - .5; teleconference with Writ Specialist David Niddrie regarding filing of Writ on conflict of interest issue - .5; teleconference with Mike McLachlan regarding proposed order and possible settlement discussion with various landowners - .5; draft email to counsel for landowners setting forth settlement terms proposed by Willis Class - 1.5; discuss same with Rob Parris - .2; discuss same with David Estrada and Allan Graf - 1.0; discuss same with R. Kalfayan and Greg James - .3	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
8/28/2015	LB General Respond to emails from landowners regarding proposed settlement terms of Willis Class (.4); discuss proposed settlement terms of Willis Class with Rob Parris (.2); review filings regarding Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance to prepare Writ for Court of Appeal (2.5).	3.10 500.00/hr	1,550.00
8/31/2015	LB General Draft Writ regarding denial of Motion to Withdraw or for Continuance	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Telephone conference with class member (.2). Research writs (2.0). Conference with Lynne regarding writs (1.0). Review of proposed order (.5).	3.70 500.00/hr	1,850.00
9/1/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Multiple edits to Proposed order regarding conflict motion (1.0). Multiple emails with counsel (1.0). Multiple edits to counter proposed order (1.0). Review and research motion to correct willis judgement	5.50 500.00/hr	2,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	and email to MM (2.5).		
9/1/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Review of Copo de Oro filings to determine if objections are needed (1.0). Call Willis Class Members and witnesses for upcoming trial (5.0).	6.00 200.00/hr	1,200.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Proposed Order Denying Willis Class Motion to Withdraw Based on Conflict of Interest (1.5); prepare for trial (7.0)	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
9/2/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with experts (1.2). Conference with Lynne regarding strategy (1.4). Preparation of CMC statement (1.0). Preparation for trial and called witnesses (2.0).	5.60 500.00/hr	2,800.00
	LB General Draft and finalize CMC Statement (1.5); conference with writ experts (1.2); conference with Ralph regarding strategy (1.4); prepare for trial (4.5)	8.60 500.00/hr	4,300.00
9/3/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for trial and calls to landowner clients (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Re-Notice of Willis Class Motions (0.3); draft and finalize Response to CMC Statement of PWS (1.5); prepare for trial (6.5).	8.30 500.00/hr	4,150.00
9/4/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for CMC and appearance at CMC (2.0). Preparation for trial (6.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Producing records, cross-checking class lists, contacting Willis Class Members for Trial. Trial prep.	5.10 200.00/hr	1,020.00
	LB Litigation Strategy Work Prepare for and attend CMC (2.0); prepare for trial (5.5).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/7/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for trial at Staples Store from Saturday, Sunday and Monday- work included trial brief, depo preparation, witness gathering, research of filed documents (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
9/8/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Exchange of emails with landowners and preparation for deposition of Robert Wagner and further preparation for trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Prep for Trial - review transcripts and prepare pumper's experts subpoenas.	7.00 200.00/hr	1,400.00
	LB General Research case law and draft Writ of Mandamus re Conflict of Interest (3.5); prepare for trial (5.0).	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
9/9/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for deposition of Wagner (4.0). Further preparation of writ (4.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Prepare for Wagner Deposition.	7.50 200.00/hr	1,500.00
	LB General Research case law and draft Writ of Mandamus re Conflict of Interest (5.5); prepare for deposition of expert witness Wagner (2.5); draft and finalize Notice of Deposition of expert witness Wagner (0.5); draft and finalize Response to Objections to Notice of Deposition of Wagner (0.3).	8.80 500.00/hr	4,400.00
9/10/2015	RBK Deposition Preparation for deposition of Wagner (2.0). Appearance at court ordered conference call (1.5). Appearance at deposition (4.0).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Preparation.	6.50 200.00/hr	1,300.00
	LB Deposition Preparation for deposition of expert witness Wagner (2.0); appearance at Court-ordered conference call with Stipulating Parties (1.0); attend deposition of Wagner (4.0).	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/10/2015	LB Travel Travel to and from Sacramento (3.0).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
	RBK Travel Travel to and from Sacramento (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
9/11/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further preparation of writ and related exhibits (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of Writ - Organizing and collecting needed information and possible exhibits	7.00 200.00/hr	1,400.00
	LB General Research case law and draft Writ of Mandamus re Conflict of Interest (9.0).	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
9/13/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Collect together all the exhibits for the writ.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
9/14/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Final Preparation of Writ (4.0). Email from Jeff Dunn.	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Prepare the Writ for filing with the Court of Appeals - Exhibits.	9.00 200.00/hr	1,800.00
	LB General Draft Writ of Mandamus re Conflict of Interest (8.5).	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
9/15/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/15/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial and Writ Prep.	4.50 200.00/hr	900.00
	RG Pleading Format & Prepare Writ.	2.00 100.00/hr	200.00
	LB General Finalize Writ of Mandamus re Conflict of Interest (4.5) prepare for trial (4.0) review and analyze PWS' Opposition to various Willis Class Motions (1.5).	10.00 500.00/hr	5,000.00
9/16/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with witnesses in Newport (4.0). Edits to opposition to correct judgment (.5). Preparation of modified SPPS (2.0).	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Willis Class' Partial Opposition to Motion to Correct Willis Judgment (.3). Meeting with witnesses in Newport (6.0).	6.30 500.00/hr	3,150.00
	RBK Travel Travel to and from Newport Beach to meet with witnesses (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	IK Travel Travel to and from Newport Beach to meet with witnesses (2.0).	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
9/17/2015	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Trial Prepare for trial (8.5).	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
9/18/2015	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (8.)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Draft & finalize CMC Statement (3.0); draft and finalize letter to court appointed expert Mr. Thompson (0.3); prepare for trial (4.0)	7.30 500.00/hr	3,650.00
9/21/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for CMC (1.0). Appearance at CMC (.5). Preparation of Prescription brief (2.0). Meeting with expert witness (2.0). Preparation	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	for meeting with expert witness (2.0).		
9/21/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Review of Transcripts and Drafts for filing and upcoming Trial	3.50 200.00/hr	700.00
	LB General Research case law and draft Willis Class Trial Brief (3.0); prepare for expert witness depositions (5.5); preparation for CMC (0.5); appearance at CMC (0.5); draft and finalize response to CMC Statement of United States (0.2); draft and finalize Notices of Deposition for expert witnesses Williams, Beebe, and Binder (0.3)	10.00 500.00/hr	5,000.00
9/22/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Reviewing and Preparing Demonstratives for Trial - Review of Drafts and Final motions for filing	7.30 200.00/hr	1,460.00
	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (8.0)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Prepare for expert witness depositions (2.0); draft and finalize Willis Class Trial Brief (6.5); review and analyze trial briefs submitted by PWS and other Stipulating Parties (3.0); draft and finalize Response to Objections to Notices of Deposition (0.5)	12.00 500.00/hr	6,000.00
9/23/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of CMC statement for filing and Notices of Depositions of Experts - helping LMB to file and prepare addendum to CMC Statement.	9.00 200.00/hr	1,800.00
	RBK Trial Preparation for trial and taking deposition of Dr. Williams (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Deposition Prepare for and attend deposition of Dr. Williams (5.0); discuss settlement issues with Rob Parris (0.3)	5.30 500.00/hr	2,650.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/23/2015	LB Travel Travel to Laverne (2.0); return travel to SD (2.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
9/24/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Prepare for trial and upcoming Motions.	6.50 200.00/hr	1,300.00
	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Deposition Prepare for and attend deposition of expert witness Beebe (3.0); prepare for deposition of expert witness Binder (2.0); discuss settlement issues with Rob Parris (0.3).	5.30 500.00/hr	2,650.00
	LB Travel Travel to Santa Barbara (4.0); return travel to LAX (2.0); travel to Sacramento (1.0).	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
9/25/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Prep	6.50 200.00/hr	1,300.00
	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Deposition Prepare for and take deposition of expert witness Binder (7.0).	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
	LB Travel Return travel to SD via LAX (3.0)	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
9/27/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Work to put Trial Demonstratives on hard-backed board for presentation, plus delivery to RBK.	5.00 200.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB Trial Prepare for trial (2.5)	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/27/2015	LB Travel Travel to LA for trial (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	RBK Trial Prepare for Trial (3.0).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
	RBK Travel Travel to LA for trial (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
9/28/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at Trial.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Monitoring and Document search.	6.90 200.00/hr	1,380.00
	LB Trial Trial (8.0); prepare for next day of trial (1.5)	9.50 500.00/hr	4,750.00
9/29/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at trial.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Trial Trial Monitoring and Document Search.	5.50 200.00/hr	1,100.00
	LB General Trial (8.0); prepare for next day of trial (2.0)	10.00 500.00/hr	5,000.00
9/30/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at trial.	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Trial Trial Monitoring and Document search - preparing Powerpoint slides for RBK.	6.20 200.00/hr	1,240.00
	LB Trial Trial (8.0); prepare for next day of trial (1.0).	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00



		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/1/2015	IK Trial Trial Monitoring and Document search.	7.20 200.00/hr	1,440.00
	RBK Trial Appearance at trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Trial Trial (8.0); Prepare for next day of Trial (2.0).	10.00 500.00/hr	5,000.00
10/2/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Monitoring and Document Search.	5.50 200.00/hr	1,100.00
	RBK Trial Appearance at trial (6.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	LB Trial Trial (6.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	RBK Travel Return travel to SD (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB Travel Return travel to SD (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
10/5/2015	RBK Trial Meeting with expert to discuss deposition (2.0). Preparation for trial (5.0). Emails to and from opposing counsel and court (1.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Research Westlaw Research in preparation for trial.	6.50 200.00/hr	1,300.00
	LB General Prepare for expert depositions (4.0); prepare for trial (5.0).	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
10/6/2015	RBK Deposition Pre deposition meeting with Steve Roach (1.5). Deposition of Steve Roach (2.0). Preparation for deposition of Jordan Kear (1.0). Preparation for trial (3.0). Conference call with Warren Wellen (.4).	7.90 500.00/hr	3,950.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/6/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Help draft motions and briefs right before trial	4.00 200.00/hr	800.00
	LB General Pre deposition meeting with Steve Roach (1.5); research case law, draft and finalize Willis Class' brief regarding Exportation of Groundwater from Native Safe Yield by Certain Stipulating Parties (4.5); travel to Santa Barbara for Deposition of Jordan Kear (4.0)	10.00 500.00/hr	5,000.00
	RBK Travel Drive to Santa Barbara for deposition of Jordan Kear (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
10/7/2015	RBK Deposition Pre deposition of Jordan Kear (2.0). Deposition of Jordan Kear (4.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Preparation - Gathering Exhibits and presentation materials.	6.70 200.00/hr	1,340.00
	LB General Participate in Court Call regarding various trial matters (0.3); Pre deposition meeting with Jordan Kear (2.0); Deposition of Jordan Kear (4.0).	6.30 500.00/hr	3,150.00
	RBK Travel Travel to SD (5.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
	LB Travel Return travel to SD (5.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
10/8/2015	RBK Deposition Meeting with Rod Smith in preparation for deposition (4.0). Conference with counsel regarding settlement and review draft agreement (2.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for Trial - Gathering Exhibits, booklets, and presentation materials	5.70 200.00/hr	1,140.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/8/2015	LB Hearing Prepare for and attend Settlement Conference in Los Angeles (5.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
	RBK Travel Travel to Claremont (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB Travel Travel to LA and return to SD (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
10/9/2015	RBK Deposition Pre deposition meeting with Rod Smith (3.0). Deposition of Rod Smith (4.0). Post deposition coordination of documents (1.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Preparation - document searching and delivery for LMB and RBK.	4.20 200.00/hr	840.00
	LB Deposition Pre deposition meeting with Rod Smith (3.0); deposition of Rod Smith (4.0).	7.00 500.00/hr	3,500.00
	LB Travel Travel to Claremont and return to SD (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	RBK Travel Travel to and From SD (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
10/10/2015	RBK Trial Preparation of direct exams and cross exams (5.0).	5.00 500.00/hr	2,500.00
10/12/2015	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (8.)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of Exhibit Lists for Phase 6 trial - last minute document searches and research	7.80 200.00/hr	1,560.00
	LB General Prepare for Trial (9.5)	9.50 500.00/hr	4,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/13/2015	RBK Trial Preparation for trial (6.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation for Trial - review and comment on stipulating parties water use from their discovery responses.	7.50 200.00/hr	1,500.00
	LB General Prepare for Trial (6.0); draft and finalize APPS (5.5); submit deposition testimony corrections for Dr. Rodney Smith (0.2).	11.70 500.00/hr	5,850.00
	LB Travel Travel to LA for trial (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	RBK Travel Travel to LA (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
10/14/2015	RBK Trial Trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Trial Monitoring.	6.00 200.00/hr	1,200.00
	LB Trial Trial (8.0); prepare for next day of trial (4.0).	12.00 500.00/hr	6,000.00
10/15/2015	RBK Trial Trial (6.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	LB Trial Trial (6.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
	LB Travel Travel to SD (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/15/2015	RBK Travel Travel to SD (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
10/16/2015	LB General Conference with RBK and David Niddrie regarding case strategy (0.5).	0.50 500.00/hr	250.00
10/19/2015	LB General Prepare closing arguments (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
10/20/2015	LB General Prepare closing arguments (4.5).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
10/21/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Email from Tom Bunn and respond to same (.2). Email from other counsel and respond to same (.2). Review of court orders (.2).	0.60 500.00/hr	300.00
	LB General Prepare closing arguments (3.5).	3.50 500.00/hr	1,750.00
10/22/2015	LB General Prepare closing arguments (4.5).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
10/23/2015	LB General Prepare closing arguments (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
10/26/2015	RBK Trial Preparation of closing arguments, review of transcripts, review of briefs, and review of cases. (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Prepare closing arguments; draft modified SPPS (8.5).	8.50 500.00/hr	4,250.00
10/27/2015	RBK Trial Preparation of modified SPPS, conferences with Lynne, and emails from opposing counsel (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB General Draft modified SPPS; conferences with Ralph (7.5).	7.50 500.00/hr	3,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/28/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Review and comparison of SPPS and Willis APPS.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
	LB General Draft amended APPS (6.5).	6.50 500.00/hr	3,250.00
10/29/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Review and Comparison of SPPS and Willis APPS - drafting of visual representation of differences.	6.10 200.00/hr	1,220.00
	LB General Discuss amended APPS with Ralph and Greg (0.5).	0.50 500.00/hr	250.00
10/30/2015	RBK Hearing Preparation of demonstratives (2.0). Appearance at Court Call Status conference and preparation thereto (2.0). Preparation for trial (4.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Reworking the Exhibit List - adding more exhibits - changing the formatting. Review motion for attorneys fees and begin to prepare a new one.	5.20 200.00/hr	1,040.00
	LB General Participate in case management Court Call (0.8); talk to Rowena Walker re Motion re APPS (0.1).	0.90 500.00/hr	450.00
11/2/2015	RBK Trial Preparation for trial including blow ups, APPS, and briefs (8.0)	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	RG Trial Format and prepare SPPS Proposed Judgment and redline version for filing	1.50 100.00/hr	150.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Redline Comparison for LMB of SPPS and APPS	7.00 200.00/hr	1,400.00
	LB General Draft Amended Alternative Proposed Physical Solution (7.0); prepare for closing arguments (5.0); finalize prescription brief (1.5).	13.50 500.00/hr	6,750.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/3/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at trial in San Jose (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	RG Trial Format and prepare SPPS Proposed Judgment and redline version for filing.	0.50 100.00/hr	50.00
	IK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation and Filing of Objections to Prescription.	4.00 200.00/hr	800.00
	LB Trial Finalize Amended Motion re Alternative Proposed Physical Solution (1.0); prepare for Closing arguments and attend and participate in trial (8.0).	9.00 500.00/hr	4,500.00
	LB Travel Travel to San Jose for trial (1.5).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
	RBK Travel Travel to San Jose (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
11/4/2015	RBK Trial Appearance at trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Trial Prepare for closing argument and attend trial (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
	LB Travel Return travel to San Diego (1.5).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
11/5/2015	LB General Research and analyze CCP 632 re Statement of Decision (.5).	0.50 500.00/hr	250.00
11/6/2015	LB General Teleconference with Allan Graf re Court's tentative decision (.3).	0.30 500.00/hr	150.00
11/9/2015	LB General Research and analyze cases and statute re requests for statement of decision (2.0).	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/10/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Court call appearance regarding statement of decision and preparation thereof (2.0)	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00
	LB General Research and analyze cases and statute re requests for statement of decision (2.5).	2.50 500.00/hr	1,250.00
11/11/2015	LB General Research and analyze cases and statute re requests for statement of decision (3.0).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
11/12/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Conference with ADL and David Estrada regarding status of case (2.0). Conference with Lynne and Greg regarding same (.5). Resesarch filing statement of issues in controversy (1.5).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
	LB General Review issues to raise in Request for Statement of Decision; draft portion of Request for Statement of Decision (4.0).	4.00 500.00/hr	2,000.00
11/13/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Edits and further preparation of request for statement of decision (2.0). Conference with David Niddrie regarding same (.2).	2.20 500.00/hr	1,100.00
	LB General Draft and finalize Request for Statement of Decision (4.5).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
11/14/2015	RBK Travel Return travel to San Diego (1.5).	1.50 500.00/hr	750.00
11/18/2015	RBK Conference Conference with Mike M regarding statement of decision.	0.30 500.00/hr	150.00
11/19/2015	IK Litigation Strategy Work Research regarding a few defendants and acquisitions of property.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
11/20/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Research and preparation of opposition to statement of decision.	2.00 500.00/hr	1,000.00



		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/7/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of statement of decision and proposed judgment (1.0). Email to clients (.1). Email to Rowena regarding opposition date (.2).	1.30 500.00/hr	650.00
12/8/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Meeting with David Niddrie to discuss status of case (1.5). Research opposition to statement of decision (3.0).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00
12/10/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Further preparation of objections to statement of decision and further research case law in support thereof (7.0) Email from MM regarding fees (.4). Review of all judgments (1.0). Conference call with client (.5).	8.90 500.00/hr	4,450.00
12/11/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Edit and further preparation of Objection to statement of decision (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
12/14/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Final edits to Opposition to Statement of Decision and Proposed Judgment (6.0).	6.00 500.00/hr	3,000.00
12/16/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Review of filings (.2).	0.20 500.00/hr	100.00
12/21/2015	RBK Briefs and Motions and Legal Research Preparation of Supplemental Objection to SOD (1.5). Review of Amended SOD and JUDGMENT and preparation of Second Supplemental Objections (1.5).	3.00 500.00/hr	1,500.00
12/22/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Further preparation of Second Supplemental set of objections (1.0). Email to client and Greg (.2). Preparation for oral argument (2.0).	3.20 500.00/hr	1,600.00
12/28/2015	RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of third supplemental objections (1.0). Review of filing of notice of entry and related attachments (.5). Preparation of declaration in support of motion for fees (3.0).	4.50 500.00/hr	2,250.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/29/2015 RBK Litigation Strategy Work Preparation of Motion for attorneys fees, declaration, and supporting documents (8.0).	8.00 500.00/hr	4,000.00
<b>For professional services rendered</b>		<b>\$1,503,300.00</b>

## User Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Amanda Friedman	65.90	300.00	\$19,770.00
Cindy Barba	38.00	100.00	\$3,800.00
Ian Krupar	370.50	200.00	\$74,100.00
Lynne Brennan	1313.40	500.00	\$656,700.00
Ralph B. Kalfayan	1446.50	500.00	\$723,250.00
Ralph B. Kalfayan 400	51.10	400.00	\$20,440.00
Ralph B. Kalfayan 450	5.20	450.00	\$2,340.00
Robin Griffin	29.00	100.00	\$2,900.00
<b>Totals:</b>	<b>3,319.60</b>		<b>\$1,503,300.00</b>