Exhibit 3

Selection Criteria

Slip.Transaction Dat Earliest - 12/31/2010

User.Selection Include: Arthur Connors; Ashley; David Watson; David Watson2; Douglas Stacey; Erica;

Erica 1; Hal W. Gibson; Hal W. Gibson2; James C. Krause5; Paul Oudom; Ralph Kalfayan4; Sarah Gingles; Vic Merjanian; Vic Merjanian-2; Watson, David

Clie.Selection Include: Antelope Include: Antelope Clie.Selection

Slip.Classification Open

Clie.Selection Include: Antelope

Slip.Transaction Typ 1 - 1

Rate Info - identifies rate source and level

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	CIA A C	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
11/1/2006 Billed Reviewed Article fror	FIME 3:26154 12/19 The Bob Joyce. Meeting with tensive conversation with		2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
11/13/2006 Billed Multiple telephone coregarding case mana conference with Reb	FIME 3:26154 2/19 20 20 21 22 23 24 25 26 26 27 27 27 28 28 29 29 20 20 20 20 20 20 20 20	ephone	2.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	920.00
11/14/2006 Billed Receipt and review of statement and excha	FIME 3:26154 12/19 of case management confunge of emails with client Dave to discuss merits of	and	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
12/7/2006 Billed Meeting with David to Telephone conference	FIME G:26257 1/1' o discuss strategy for filin ce with Bob Joyce regardi riew status of pleadings.		1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
12/19/2006 Billed Telephone conference status of complaint a	FIME G:26257 1/1 ce with Rebecca Willis regard intervention versus regards to discuss cas	lated	0.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	360.00
12/20/2006	ΓΙΜΕ G:26257 1/1	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9/2007 Antelope	2.30 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	920.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Exchange of email with David regarding complaint. Telephone conference with Bob Joyce regarding letter. Research easements.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
61739 TIME 1/8/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Review and further preparation of complaint. Exchange of email with Bob Joyce and David. Conference call with Bob Joyce and David.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Pleading Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
61835 TIME 1/9/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Further preparation of complaint. Telephone conference with Bob Joyce regarding complaint. Meeting with David to discuss same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Pleading Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
61834 TIME 1/10/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Further preparation of complaint. Telephone conference with client regarding complaint. Meeting with David to discuss same. Research related case rules of court. Research LA county superior court rules regarding case assignement. Preparation of notice of related case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Pleading Antelope	4.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1840.00
61850 TIME 1/11/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Telephone conference with Bob Joyce regarding case. Review of file and history of case. Meeting wit David regarding status. Receipt and review of email regarding class certification motion.	h	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
61977 TIME 1/16/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Research background material re: takings claim against water purveyors	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	1350.00
61981 TIME 1/19/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Research re: takings claim against water purveyors	Hal W. Gibson Research ⁄ Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
61986 TIME 1/26/2007 Billed G:26341 2/16/2007 Research takings claim; draft memo	Hal W. Gibson Research ⁄ Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description			User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
61987 1/29/2007 Billed Research takings (Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
61988 1/30/2007 Billed Research takings o			Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
61989 1/31/2007 Billed Research takings (6/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
61990 2/1/2007 Billed Research takings o		1/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
62216 2/2/2007 Billed Research takings o		/1/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	3000.00
62217 2/5/2007 Billed Research takings (/1/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
62218 2/6/2007 Billed Research takings		/1/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
	v of email regarding ground of email with client and disc	lwater	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
62219 2/7/2007 Billed Research takings		/1/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	2550.00
62220 2/8/2007 Billed Research takings		/1/2007	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	1800.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
62481 3/5/2007 Billed	TIME G:26509 4/17/2007 of notices from court and meetings case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
4/12/2007 Billed	TIME G:26524 5/2/2007 ion of other groundwater basins in	Hal W. Gibson Research Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	300.00 T@1	1200.00
4/16/2007 Billed Telephone conferer	TIME G:26524 5/2/2007 nce with Bob Joyce regarding review of pleading and status of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
4/17/2007 Billed	to discuss results of hearing and	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
	TIME G:26666 6/22/2007 vid regarding opposition to and further preparation of orrer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	800.00
	TIME G:26666 6/22/2007 eparation of opposition to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
	G:26912 9/12/2007 nce with Bob regarding discovery to discuss status of case.		1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
63973 8/16/2007 Billed Multiple telephone class case and stat	TIME G:26912 9/12/2007 conferences with Bob regarding us of discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
63972 8/20/2007 Billed Conference with Da	TIME G:26912 9/12/2007 avid regarding hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
63996 8/23/2007 Billed Telephone conferer		Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
	TIME G:27223 11/13/2007 use with David Zlotnick.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	800.00
65545 11/15/2007 Billed Meeting with attorne	TIME G:27302 12/10/2007 ey David Zlotnick to discuss case.		1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
66167 1/15/2008 Billed Meeting with Dave		Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	0.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	360.00
	TIME G:27612 3/13/2008 ts and preparation for hearing on	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2680.00
66580 2/27/2008 Billed Review of cases an BHJ.	TIME G:27612 3/13/2008 and file. Telephone conference with		7.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3160.00
and meeting	G:27612 3/13/2008 conferences with expert with Dave Z to discuss upcoming ertification motion. Review of file.		2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1000.00
call with BHJ and D	G:27612 3/13/2008 t and Dave Z. Conference DZ regarding motion to amend and Reivew of pleadings and file.	•	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
	TIME G:27671 4/8/2008 us conference before Judge th counsel and client. Travel time	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		,	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
66449 3/5/2008 Billed Meeting with Dave Review of documer	Z to discuss certification or	B/2008	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
	oyce to discuss status of canding class certification. Tr	8/2008 ase and	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3400.00
	TIME G:27671 4/8 le and filings. Telephone unsel BHJ and others to dis	8/2008 .	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2760.00
66579 3/10/2008 Billed Meeting with Ralph review memo re Ta	re background of case; rea	8/2008	Watson, David Conference Antelope	1.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	560.00
66625 3/11/2008 Billed Review of file and regarding status.	TIME G:27671 4/6 multiple meetings with cour		Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
	ional issues re prescription pertinent issues; meetings	١,	Watson, David Research Antelope	7.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2590.00
call with	etc. and draft memo; confe	rence f Water	Watson, David Research Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2870.00
	le and meeting with DZ to c ring. Telephone conference	discuss	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
66597 3/13/2008 Billed	TIME G:27671 4/	/8/2008	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	7. 9 0 0.00 0.00	400.00 ⊺@1	3160.00

regarding experts. Fife regarding obje	one conference with Review of recent filing by attorned ections to class definition. Initial and amended complaint.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
66605 3/13/2008 Billed	TIME	Watson, David Research 3 Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3115.00
class certification	TIME G:27671 4/8/200 ections to Purveyors proposed order. Further review of file and ond amended complaint.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 3 Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
66619 3/14/2008 Billed Continue research memo.	TIME G:27671 4/8/200 ling takings, prescription and draf	Watson, David Research 8 Antelope t	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
66673 3/17/2008 Billed Discussion with Recertification issues	alph Kalfayan regarding class	James C. Krause5 Conference 8 Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	480.00 T@1	480.00
66642 3/17/2008 Billed Continue research same.	TIME G:27671 4/8/200 ing takings and drafting memo re	Watson, David Research 8 Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2905.00
certification order. Michael Fife regar	TIME G:27671 4/8/200 of objections to purveyors class Telephone conference with ding status of case. Preparation ting with Dave Z to discuss case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope of	7.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3160.00
	ence with BHJ regarding case. In of Second Amended Complain	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
66667 3/19/2008 Billed	TIME G:27671 4/8/200	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

conference with att Telephone confere order and notice.	on to amend. Telephone orney Fife regarding complaint. nce with attorney Dunn regarding	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
with Jeff Dunn. Ler	TIME G:27671 4/8/2008 ion. Lengthy telephone conference igthy telephone conference with with Dave Z. Further revision of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
66672 3/20/2008 Billed Discussion with Ra certification issues	lph Kalfayan regarding class	James C. Krause5 Conference Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	480.00 T@1	480.00
of emails with Jenr documents. Reviev counsel like lists of	G:27671 4/8/2008 nce with BHJ and Dave. Exchange of the documents from opposing frowners. Telephone conference service of process.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
	TIME G:27671 4/8/2008 conferences with DZ regarding nd review of emails and research	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	7.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3160.00
	TIME G:27671 4/8/2008 v in preparation for hearing. ephonic hearing seeking to amend	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
66901 3/31/2008 Billed Further research a	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 nd review of file.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
Research water ca	TIME G:27738 5/8/2008 n of second amended complaint. uses regarding prescription. I Z to discuss meeting with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
issues. Telephone regarding our mee Dave Z regarding i	TIME G:27738 5/8/2002 eyors at our office to discuss notice e conference with Michael Fife ting with Purveyors. Meeting with notice proposals. Further research with respect to unexercised rights.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference 3 Antelope se	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
	conference with BHJ regarding eyors. Meeting with DZ regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Dendy proposal. I proposal. Multiple	ence with Michael Fife regarding Meeting with Dave Z regarding telephone conferences with expe t Greg James. Further preparati		8.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3480.00
	TIME G:27738 5/8/200 arbara to meet with Greg James. James. Preparation of memo to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope file.	8.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3480.00
66987 4/7/2008 Billed Prescription and C Landowners.	TIME G:27738 5/8/200 Constructive Notice to Dormant	Paul Oudom Research 8 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2800.00
66988 4/8/2008 Billed Prescription and C Landowners.	TIME G:27738 5/8/200 Constructive Notice to Dormant	Paul Oudom Research 8 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2800.00
with Dendy. Review	TIME G:27738 5/8/200 Z regarding upcoming meeting ew of Goleta case. Research y. Review of documents.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
Mediators comme	TIME G:27738 5/8/200 ence with Jeff Dunn regarding nts. Reciept and review of nts and diagrams. Telephone	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description conference with Greg James regarding SAC. Preparation of stipulation. Email to counsel regastipulation. Telephone conference with Jeff Greeregarding legislative proposal. Meeting with Dav	en	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
discuss case. 66989 TIME 4/9/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/2 Prescription and Constructive Notice to Dorman Landowners.	Paul Oudom Research 2008 Antelope t	9.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3150.00
66990 TIME 4/10/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/2 Prescription and Constructive Notice to Dorman Landowners.	Paul Oudom Research 2008 Antelope t	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
66966 TIME 4/10/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/2 Research and review of cases.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2008 Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
67014 TIME 4/11/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/2 Travel to and from Burbank for meeting with me Bill Dendy. Meeting with all parties to case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2008 Antelope diator	11.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4520.00
67015 TIME 4/14/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/ Travel to Bishop to meet with expert Greg James Meeting with Greg James to discuss issues in c Review of cases and book written by Eric Gardre	ase.	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00
67016 TIME 4/15/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/ Meeting with Greg James in Bishop. Travel from Bishop.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2008 Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
67017 TIME 4/16/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/ Meeting with Jeff Dunn and Fred with county co to discuss proposal for settlement. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss terms. Further review of documents from Bill Dendy.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2008 Antelope unsel	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
67018 TIME 4/17/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/ Meeting with Dave Z and telephone conference Greg James regarding terms of settlement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2008 Antelope with	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1800.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
67031 TIME 4/18/2008	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 8 Antelope g	11.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4440.00
67037 TIME 4/21/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/200 Telephone conference with expert Scalmanini. Meeting with DZ regarding proposal. Review of Hig Desert decision. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn. Preparation of water allocation spreadsheet.		8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
67059 TIME 4/22/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/200 Multiple telephone conferences with Jeff Dunn regarding MOU. Review of Zimmer trial proposal. Further preparation of lette to Dendy. Telephone conference with expert Scalmanini. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 98 Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
67077 TIME 4/23/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/200 Further preparation of MOU. Meeting with DZ regarding case. Exchange of emails with Greg James regarding settlement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 08 Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
67079 TIME 4/24/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/200 Exchange of emails with Bill Dendy. Exchange of emails with Greg James. Telephone conference will BHJ regarding MOU. Research case law in preparation for mediation tomorrow.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 08 Antelope th	7.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3040.00
67108 TIME 4/25/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/200 Travel to and from Burbank. Attendance at meeting with all counsel. Telephone conference with Greg James and David Zlotnick regarding status.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 08 Antelope	11.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4640.00
67111 TIME 4/28/2008 Billed G:27738 5/8/200 Meeting with Dave Z to discuss CMC statement. Telephone conference with Norm Hinckley with Antonovich's office regarding mediation. Telephor conference with Jeff Green regarding prescription issues.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 08 Antelope	7.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3040.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
67119 TIM 4/29/2008 Billed G:2 Further preparation of C DZ. Extensive telephone		·	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
Telephone conference	7738 5/8/2008 with expert and review of with Rod Smith. Meeting with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Research file and docu hearing. Meeting with D	7797 6/24/2008 ments in preparation for OZ to discuss case. Internet and order to court	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Receipt and review of d Mutual water company. filings of cmc statement	17797 6/24/2008 discovery on Willis from AV Receipt and review of recent ts. Meeting with DZ regarding desearch book by Eric Garner in the Preparation of notice	·	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
Preparation for trip and	1E 27797 6/24/2008 hearing on CMC in Los ee law in support of motion.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3400.00
Travel time to and from	NE 17797 6/24/2008 I LA. Further research case law paration for CMC hearing.		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Appearance at CMC be	27797 6/24/2008 efore Judge Komar. Meeting g. Meeting with overliers after	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Telephone conference	ME 27797 6/24/2008 with Greg James regarding ceipt and review of discovery	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description from the mutual wa	ter companies.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 of CMC statement. Meeting with tatus of experts. Research case	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1920.00
second amended o	G:27797 6/24/2008 with counsel regarding answer to omplaint. Meeting with counsel on for SJ. Further research cases.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
67368 5/12/2008 Billed Research water law rights and inverse of	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 v issues including appropriative condemnation.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1120.00
67429 5/13/2008 Billed Further research of	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 f cases and filings in court.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
67430 5/14/2008 Billed Further research a	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 nd review of record.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
67425 5/15/2008 Billed Further research a Review of emails.	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 nd preparation of CMC statement.		3.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1440.00
	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 conferences with BHJ and DZ onference statement. Further e.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
67447 5/19/2008 Billed Further preparatior case law. Preparat	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 n of CMC statement. Research ion for hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 of CMC. Review of notice and order n. Review of transcript of May 5		8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00

Companies, for the discovery.

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
file second amende	aration of order regarding leave to ed complaint. Meeting with Dave Z elephone conference with BHJ tement.				
	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 sing on CMC and review of all r to hearing. Travel to Los Angeles	·	9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00
overlying landowne	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 uring on CMC. Meeting wtih ers to discuss strategy. Lunch with use law on prescription.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
67470 5/23/2008 Billed Meeting with Dend San Diego.	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 y group to mediate case. Travel to		9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00
	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 cial interrogatories and request for MWP. Review of prior filed tet.		8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 n of all discovery devices including for documents, special rogs and sions.		8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
status of case. Tel Meeting with Dave preparation of disc	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 ence with Larry Fanning regarding ephone conference with BHJ. Z regarding discovery. Final overy on Purveyors. Preparation overy from Mutual Water		8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
67769 5/29/2008 Billed Drafted Exhibit 1: I	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 List of Overliers and Mutual Water	Ashley Discovery Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
67768 5/29/2008 Billed	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 : List of Cross-Complaining Public or the Discovery.	Ashley Discovery	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
Telephone confere	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 of discovery propounded on MWPs ence with BHJ regarding discovery. Z regarding discovery. Attention to		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Review of docket a conference with M	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 n of discovery against Overliers. and review of expert CV. Telephone ike Mclachlan regarding status. ence with Dave W regarding	•	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
67525 5/30/2008 Billed Travel to and from meeting;	TIME G:27797 6/24/2008 Valencia; attend water conference		11.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3850.00
Conference call w regarding discover	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 n of discovery on overliers. ith Jeff Dunn and Eric Garner ry. Telephone conference with Mike nt on behalf of pumpers.	·	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
67534 6/3/2008 Billed Review email and	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 attachments re June 9 meeting	Watson, David General Antelope	0.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	140.00
conversations with with Mike McClack	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 E Z regarding discovery and Discovery and service of emails Compared to the service of the	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
68131 6/4/2008 Billed Prepared Exhibit	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 I: List of Overliers for discovery.	Ashley Discovery Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
67541 TII 6/4/2008 Billed G: Final Preparation of di Mutual Water Compar	ME 27846 scovery on Overliers and hies. Research delay in tion of response to protective eff Dunn.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
6/4/2008 Billed G:	ME 27846 7/25/2008 st of Mutual Water Companies	Ashley Discovery Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
6/5/2008 Billed G: Further preparation of	ME 27846 7/25/2008 discovery against AVEK and ase law. Review of filings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
6/6/2008 Billed G: Receipt and review of complaint. Research of	ME 27846 Demurer to second amended cases in support of demurrer. eff Dunn and David Z regarding	·	9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00
6/9/2008 Billed G: Research parties and Telephone conference and discovery. Meetin demurrer. Conference	ME 27846 7/25/2008 their pumping of groundwater. with BHJ regarding demurrer g with Dave Z regarding call with Zimmer and Joyce x parte. Telephone conference regarding demurrer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	9.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3640.00
6/10/2008 Billed G: Receipt and review of application to vacate t to discuss same. Resessecond amended comstatus conference rep	rial date. Meeting with counsel earch parties to include in aplaint. Receipt and review of orts from other counsel eparation of response to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00
6/12/2008 Billed G: Preparation for ex par application. Appearan date. Travel to Hunting	ME :27846 te and research cited cases on ce at ex parte to continue trial gton Beach to meet with expert g with Larry Fanning to discuss		9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
opinions at trial. R Fanning.	eview of hydrology report from				
	TIME G:27846 rice with all overliers regarding th case law in support of demurrer complaint.	·	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
67712 6/16/2008 Billed Research inverse entities;	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 condemnation as to quasi-govt	Watson, David Research Antelope	7.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2485.00
condemnation and with overliers rega of responses. Revi	G:27846 7/25/2008 conferences with BHJ regarding discovery. Telephone conference rding discovery. Receipt and review of Fife filing regarding experts. ex parte. Research cases.	W	9.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3640.00
67717 6/17/2008 Billed Continue research takings;	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 ing whether Cal-Water is subject t		8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2870.00
discuss pleadings.	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 parte. Meeting with Dave Z to Review of pleading and research emurrer. Telephone conference imerous overliers.	·	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
	TIME G:27846 7/25/2008 ing and drafting inverse mo; extensive review of case file;	Watson, David Research Antelope	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3290.00
date for Fife. Teler potential experts.	ephonic ex parte to continue exper ohone conference with Willis Receipt and review of om counsel regarding responses t		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value Activity **Dates and Time DNB** Time Rate Info Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status Reference Description Variance 400.00 3920.00 67751 TIME Ralph Kalfayan4 9.80 0.00 6/19/2008 T@1 Case management 0.00 G:27846 7/25/2008 Antelope Billed Meeting in Burbank with all overliers. Travel to and 0.00 from Burbank. TIME Watson, David 8.50 350.00 2975.00 67728 6/19/2008 Research 0.00 T@1 G:27846 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Billed Research and draft memo re inverse condemnation; 0.00 review case file; draft designation of expert Larry Fanning, declaration and notice of availablity; research re hydrology expert; TIME Ralph Kalfayan4 9.20 400.00 3680.00 67752 6/20/2008 Case management 0.00 T@1 Billed G:27846 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Exchange of email with Mike Mclachlan regarding 0.00 experts. Receipt and review of report from Scalmanini. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding discovery. TIME Watson, David 9.60 350.00 3360.00 67758 6/20/2008 General 0.00 T@1 G:27846 Billed 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Research re ex parte application; prepare expert 0.00 report; review technical committee report; meeting with Ralph re ex parte application and expert designation; 67756 TIME Watson, David 3.50 350.00 1225.00 6/21/2008 General 0.00 T@1 G:27846 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Billed Review expert report re Antelope Valley technical 0.00 committee; 0.60 350.00 67757 TIME Watson, David 210.00 0.00 6/22/2008 E-mail T@1 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Billed G:27846 Phone call and review of emails with Ralph re ex 0.00 parte application for relief of expert disclosure deadline; TIME Ralph Kalfayan4 9.20 400.00 3680.00 67764 0.00 Case management 6/23/2008 T@1 G:27846 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Billed Conference call with all overliers, final preparation of 0.00 ex parte to continue expert designation date, reveiw of report from Scalmanini. 350.00 3290.00 67761 TIME Watson, David 9.40 0.00 6/23/2008 General T@1 7/25/2008 Antelope 0.00 Billed G:27846 review P&A as to motion to Strike Prescription; review 0.00 expert report; draft portions of exparte application for relief from expert deadline; research re notice;

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description meeting with Ralph re expert repo		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
67755 TIME 6/24/2008 Billed G:27846 Preparation of ex parte papers in class request to extend expert dec		Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00
67766 TIME 6/24/2008 Billed G:27846 Review law review articles re Pas review Scalminini report; meeting opposition to demurrer;		Watson, David General Antelope	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2730.00
67790 TIME 6/25/2008 Billed G:27846 Appearance at ex parte application designation date. Conference call Conference call with City of Lanca regarding dismissal. Meeting with	l with all purveyros. aster counsel	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
67795 TIME 6/26/2008 Billed G:27846 Begin researching in preparation opposition to demurrer; read and		Watson, David Pleading Antelope	7.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2590.00
67822 TIME 6/26/2008 Billed G:27846 Review of report from Scalmanini meeting. Meeting with Dave Z to		Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
67806 TIME 6/27/2008 Billed G:27846 Research for and draft opposition demurrer;	7/25/2008 i to Palmdale's	Watson, David Pleading Antelope	9.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3325.00
67823 TIME 6/27/2008 Billed G:27846 Meeting with Jeff Dunn and Joe S discuss expert report. Preparation Meet and confer with Jeff Dunn re	n of memo to file.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
67824 TIME 6/30/2008 Billed G:27846 Telephone conference with overlicorrespondence to Jeff Dunn reg Telephone conference with various regarding discovery. Meeting wit opposition to demurrer.	arding discovery. us landowners	·	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:27846 7/25/20 opposition to demurrer; meeting iss issues in demurrer and	Watson, David Pleading 08 Antelope	9.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3325.00
Review file re corre research re potent	n re trial preparation timeline; espondence with Mike Davis; ial dismissal of three defendant treatises re water law and	Watson, David Case management 08 Antelope s;	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
regarding discover 2 and 3 of municip	respondence to City of LA y. Preparation of discovery on al water purveyors. Telephone ike Crow from state of california		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
Research condem	TIME G:27914 8/13/20 n of opposition to demurrer. nation authorities. Telephone arious landowners. Preparation	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 108 Antelope	9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00
67846 7/2/2008 Billed Continue research demurrer;	TIME G:27914 8/13/20 ing and preparing Opposition to	Watson, David Research 108 Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2905.00
Telephone conference Telephone	TIME G:27914 8/13/20 n of opposition to demurrer. ence with Ryan Bezera and clie ence with DOJ. Telephone orthrup Grumman re discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 108 Antelope nts.	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
67853 7/5/2008 Billed Further preparatio Research case lav	n of opposition to demurrer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing 008 Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
67848 7/7/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/20	Watson, David Case management 008 Antelope	7.20 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2520.00

		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	urrer; Continue researching for				
discovery and MOU	G:27914 8/13/2008 nce with Lee Lieniniger regarding J. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss Its of research. Further	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
Respond to phone discovery. Exchange	TIME G:27914 of opposition to demurrer. calls from overlyers regarding ge of email with Jeff Dunn. th co-counsel for overliers.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
67924 7/8/2008 Billed Draft opposition to	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 demurrer and research;	Watson, David Pleading Antelope	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1925.00
Jeff Dunn regardin condemnation and Dave Z to discuss Goldsmith regardir	G:27914 8/13/2008 nce with Stephanie Headland and g discovery. Research statute of limitations. Meeting with case. Exchange of email with Jane ng dismissal. Telephone HJ regarding discovery.	1	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 th all water purveyros regarding one conference with BHJ regardings.	•	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 ing for opposition to demurrer and; meeting with Ralph re same;	Watson, David Pleading Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2870.00
purveyors. Exchan overliers regarding	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 covery on all municipal water ge of email with counsel for CMC statement. Preparation of ng. Research cases in support of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	9.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3800.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description statute of limitations	S.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:27914 8/13/20 ng and drafting re opposition; h to discuss opposition;	Watson, David Pleading 08 Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
67927 7/12/2008 Billed Continue researchi cases and treatises	G:27914 8/13/20 ng for opposition read and rev	Watson, David 08 Pleading 08 Antelope iew	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1925.00
67928 7/13/2008 Billed Phone calls and en demurrer; review ca	G:27914 8/13/20 nails with Ralph re opposition t	Watson, David 108 Case management 108 Antelope 0	1.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	595.00
Meeting with Dave	TIME G:27914 8/13/20 ic designer to prepare blow up Z to discuss opposition to of responses to discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 108 Antelope s.	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00
	n and graphic designer re blow n re exhibits and blow-ups; con		9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3290.00
68015 7/15/2008 Billed Continue reading of demurrer;	TIME G:27914 8/13/20 case law and drafting opposition	Watson, David Pleading 008 Antelope n to	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2730.00
68114 7/15/2008 Billed Further preparation Review of discover	n of opposition to demurrer to S	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing 008 Antelope SAC.	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
	TIME G:27914 8/13/2 raft of opposition to demurrer; with Ralph re opposition to	Watson, David Pleading 008 Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3115.00

all cases.

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68115 7/16/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 of opposition to demurrer. uthorities.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
7/17/2008 Billed Review discovery; d written discovery res	G:27914 8/13/2008 raft summary spreadsheet of all sponses; phone calls and emails rer and other issues;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3290.00
7/17/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 of opposition to demurrer. aw cases.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
7/18/2008 Billed Review discovery; d written discovery res	G:27914 8/13/2008 lraft summary spreadsheet of all sponses; phone calls and emails rrer and other issues;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	9.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3325.00
7/18/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 of opposition to demurrer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
7/19/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 ummary of Defendant purveyors sponses;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1925.00
7/20/2008 Billed	ft of opposiiton to demurrer;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	3.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1330.00
7/21/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 discovery responses and drafting eets;	•	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3290.00
7/21/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 of opposition brief and outline of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68111 7/22/2008 Billed	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 Burbank; attend Settlement	Watson, David Conference Antelope	12.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	4200.00
68120 7/22/2008 Billed Further research o opposition to demo	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 f all cases in preparation for urrer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
68138 7/23/2008 Billed Continue reviewing spreadsheets;	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 g discovery and drafting	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
68121 7/23/2008 Billed Further review of a opposition to demo	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 all cases in preparation for urrer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
discovery. Review of responses to dis	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 ence with Tom Bunn regarding of pleadings filed in court. Review scovery. Further preparation of elephone conference with Bob		9.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3920.00
and drafting discov	TIME G:27914 8/13/2008 g purveyor discovery responses very spreadsheet; review Ralph's sition to demurrer and revise;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2870.00
	g discovery and drafting ting with ralph re same and	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1575.00
68136 7/26/2008 Billed Edit opposition to		Watson, David Pleading Antelope	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	525.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68137 TIME 7/27/2008	Watson, David Pleading 008 Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1575.00
68140 TIME 7/28/2008 Billed G:27914 8/13/20 Continue revising demurrer; continue reviewing discovery and drafting spreadsheet; phone calls v Ralph re cases status and other issues; draft judic notice and prepare exhibits; draft declaration.		8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
68141 TIME 7/29/2008 Billed G:27914 8/13/20 Final draft opposition to demurrer; continue review discovery and drafting spreadsheet; phone calls a emails with John Tootle re doc production.		8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3115.00
68151 TIME 7/30/2008 Billed G:27914 8/13/20 Continue preparing discovery spreadsheet;	Watson, David Discovery 008 Antelope	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2730.00
68182 TIME 7/31/2008 Billed G:27914 8/13/20 Review and organize Documents Produced by the State of California.	Ashley Discovery 2008 Antelope e	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	187.50
68152 TIME 7/31/2008 Billed G:27914 8/13/20 Continue reviewing discovery responses and draf spreadsheet; calls with Ralph re discovery progremeeting with Ashely re overlier discovery spreads	ess;	7.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2765.00
68183 TIME 8/1/2008 Billed G:27998 9/22/20 Review and organize documents from the Department of Justice.	Ashley Discovery 008 Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
68153 TIME 8/1/2008 Billed G:27998 9/22/20 Meetings with Ralph re discovery and other case issues; continue reviewing purveyor discovery responses and drafting spreadsheet.	Watson, David Discovery 008 Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
68170 TIME 8/1/2008 Billed G:27998 9/22/2 Research cases in support of demurrer and motion	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 008 Antelope on to	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3400.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	covery responses. Preparation of	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
motion to compel.	overy respections in repair attention of				
68156 8/2/2008 Billed Revisions to disco	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 very spreadsheet;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	875.00
68184 8/4/2008 Billed Create chart listing each purveyor.	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 g all the documents produced by	Ashley General Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
water extraction fil Water codes 4999 extractions; review opposition to motion James' suggestion re reply to opposition	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 m Dave Z. re motion to strike and ings with the state; research re 2-5108; research notice of and revise Dave Z's reply to on to strike; incorporate Greg as into reply; conference with Ralphion to strike; review East Kern rief; read and review replies to on;		8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3115.00
Fife statement. Ex	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 ence with all landowners. Review o change of email with counsel. ry responses. Preparation for mee	f	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00
	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 and review of reply brief and all paration for hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
68185 8/5/2008 Billed Continued to work by purveyors.	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 on chart of documents produced	Ashley General Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 's supplemental interrogatory ediscovery spreadsheet; meetings 11 hearing;	•	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68186 8/6/2008 Billed Memo to file Re: Di	scovery disc from Stephanie Organized new discovery	Ashley General 3 Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
conference with W	TIME G:27998 9/22/200 preparation for cmc. Telephone ayne Lemiuex regarding discove aring. Telephone conference with		9.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3920.00
Tom Bunn regardir preparation for hea Greg James regard	confer with Jeff Dunn and with ng discovery. Further review in Iring. Telephone conference with ding hearing. Telephone urt clerk regarding discovery	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 3 Antelope	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
68246 8/7/2008 Billed Continue revising s Cal-Water quit clai	special rog spreadshet; review	Watson, David General 8 Antelope	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1225.00
to strike. Preparation	TIME G:27998 9/22/200 pearance on demurrer and motion for hearing on discovery. Traileting with Bob Joyce to discuss		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
for met and confer spreadsheet for fili	TIME G:27998 mails with Ralph re filing of reque with court; draft filing; prepare fir ng; emails with Rowena of Judge ling and the discovery spreadshe	nal	1.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	665.00
	TIME G:27998 9/22/200 n for hearing on demurrer. Meeting the Marriott to discuss hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance 8 Antelope ng	7.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3160.00
68316 8/11/2008 Billed	TIME G:27998 9/22/200	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance 8 Antelope	7.70 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3080.00

8/18/2008

of emails with co-counsel.

TIME

G:27998

Telephone conference with counsel for Tejon Ranch

regarding trial. Review of pleadings filed. Exchange

9:08 AM		Slip Listing			Page 28
and discovery. Me	urt re demurrer, motion to strike, eeting with all counsel for and after the hearing. Travel from	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68347 8/13/2008 Billed Review 8-11-08 tra docket and recent	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 anscript of proceedings; review fillings;	Watson, David General Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1015.00
definitions. Exchar regarding hearing Review of transcri	TIME G:27998 ge of emails regarding class and various settlement proposals. of from hearing. Preparation of ding settlement proposals.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
	TIME G:27998 y of filings from all landowners and trial and discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
regarding discover	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 respondence to John Tootle ry. Review of notice and filing of expert designations.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1920.00
with Tootle and dra notes from meet a	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 and notes re Aug 5 conversation aft meet and confer letter; review nd confer with Tom Bunn and Jeff ng meet and confer letters to Bunn	·	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2380.00
Bunn and Dunn; c	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 If of meet and confer letters to onference call with Tejon Ranch sith Lemieux re meet and confer;	Watson, David General Antelope	3.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1295.00

Ralph Kalfayan4

9/22/2008 Antelope

Case management

3.20

0.00

0.00

0.00

400.00

T@1

1280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
respond to emails call with Tejon Ra	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 m Greg James, Dave Z. and Ralph; ; research Code 1021; conference nch re discovery; meetings with y; review of discovery filings;		3.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1260.00
condemnation. Ex regarding discove	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 ence with Tejon Ranch regarding change of emails with co-counsel ry and settlement. Telephone HJ. Review of discovery. Review of	·	6.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2560.00
Desert and Deser database; update ArcGIS software;	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 produced by North Edwards and t Lake; review recent filings in discovery spreadsheets; research call to Stefanie Hedlund re Arc discovery issues re document	Watson, David Case management Antelope	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2380.00
regarding discove	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 Telephone conference with BHJ ry. Review and research list of Review and further preparation of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1840.00
68435 8/21/2008 Billed Review of filings a	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 and review of documents.	Ralph Kalfayan4 General Antelope	6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2400.00
with Wayne Lemid with same; draft n research list of cla	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 h in preparation for meet and conferency; telephonic meet and conference and confer letter re same; ass members; phone call with and organization of collecting r possession;		5.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2065.00
	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 eeting with David Zlotnick to discusone conference with BHJ. Review of	s	6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2400.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 re discovery issues and plan to e documents for litigation;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	0.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	245.00
68466 8/25/2008 Billed Meeting with consu	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 and review of filings		4.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1640.00
Cal-Water, etc; em emails to Joyce an review email and le expert database; a review recent filing Joyce re doc produ	G:27998 9/22/2008 o organize discovery trip to rails with Tootle re doc production; d Zimmer re doc production; etter from Hedlund re access to ccess online expert database; s in docket; phone call with Bobuction Cal-Water; phone calls with ord Brown re discovery;	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	5.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1785.00
discovery; review of City of Palmdale's	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 y meeting with Bolthouse; emails r docket for filings; Read and review objection to Willis' proposed order l against City of Lancaster;	e	7.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2520.00
	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 v of Ritter Ranch docs; emails with e; email to Tom Bunn re document		3.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1085.00
	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 ints produced by Landowners. Is with landowner counsel regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
meeting with Ralpl filings; review Ritte	TIME G:27998 9/22/2008 ootle re confidentiality agreement; n re same; review docket and er ranch docs; call to Manage Ma		5.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T @ 1	1785.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68484 TIME 8/29/2008 Billed G:27998 9/22/2008 Review of memo from DW. Telephone conference regarding Cal Water production. Meeting with Dave 2 to discuss case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1800.00
68477 TIME 8/29/2008 9/2/2008 Billed G:27998 9/22/2008 Travel to and from Torrance to review Docs from Cal-Water; Draft memo re same; meeting with Ralph to discuss	·	11.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	4130.00
68488 TIME 9/2/2008 Billed G:28984 1/4/2010 Receipt and review of orders from court and pleadings filed by parties. Preparation of cost memo to landowners. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss email from Dendy. Review of documents produced by purveyors and letter to John Tootle. Telephone conference with Doug Stacy regarding document production. Receipt and review of letters from landowners.		6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
9/2/2008 Billed G:28984 1/4/2010 Draft letter confirming substance of conversation at 8-29-08 meeting; review docket for Tom Bunn letter re discovery production; email to Mark Smith re 8-29 Cal-Water meeting; meeting with ralph re status of document responses and Komar's order re demurrer emails with Keith Lemieux re discovery production; emails with Tom Bunn re discovery production; revied Judge Komar's order re demurrer; review docket for City of Lancaster discovery responses to Diamond Farming, etc.; draft motion for summary adjudication against City of Lancaster; review letter from Keith Lemieux re document production from his clients;	r; w	9.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3430.00
9/3/2008 Billed G:28984 1/4/2010 Multiple telephone conversations with landowners. Preparation of emails and spreadsheet regarding copying and transcripts costs. Meeting with Dave Z and Dave W to discuss discovery and settlement. Preparation of correspondence to Lemieux regarding discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2600.00
68490 TIME 9/3/2008 Billed G:28984 1/4/2010 Prep email re assessment of costs for discovery;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
motion for judgme Keith Lemieux re of drafting motion for	idsheet; Email to Donna Luis re int on the pleadings; Draft letter to document production; continue r summary judgment; call to re document production; review ings;				
68733 9/4/2008 Billed Review case filing	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 s. Review of documents produced	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2720.00
by purveyors. Mee					
68501 9/4/2008 Billed Message from Ste continue drafting I	efanie Hedlund re doc production;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2835.00
Evertz, counsel for Ralph re MSA; me Lancaster's pump extraction records Groundwater Rec	G:28984 1/4/2010 MSAdjudication; Draft letter to or City of Lancaster; meeting with eeting with Dave Z. re City of lancaster s; read City of Lancaster sharge Feasibility Study from May of Lancaster's discovery response:	Watson, David Case management Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
scheduling of exp conference with B	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 e call with all purveyors regarding ert witnesses. Telephone 3HJ regarding call. Review of current LA county water works.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
	TIME G:28984 ngs filed and conference call with ntion to CT summation and loading	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
68573 9/9/2008 Billed Meeting with Dave	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 e W and review of pleadings filed.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 Telephone conference with counse rners. Conference call with Greg	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
	3				

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description James and David Z	Z. Preparation of settlement	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
issues; emails with meet and confer to meet and confer le production; draft le	re discovery production and othe Mark Smith re Cal-Water docs; Tom Bunn re doc produciton; tter to Keith Lemieux re doc tter to Evertz re summary and review City of Palmdale	Watson, David Case management Antelope r	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	840.00
	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 cca Willis in Los Angeles. Review nd preparation for deposition.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1640.00
68681 9/15/2008 Billed Review emails from extractions;	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 n Dave Z and Ralph re notice of	Watson, David Case management Antelope	0.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	70.00
68704 9/16/2008 Billed Review emails from	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 n David Z re extractions;	Watson, David General Antelope	0.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	105.00
	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 Z to discuss case. Exchange of . Review of documents produced	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	5.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2360.00
68735 9/17/2008 Billed Review of pleading by purveyors.	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 gs filed. Review of documents filed	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	.400.00 T@1	2480.00
68714 9/17/2008 Billed Review docket for		Watson, David Case management Antelope	0.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	35.00
	TIME G:28984 1/4/2010 Z to discuss case. Review of eview of documents.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
continue Sheep Cr	G:28984 1/4/2 call regarding ex parte motion to eek phase 2 request. Review review of documents from		5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2200.00
68738 9/19/2008 Billed Search and review	TIME G:28984 1/4/2 docs re notice of extraction;	Watson, David Discovery 010 Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	175.00
68789 9/22/2008 Billed Preparation for dep deposition of Uttley	position. Travel to Sacramento	Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition 010 Antelope for	10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4000.00
68756 9/22/2008 Billed Read and review le	TIME G:28984 1/4/2 etter from Tom Bunn re discov	Watson, David Case management 010 Antelope ery;	0.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	35.00
68790 9/23/2008 Billed Apperance at depo counsel post depo	sition of Uttley. Meeting with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition 010 Antelope	9.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3800.00
68758 9/23/2008 Billed Phone call with Mil Bank TR who was	ke Stiles, counsel for City Natio	Watson, David Case management 010 Antelope onal	0.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	140.00
68791 9/24/2008 Billed Appearance at dep back to San Diego	position of Scalmanini and trav	Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition 010 Antelope el	10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4000.00
68792 9/25/2008 Billed Appearance at dep		Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition 010 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68817 9/26/2008 Billed Appearance at dep		Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition 010 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68818 TIME 9/28/2008 Billed G:28984 Travel to Sacramento for deposit expert report in preparation for de	1/4/2010 ions. Review of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68819 TIME 9/29/2008 Billed G:28984 Appearance at deposition of Duri BHJ post deposition.	1/4/2010 bin. Meeting with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition Antelope	10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4000.00
68820 TIME 9/30/2008 Billed G:28984 Appearance at deposition of Lam from Sacramento.	1/4/2010 abie. Travel back	Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition Antelope	12.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4800.00
68811 TIME 9/30/2008 Billed G:28984 Emails with Lemieux re doument		Watson, David E-mail Antelope	0.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	70.00
68821 TIME 10/1/2008 Billed G:28180 Preparation of response to Fife a trial continuance. Review of plea Review of deposition transcripts.		Ralph Kalfayan4 Deposition Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68816 TIME 10/1/2008 Billed G:28984 Meeting with Ralph re Phase 2 c		Watson, David Case management Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	175.00
68838 TIME 10/2/2008 Billed G:28180 Review of filings before trial. Mer	12/1/2008 eting with Dave Z and		8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3400.00
68839 TIME 10/3/2008 Billed G:28180 Review of filings. Telephone con BHJ, and McClachalan regarding Dave Z regarding case and filing Telephone conference with Fred	g case. Meeting with regarding trial.	•	9.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3640.00
68973 TIME 10/6/2008 Billed G:28180 Appearance at trial and travel to	12/1/2008 LA.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Trial Antelope	10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4000.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
68974 10/7/2008 Billed Appearance at trial		Ralph Kalfayan4 Trial 008 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68975 10/8/2008 Billed Appearance at trial		Ralph Kalfayan4 Trial 008 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68976 10/9/2008 Billed Appearance at tria		Ralph Kalfayan4 Trial 008 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68977 10/10/2008 Billed Review of transcrip	TIME G:28180 12/1/2 ots and meeting with Dave Z.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Trial 008 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
68996 10/15/2008 Billed Review document	TIME G:28180 12/1/2 production from purveyors;	Watson, David Discovery 008 Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
	TIME G:28180 12/1/2 of pleadings. Meeting with D f case. Email to Mike regardin		2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	800.00
69061 10/22/2008 Billed Meeting with Ralph	TIME G:28180 12/1/2 n re case strategies;	Watson, David Conference 008 Antelope	0.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	. 350.00 T@1	210.00
69005 10/22/2008 Billed Receipt and review		Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 008 Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
	parte to continue trial date. Re Telephone conference with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Teleconference 2008 Antelope view	5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
69051 10/24/2008 Billed Review of pleading	TIME G:28180 12/1/2 gs filed and documents produc	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery 2008 Antelope ced.	5.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2040.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
69074 10/27/2008 Billed Travel to Pasadena Tom Sheehan.	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 a. Appearance at deposition of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	11.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4400.00
69075 10/28/2008 Billed Appearance at dep of documents and	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 position of Tom Sheehan. Review fillings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
69246 10/29/2008 Billed Review of docume notice.	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 nts and preparation of Rule 3.766	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
69247 10/30/2008 Billed Review of transcrip	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 ots from trial.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
69089 10/30/2008 Billed Review document	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 produced by defendants;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2380.00
69113 10/31/2008 Billed Review docs produ	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 uced by water purveyors;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2100.00
69248 10/31/2008 Billed Review of docume	TIME G:28180 12/1/2008 nts.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
memo to the file re	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 al and travel to LA. Preparation of garding witnesses and judge's ench. Travel from LA to San Diego	·	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
69135 11/4/2008 Billed Review purveyor c	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 locs produced to Diamond Farming		5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1925.00
Review of hydrolog	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 Z to discuss trial and notice plan. gy book. Review of filed pleadings of for dissemination of notice.	·	6.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2400.00

38

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Further review and	preparation of notice.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
with Meeting with Dave Review of filings. F	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 tion issues. Telephone conference who is an expert in water districts. It to discuss status of case. Preparation of request for on comments from	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
69270 11/6/2008 Billed Review discovery defendants;	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 documents produced by	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1925.00
Meeting with Dave	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 Is with counsel for landowners. E Z to discuss status of case. documents produced by Little Rock	•	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
notice. Telephone	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 on of Rule 3.766 statement for class acconference with landonwer's ange of emails. Review of ced by US.	•	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
Ralph and Bob Jo	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 h re discovery; conference call with tyce re discovery and case strategy used by defendants for notices of	1	6.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2345.00
69395 11/10/2008 Billed Review document	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 s produced by purveyors;	Watson, David Discovery Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
notice. Exchange case. Preparation Review of expert	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ence with Bob Kuhs regarding clas of email with all counsel regarding for meeting of all landowners. reports and websites. Meeting with document production.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope s	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
69420 11/11/2008 Billed Review of docume	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 nt discovery. Exchange of email ew other websites in preparation of site.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
69309 11/12/2008 Billed Research re backg Review Phase 2 or	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 prounds of expert witnesses; rder;	Watson, David Research Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1575.00
defendants. Resea	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 locuments produced by all arch expert and attorney fees ne conference with Bob Joyce y.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	7.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3160.00
	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 C statement. Preparation of . Research jury trial. Preparation on to jury trial.	·	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
Preparation of mot witness fee. Telep experts to discuss	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 and expert witness fees. tion in support of order for expert hone conference with various retention. Exchange of emails with with Dave Z to discuss case.	·	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
class notice. Rece	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ence with Mike Mchlaclan regarding ipt of email from counsel regarding nange of email with all counsel.		8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
69346 11/17/2008 Billed Review purveyor c		Watson, David Discovery Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1400.00
research of notice cmc statement. Ex	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 of attorney fees and costs. Further to class. Further preparation of exchange of email with counsel and e Z to discuss status of case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Research Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00

40

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
conversations with discovery on the w	ve order. Multiple telephone Goltrans regarding document vebsite and preparation of ocument protocol. Review of all	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 009 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
69477 11/19/2008 Billed Review documents case management	s produced by suppliers; review	Watson, David Case management 2009 Antelope	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1225.00
69478 11/20/2008 Billed Continue research witness appointme	ing and drafting motion for exp	Watson, David Pleading 009 Antelope ert	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
of pleadings filed. document product	TIME G:28380 4/14/20 w of email from Doug Evertz, re Meeting with Elaine to discuss ion. Exchange of emails with tion of CMC statement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 009 Antelope view	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
	r for document discovery protoc ew document production; resea		8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2870.00
Meeting with Dave Preparation of pur preparation of CM	e conference with all landowner 2 To discuss status of case. nping interrogatory. Final C statement. Review of all rece ents. Preparation of document		8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 lagement Statements; review V VW class notice; continue draft		6.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2275.00
69409 11/24/2008 Billed	TIME G:28380 4/14/2	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 009 Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00

regarding case. Tele Kush regarding case regarding case. Rev Preparation of reply o	ce with expert Tom Harter phone conference with Robert . Telephone conference with RZ iew of pleadings filed. cmc statement. Multiple meetings g case. Preparation of memo to	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
11/25/2008 Billed C	TIME 6:28380 4/14/2009 e; continue researching and cpert costs;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2450.00
11/25/2008 Billed Appearance at hearing counsel thereafter to	FIME 6:28380 4/14/2009 ng on CMC and meeting with discuss case. Travel to and fron th Dave Z post appearance to of order.	•	7.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3040.00
11/26/2008 Billed C Telephone conference regarding scope of sometice, order after he publication notice. Notice same. Telephone co	G:28380 4/14/2009 be with expert Thomas Harter ervices. Further preparation of earing on November 25, and Meeting with Dave Z to discuss inference with Jeff Dunn etc. Preparation of memo to file.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
11/26/2008 Billed Phone calls and ema	G:28380 4/14/2009 ails with 3rd party administrators y; research re expert;	Watson, David Case management Antelope	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	980.00
12/1/2008 Billed (FIME G:28380 4/14/2009 otion for expert appointment;	Watson, David Pleading Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2800.00
12/1/2008 Billed Conference Dunn regarding notice disseminate notice. I opposing counsel Je order for disseminati preparation of order Further preparation of newspaper. Telepho Garden City to get experience of the service of the se	G:28380 4/14/2009 ce with opposing counsel Jeff ce to class and order to Exchange of emails with eff Dunn regarding proposed ion of class notice. Further for dissemination of class notice of summary notice to publish in one conference with Jennifer from exemplar website and cost change of address through US		8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description post office.		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
69475 TIME 12/2/2008 Billed G:28380 Travel to Riverside to meet w Company. Meeting with Jeff Headland, Eric Garner, Dan F discuss notice to dormant cla same. Telephone conference regarding expert work. Meetir discuss notice. Telephone co landowners regarding notice. file regarding meeting.	Dunn, Stefanie Roberts, Tim Haynes to ss and dissemination of with Thomas Harter ng with Dave Z to nference with		9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00
69611 TIME 12/3/2008 Billed G:28380 Research and review of quali Thomas Harter and other exp Research their articles. Revie propounded by other landown	perts like John Cherry. ew of discovery	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2560.00
69481 TIME 12/3/2008 Billed G:28380 Continue drafting motion for relevant cases and statutes; of CA 1021.5 interpretation;		•	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2800.00
69557 TIME 12/4/2008 Billed G:28380 Research and preparation of experts. Exchange of email waregarding class notice and did exchange of emails with Mike expert witnesses such as hydrocommists for the case. Presegreement for expert Thomas Review of resumes of expert Parker. Telephone conference regarding responses to discommemo to the file regarding himself.	with Stefanie Hedland ssemination of same. e Mclachlan regarding drologists and water eparation of retainer is Harter of UC Davis. John Cherry and Beth the with Keith Lemieux every. Preparation of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
69496 TIME 12/4/2008 Billed G:28380 Research experts John Cher Beth Louise Parker;	4/14/2009 ry, Thomas Harter, and	Watson, David Research Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1575.00
69558 TIME 12/5/2008 Billed G:28380 Exchange of emails with Jeff notice. Telephone conference		Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description regarding publication of notice. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn and his partner to discuss issues regarding publication and 800 number. Review of quote from AV press. Lengthy telephone conference with Keith Lemieux regarding discovery. Preparation of memo to the file. Research recovery of costs for experts.	User Activity Client <u>Reference</u> e	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
12/8/2008 Billed G:28380 4/14/2009 Telephone conference with Jennifer Keough regarding 800 number and class notice response forms. Telephone conference with Mike Mclachlan regarding notice to class and expert work from Thomas Harter. Further preparation of proposed order regarding dissemination of notice. Telephone conference with landowners. Review of declarations in preparation for meeting with William Leever, experfor PWS's. Meeting with Dave Zlotnick to discuss notice and upcoming case management conference.	t	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
69609 TIME 12/9/2008 Billed G:28380 4/14/2009 Travel to Irvine to meet with Jeff Dunn and expert William Leever. Meeting with William Leever and Jef Dunn to review and discuss ascertainability of class members, assessor information, and shape files from CAISL. Preparation of memo to the file regarding meeting. Preparation of correspondence to Jeff Dunr confirming documents to recover from Leever.	ff	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
69608 TIME 12/10/2008 Billed G:28380 4/14/2009 Telephone conference with counsel Zimmer, Kuhs, and Joyce regarding class notice. Receipt and review of objections to dissemination of class notice from Jeff Dunn. Further preparation of reply to objections Preparation of correspondence to Jeff Dunn regarding maps of AVAA and related documents relative to the class.	N	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
69616 TIME 12/11/2008 Billed G:28380 4/14/2009 Review discovery from other parties in preparation of building master list for presentation to court;	•	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	350.00
69615 TIME 12/11/2008 Billed G:28380 4/14/2009 Telephone conference with Rod Smith regarding scope of work. Telephone conference with Patrick regarding hosting document production. Preparation	·	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00

Krause, Kalfayan, Benink & Slavens LLP

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description of master set of interrogatories for patter	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
69624 TIME 12/12/2008 Billed G:28380 Travel to and from Ontario to meet with veconomist Rod Smith. Meeting with Rod discuss value of claim for prescription, d scope of work, and background of case. of frequently asked questions for class a	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference 4/14/2009 Antelope water Smith to esignation, Preparation	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
69632 TIME 12/15/2008 Billed G:28380 Receipt and review of email from court r conference. Exchange of email with cou regarding conference. Telephone confer Tom Bunn regarding discovery. Telepho conference with Brad Weeks regarding r eponses to discovery. Telephone confe Bob Joyce regarding discovery. Prepara to all counsel.	nsel rence with ne supplemental rence with	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
70886 TIME 12/16/2008 Billed G:28380 Telephone conference with Patrick Justa regarding document repository and use summation. Telephone conference with regarding experts and efficient crop produce Telephone conference with opposing concept Dunn and Mike O'Connor regarding new publication. Meeting with David to discuss and prepared for conference call. Meeting Crisp to discuss CT summation. Appear telephonically regarding use of paralegation free number. Exchange of emails with counsel Dan Roberts regarding notice. Conference with client regarding status of Exchange of emails with experts and respective summation.	of BHJ duction. unsel Jeff vspaper ss class list ng with Sherry ance al to answer th opposing Felephone of case.	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
69679 TIME 12/17/2008 Billed G:28380 Review and organize discovery from Bo Diamond Farming;	Watson, David Discovery 4/14/2009 Antelope Ithouse and	7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2450.00
70887 TIME 12/17/2008 Billed G:28380 Multiple telephone conferences with BH legal standard for prescription, condemi and setting up discovery conference cal email to Jeff Dunn regarding discovery in discovery and Leever documents. Multip	nation claim I. Multiple regarding	7.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2840.00

Keough regarding Telephone confere notice to pumping	Sherry Crisp, John Allen, Jennifer notice and document production. ence with Mike Mclachlan regarding class. Research and preparation c	f	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
filings. 78391 12/17/2008	d review of prior orders and recent	Ashley General	1.50 0.00	125.00 T@1	187.50
WIP Organize hearing t summation.	ranscripts and load them into	Antelope	0.00 0.00		
	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ft discovery proposal and order; and Diamond Farming Discovery; es;	Watson, David General Antelope	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
conferences with v groundwater econ- of various experts. Weeks regarding p conference with Je	G:28380 4/14/2009 ft discovery order. Telephone various experts in search for omist and hydrologist and interview. Telephone conference with Brad pumping information. Telephone eff Dunn regarding document parating Wood class members fromers.	v	3.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1520.00
	o on computer. Further research xpert witnesses. Preparation for	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2000.00
69678 12/22/2008 Billed Draft discovery pro		Watson, David General Antelope	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1925.00
70890 12/23/2008 Billed Landowner confer	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 rence and conference with PWS.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
telephone confere status of notice. E	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ence with landowners. Multiple ences with Jeff Dunn regarding mail to Mike Mclachlan regarding st. Meeting with Dave to discuss	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1600.00

	William Leever. Research right to	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
required to compile	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ence with Dan Roberts regarding IT e class list and process response setting up toll free number and		2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
regarding right to j	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ner preparation of legal brief ury trial. Preparation of points and utted authority in case map.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
trial. Further resea briefs filed by City public water suppli Bob H Joyce regar public water suppli	G:28380 4/14/2009 of brief in support of right to jury rch of case authority. Review of of Los Angeles, Phelan, and all iers. Telephone conference with rding case authorities cited by iers. Meeting with Dave Zlotnick to agement conference issues.		8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
78392 1/5/2009 WIP Work on the script	TIME for the interactive voice recording	Ashley General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
conference with Bodiscovery in case. layout of website. Valley County water	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 egarding hearing. Telephone bb Kuhs regarding Phelan and Email opposing counsel regarding Telephone conference with West er district regarding their location in nd review of recent fillings.	· !	3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1360.00
	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 w of all recent filings. Research arding right to jury trial.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1240.00
	w of documents and discovery opa De Oro. Review of Interactive	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00

voice mails.

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70895 TIME 1/7/2009	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference 009 Antelope	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2720.00
70896 TIME 1/8/2009 Billed G:28380 4/14/2 Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding model discovery. Telephone conference with Rick Zimmer regarding model discovery. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding right to jury trial a model discovery. Research and preparation of m for summary judgment.	nd	4.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1640.00
78393 TIME 1/8/2009 WIP Listen to voicemails and take messages	Ashley General Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
78395 TIME 1/9/2009 WIP Listened to voicemails and recorded them on spreadsheet.	Ashley General Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	625.00
70897 TIME 1/9/2009 Billed G:28380 4/14/2 Travel to and from LA to attend CMC and argue to jury trial. Meeting with Rebecca Willis to discushearing. Meeting with Tom Bunn to discuss hearing Appearance at hearing on CMC and right to jury	ss ing.	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
78394 TIME 1/9/2009 WIP Make chart with information obtained from voicer	Ashley General Antelope mails.	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	187.50
70898 TIME 1/11/2009 Billed G:28380 4/14/2 I met with Ahsley at office to discuss calling back class members and format of spreadsheet to trace		2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00

			• • •		
Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
Exchange of emai mails and website	TIME G:28380 w of order re CMC from court. Is with Dan Roberts regarding voice. Telephone conferences with alled the toll free number.		2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
water district. Tele Roberts regarding conference with S document reposite	G:28380 4/14/2009 regarding operations of ephone conference with Dan list of class members. Telephone tephanie regarding status of cry, status of document production, access to database, and rebsite.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 with Stephanie and Dave Z to database. Meeting with Dave and e.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
second meeting v of pleadings filed. right to jury trial. I	Telephone conference with phone conference with Chris	·	5.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2320.00
70903 1/22/2009 Billed Telephone confer	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 rence with class members.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope	1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	520.00
Exchange of ema	rence call that lasted over one hou ils with landowners. Telephone Gail from Brad Weeks office	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
70905 1/24/2009 Billed Further preparation	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 on of brief on right to jury trial.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	7.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T @1	2880.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	·	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70906 TIME 1/25/2009 Billed G:28	380 4/14/2009 lef regarding right to jury trial sition brief to PWS brief	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	6.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2560.00
	380 4/14/2009 regarding right to jury trial. ith landowners. Preparation	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	7.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2840.00
		•	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
members. Telephone co	380 4/14/2009 Idence to Judge Komar. Idence to Judge Komar. Identify the state of t	·	5.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2320.00
			1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
and Dan Roberts to disc	3380 4/14/2009 meet with William Leever	·	5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
Summation to review pro production of documents review and discuss same Brunick to discuss docur	3380 4/14/2009 n Patrick Justafeson from CT ocedures for global s. Meeting with Patrick to e. Conference call with Bill ment production protocol and ery. Conference call with BH-	1	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description interrogatories to p	propound. Reviewed current filings	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
summation. Meetir	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 et with P. Justafson regarding CT ng with Patrick. Conference call Mclachlan regarding discovery. v of filings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
jury trial. I returned discuss discovery	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 es cited in the PWS brief for right to I some emails. I met with David to and ways to improve our call for all 800 numbers. I returned calls	0	5.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2320.00
70913 2/3/2009 Billed Telephone confere cases cited for righ	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ence with landowners and review of to jury trial.		3.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1240.00
Brunick regarding document and dep returned many photo visited with Ashley received email from date. Receipt and Stephen Grattan refurther exchange	G:28380 4/14/2009 ewed packet of materials from Bill Mojave case and ways to conduct position discovery in the case. I proceed the control of the case	I	5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
70218 2/5/2009 Billed Phone calls to me questions re notice	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 mbers of the class answering their e;	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2800.00
70859 2/5/2009 Billed Listen to voicemai	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 I and take messages.	Erica General Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	625.00
on 800 number. M	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 s of landowners that left messages leeting with Dave Watson to of calling all class members.	•	7.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2920.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	s with Brad Weeks regard	-	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
document protocol		unig				
70729 2/5/2009 Billed Listened to voicem	TIME G:28380 4 hails and returned calls.	1/14/2009	Ashley General Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	625.00
70730 2/6/2009 Billed Listened to voicem	TIME G:28380 4 nails and returned calls.	1/14/2009	Ashley General Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
members left on the with Erica and Ash	one calls from potential one voice mail message. Maley regarding documentation with Brad Weeks	leeting ation of all	·	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
70219 2/6/2009 Billed Phone calls to me questions re notice	mbers of the class answe	4/14/2009 ering their	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2800.00
70860 2/6/2009 Billed Listen to voicemai	TIME G:28380 4 I and take messages.	4/14/2009	Erica General Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
70731 2/9/2009 Billed Listened to voicen	TIME G:28380 nails and returned calls.	4/14/2009	Ashley General Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
water suppliers inc request for docum Brad Weeks regal documents and pr producing records class members re with landowners re Exchange of emai discovery protoco	G:28380 form discovery per reque cluding special interrogation. Preparation of respreding electronic production cocedure for all to follow in Telephone conferences garding uniform discover I with Brad Weeks regardles. Receipt and review of egarding Mojave adjudication.	est of publicories and ponse to on of n swith nee call ery. ding documen		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70861 2/10/2009 Billed	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 , enter messages into call log eturned calls.	Erica General	7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	875.00
Further preparation interrogatories, recorder admissions. Su	G:28380 4/14/2009 phone calls of class members. In of uniform discovery including quest for documents, and request pervised and met with paralegals regarding responses of class	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
70220 2/10/2009 Billed Phone calls to mer questions re notice	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 mbers of the class answering their e;	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2975.00
70863 2/11/2009 Billed Returned calls and	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 I updated call log spreadsheet.	Erica General Antelope	7.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	875.00
conference with CI Telephone confere	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 embers phone calls. Telephone hris Sanders regarding discovery. ence with BHJ regarding discovery n of request for documents and terrogatories.		8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3400.00
70146 2/12/2009 Billed Meeting with BHJ uniform discovery	and other counsel to finalize	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
Exchange of email uniform discovery. discovery. Travel t finalize discovery.	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 nd calls of class members. Is with all counsel to finalize Further preparation of uniform o Bakersfield to visit with BHJ and Telephone conference with Jill Justafson regarding CT	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope	9.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3640.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
78400 2/13/2009 WIP Returned calls fron		Vic Merjanian General Antelope	3.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	550.50
preparation of decl Grattan in support appointment of exp	G:28380 4/14/2009 of motion for expert costs. Furthe aration of expert Harter, Smith and of motion. Review of motion for pert from Wood Class. Discussions associate regarding calls from	r	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
78399 2/13/2009 WIP Researched Antelo support.	TIME ppe Valley Case, called tech	Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	3.33 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	499.50
Returned more phe preparation of unif- interrogatories, rec admissions, and fo water suppliers. Re	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 n of motion for expert witness fees, one calls of class members. Further orm discovery including uniform quest for documents, request for orm interrogatories to all public eccipt of edits to uniform discovery owners and sanitation district.		8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
70866 2/17/2009 Billed Return calls and u	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 pdated call log.	Erica General Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
witness fees. Exch including S Grattal revisions made to motion for expert v	TIME G:28380 d/14/2009 of declarations to motion for expert transpe of emails with all declarants in, R. Smith, and T. Harter. Review declarations. Final preparation of witness fees. Further preparation of and review of comments from other	· f	8.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3400.00
water suppliers. To regarding changes conference with D	TIME G:28380 of uniform discovery to all public elephone conference with BHJ is to all discovery. Telephone onna Luis to incorporate all ery. Exchange of emails with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description opposing counsel	regarding document depository	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70733 2/18/2009 Billed Listened to voicem	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 aails and returned calls.	Ashley General 009 Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
70867 2/18/2009 Billed Listened to voicem	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 nails and updated call log.	Erica General 009 Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	375.00
78406 2/19/2009 WIP Returned calls fror	TIME n the 800 number.	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	150.00
70732 2/19/2009 Billed Listened to voicem	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 nails and returned calls.	Ashley General 009 Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
Abrams to discuss experts to discuss Noah Hall to discu	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 erence, meeting with Bo Howa s groundwater issues; meeting case; meeting with law profes ss adjudication issues; meetin o discuss special master issue	with sor 3	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
78405 2/19/2009 WIP Returned calls from	TIME m the 800 number.	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	375.00
70869 2/19/2009 Billed Returned calls.	TIME G:28380 4/14/2	Erica General 009 Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
70734 2/20/2009 Billed Listened to voicen	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 nails and returned calls.	Ashley General 009 Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	625.00
70870 2/20/2009 Billed Listened to voicen	TIME G:28380 4/14/2 nail and returned calls.	Erica General 009 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	1000.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70216 2/20/2009 Billed	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 lay of water conference. Returned bers.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1960.00
78404 2/23/2009 WIP Returned calls fror	TIME the 800 number.	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	0.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	138.00
70221 2/23/2009 Billed Phone calls to me questions re notice	mbers of the class answering their	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	9.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	3150.00
70735 2/23/2009 Billed Listened to voicen	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 nails and returned calls.	Ashley General Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	625.00
70871 2/23/2009 Billed Returned calls.	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009	Erica General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
notice. Exchange notice. Telephone	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 tus report to court regarding class of email with PWS regarding class conference with class members. 2 to discuss notice and progress	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
70222 2/23/2009 Billed Phone calls to me questions re notice	mbers of the class answering their	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
70251 2/24/2009 Billed Phone calls to me questions re notice	mbers of the class answering their	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	2625.00
70260 2/24/2009 Billed Telephone conferentice.	TIME G:28380 4/14/2009 ence with class members regardin	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope g	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description			User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70873 2/24/2009 Billed Returned calls.	TIME G:28380 4		Ashley General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
70874 2/25/2009 Billed Received and retu			Ashley General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
70877 2/25/2009 Billed Received and retu			Erica General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
70261 2/25/2009 Billed Review of recently class members.	TIME G:28380 2 r filed pleadings. Returned	1/14/2009	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
70255 2/25/2009 Billed Phone calls to me questions re notice	mbers of the class answe	4/14/2009 ering their	Watson, David Correspondence Antelope	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	350.00 T@1	1225.00
notice to class me forms. Preparation confirming my cor of postings to web TPA Jennifer Keoprocessing forms. status. Preparatio	TIME G:28380 ence with Jeff Dunn regalembers and processing of of of correspondence to conversations with Jeff Dunrous site. Telephone conferency ugh regarding mistakes of Meeting with Dave Z to confor tomorrow's CMC. Telephone conditions with Dave I to confort tomorrow's CMC. Telephone conditions with Dave I to confort tomorrow's CMC.	response ourt n. Review nce with nade in discuss elephone		8.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3560.00
78398 2/27/2009 WIP Research McCarr	TIME an Amend.		Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	450.00
78397 2/27/2009 WIP Research McCarr	TIME an Amend.		Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	3.33 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	499.50
70875 2/27/2009 Billed Received and retu		4/14/2009	Ashley General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70876 TIME 2/27/2009	Erica General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
70266 TIME 2/27/2009 Billed G:28380 4/14/2009 Appearance at hearing on CMC and notice issues. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss same. Multiple exchange of emails with Jeff Dunn regarding postponing opt out date. Further preparation of motion for appointment of experts. Telephone conference with Rebecca Willis regarding her notice Preparation of memo to the file.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
70352 TIME 3/4/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Preparation for appearance in court regarding motio for expert fees. Receipt and review of pleading from US government opposing request for appointment of expert under Evidence Code 730. Telephone call with class member Horn regarding property of Jewis Federation and response form regarding opt outs.	f	6.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2440.00
70353 TIME 3/5/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Appearance telephonically regarding motion for appointment of expert fees. Responded to inquiries of court regarding Willis Class experts. Telephone conference with Keith Lemieux regarding email and principal's meeting wherein there is discussion of settling case on zone basis. Telephone conference with Bob Joyce regarding expert appointed for Willis Class. Telephone conference with David Sunding regarding results of hearing. Receipt and review of order from court. Attention to multiple emails from counsel regarding error in court decision and Mike's continued representation of small pumpers.		7.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3000.00
78396 TIME 3/6/2009 WIP Researched McCarran Amend	Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	2.83 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	424.50
70393 TIME 3/6/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Multiple telephone conferences and exchange of emails with Brad Weeks regarding standardized discovery. Receipt and review of standardized discovery from the Public Water Suppliers. Review documents produced by RCSD and LAWW. Meetin with Dave Z to discuss same. Meeting with Patrick		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Justafson to prepare document protocols and upon CT Summation.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70878 TIME 3/6/2009	Ashley General 2009 Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
78432 TIME 3/9/2009 WIP Researched water district.	Douglas Stacey Research Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00
70418 TIME 3/9/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/ Telephone conference with Steve Grattan regar results of hearing and his role in the case. Reviewebsite for LA county regarding Urban Water Management Plan. Finalize doe amendment for Penan Hills CSD. Telephone conference with F Logan regarding Phelan and the amount AFY it pumps and records under the PRA. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding discovery from I Lengthy telephone conference with Jeff Green regarding settlement proposal.	ew of rancis	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2720.00
78433 TIME 3/10/2009 WIP Researched water district.	Douglas Stacey Research Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	1000.00
70480 TIME 3/10/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/ Telephone conference with Thomas Harter regarding on motion for experts. Exchange of emwith Jeff Dunn regarding continuing opt-out date Conference call with BHJ regarding discovery a status of class case.	ails e.	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
78434 TIME 3/11/2009 WIP Researched water district.	Douglas Stacey Research Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	1000.00
70508 TIME 3/11/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14. Further preparation of spreadsheet that reflects pumping information from all 10 PWS. Telepho conference with J. Tootle regarding spreadsheet shows water use and discussion regarding sett proposal. Telephone conference with Landown regarding class notice.	one et that lement	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1800.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
78403 TIME 3/12/2009 WIP AV Voicemail; returned call	s to clients	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	375.00
78435 TIME 3/12/2009 WIP Researched water district a	nd draft memo.	Douglas Stacey Research Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00
70523 TIME 3/12/2009 1:59 PM Billed G:2838 Telephone conference with discovery. Telephone conference and conference on the regarding meet and conference on the regarding document reposit discovery. Meeting with D. 2 tomorrow's meeting with lar discovery in preparation for	2 4/14/2009 Bob Joyce regarding erence with Robert Kuhs and summary judgment nce with B. Weeks tory and uniform Zlotnick regarding ndowners. Review of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
78402 TIME 3/12/2009 WIP AV Voicemail; returned call	s to clients	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	3.17 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	475.50
70539 TIME 3/13/2009 Billed G:2838 Travel to and from Pasader landowner discovery and lit with all counsel to discuss telephone conferences with after the meeting including Bob Joyce and David Zlotn approach and changes to p	na for all PWS and all igation meeting. Meeting uniform discovery. Multiple counsel for landowners Bill Sloan, Rich Zimmer, ick to discuss discovery	·	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
78436 TIME 3/16/2009 WIP Review and code discovery	documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	1000.00
70554 TIME 3/16/2009 Billed G:2838 Exchange of emails with T. Preparation of memo to lan of meeting on the 13th. Circ landowners. Meeting with E case.	Bunn regarding discovery downers regarding results culated memo to all	/. S	3.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1520.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
78437 TIME 3/17/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	1000.00
70574 TIME 3/17/2009 8:55 AM Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Conference call with all landowners to discuss status of discovery. Preparation of correspondence to Jack Stewart from RCSD regarding dismissal of claims of prescription. Review of OWL case from Robert Dougherty. Further preparation of chart reflecting pumping from all landowners.		4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1920.00
78438 TIME 3/18/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	1250.00
70577 TIME 3/18/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Further preparation of uniform request for admissions incorporating admissions from Robert Dougherty and Rich Zimmer. Exchange of email with landowner counsel regarding uniform discovery. Research case law in support of condemnation.	s H	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1400.00
70879 TIME 3/18/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Worked on uniformed discovery, forwarded to Bunn and Dunn.	Ashley General Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
70591 TIME 3/19/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Exchange of emails with counsel regarding town hall meeting sponsored by Mike Fife. Telephone conference with Mike Fife regarding interference with Willis Class in conducting meeting. Exchange of emails with client regarding status of case. Research and reveiw of cases.	1	3.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1560.00
78439 TIME 3/19/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00
70606 TIME 3/20/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Meeting with Clerks Vic and Debbie to discuss calls from class members. Review of list of class membe that called toll free number. Exchange of emails with		4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1760.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Mike M, Mike F, Brad H, and Dan O, regarding in versus in personam jurisdiction and town hall me agenda. Review of town hall meeting agenda.		Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
78401 TIME 3/20/2009 WIP AV Voicemails; Returned calls to Clients	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00
78440 TIME 3/20/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00
70651 TIME 3/23/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2 Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding Nebeker town hall meeting, discovery, and settle proposal. Telephone conference with Mike McLa regarding experts and motion to decertify. Excha of emails with counsel regarding town hall meeting	clan nge	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
78441 TIME 3/23/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	625.00
78442 TIME 3/24/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00
70655 TIME 3/24/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2 Telephone conference with Bob Joyce regarding status of discovery and emails with Mike Fife.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2009 Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
70661 TIME 3/25/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2 Telephone conference with Mike Moore regardin possible settlement of case. Telephone conferer with Greg James regarding proposal from Mike Moore. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss same. Preparation of memo to the file regarding same.		1.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	640.00
78443 TIME 3/26/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70727 TIME 3/26/2009 1:05 PM	Ashley General Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
70699 TIME 3/26/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Meeting with Dave Z to discuss case in preparation for meeting with PWS. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding discovery. Preparation of spreadshethat shows pumping and surplus and overdraft. Review of all settlement proposals in preparation for meeting with Mike Moore.		4.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1960.00
70712 TIME 3/27/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/2009 Travel to and from Irvine to meet with counsel for Public Water Suppliers. Meeting with Eric Garner, Fred Faffel, Michael Moore, Jeff Dunn and David Zlotnick to discuss settlement of case and offer of th Willis Class. Meeting with Dave Z post meeting with PWS. Review of term sheet prepared by PWS.		8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
70728 TIME 3/27/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/200 Worked on Water Chart	Ashley General 9 Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	312.50
78444 TIME 3/27/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	1000.00
78445 TIME 3/28/2009 WIP Review and code discovery documents.	Douglas Stacey Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	250.00 T@1	750.00
70713 TIME 3/30/2009 Billed G:28382 4/14/200 Further preparation of term sheet and settlement of to PWS. Preparation of correspondence to PWS regarding offer to settle. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss revisions to settlement offer.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing 9 Antelope fer	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
70779 TIME 4/1/2009 Billed G:28485 6/2/200 Preparation of ex parte application to enjoin Mike F from soliciting members of the Willis Class. Review application from Mike McLachlan regarding ethical issues in connection with AGWA flyer. Multiple telephone conferences with BHJ regarding ex parte	of	8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00

Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
application and issues to bring up before all the PWS in meeting tomorrow at Bunn's office. Receipt and review of modified uniform discovery from Francis Logan (interrogatories), Brad Weeks (requests for admissions) and Thomas Bunn (request for production of documents).				
70780 TIME 4/2/2009 Billed G:28485 6/2/2009 Appearance at meet and confer conference before al the landowners and PWS to discuss uniform discovery and legal issues for court to decide. Appearance at ex parte application for TRO before Judge Komar regarding injunction against AGWA meeting. Telephone conference with BHJ and exchange of email with Bill Sloan regarding legal issues to frame before the court on prescription. Telephone conference with Michael Moore and Fred Faffel to discuss term sheet and revisions made thereto. Meeting with Dave Z before and after discussions with county counsel. Telephone conference with Greg James regarding operation of county counsel and term sheet proposal.		9.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3840.00
70858 TIME 4/3/2009 Billed G:28485 6/2/2009 Preparation of letter to opposing counsel regarding term sheet revisions. Preparation of stipulation to continue hearing on motion for court appointment of experts. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss revisions to letter. Exchange of email with Fred Pfaffle regarding revisions to term sheet.	Ralph Kalfayan4 General Antelope	3.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1240.00
70915 TIME 4/6/2009 Billed G:28485 6/2/2009 Telephone conference with BHJ regarding town hall meeting, uniform discovery, and right to jury trial. Meeting with DZ regarding conversations with BHJ. Review of PWS revisions to uniform discovery. Participated in landowner conference call. Exchange of emails with Mike Fife regarding new class member that needs to be contacted.		3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1360.00
70940 TIME 4/7/2009 Billed G:28485 6/2/2009 Exchange of emails with Bob Dougherty and Mike Fife and Brad Weeks regarding principals meeting. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding uniform discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
70973 4/8/2009 Billed Telephone confere settlement. Receip Dunn regarding revof comments to rev	TIME G:28485 nce with Jeff Dunn regarding of and review of email from Jeff visions to term sheet. Preparation visions. Review of OWL case in aring on CMC on the 24th of April.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1120.00
Moore regarding so regarding revisions conference with Re	TIME G:28485 6/2/2009 s with Jeff Dunn and Michael ettlement. Discussions with Dave s to term sheet. Telephone ebecca Willis regarding principals unter with Gene Nebeker.		1.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	760.00
sheet. Further prep	TIME 11:23 AM G:28485 Z to discuss revisions to term paration of term sheet. Exchange mes and Dave Z regarding terms		1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
uniform discovery. Francis Logan fror	respondence to all PWS regarding Telephone conference with In Phelan regarding discovery. In with all cousel. Meeting with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	760.00
71019 4/15/2009 Billed Further preparation with cover letter to	n of discovery and circulate same	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery 9 Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
April 24 hearing. E Further preparation	TIME G:28485 6/2/200 ence with Thomas Harter regardir Exchange of email with counsel. n of reply to motion for expert cos Z regarding CMC statement.		2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
settlement proposi landowners regard	TIME G:28485 6/2/200 ence with Jeff Dunn regarding al. Telephone conference with ling status of case. Meeting with ease. Conference call with all	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1120.00

Dates and Time Posting Status	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71048 TIME I	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1640.00
	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	760.00
	,	7.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2880.00
	·	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
	n	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
78390 TIME 4/29/2009 WIP Exchange of emails with all landowners regarding objection to Judge presiding over settlement and	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	0.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	360.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description benefits for and ag David.	ainst. Exchange of emails with	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71154 4/30/2009 Billed Receipt and review to discuss same.	TIME G:28485 6/2/2009 of all filings. Meeting with David 2	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
email to landowner	TIME G:28531 6/8/2009 of recent filings. Preparation of counsel regarding settlement. Z to discuss motion to decertify.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
71274 5/6/2009 Billed Review of filings at	TIME G:28531 6/8/2009 and emails with counsel.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
settlements. Meeti	nce with Jeff Dunn regarding ng with Dave Z to discuss als. Telephone conference with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	720.00
regarding class no discuss status of c Tony Leggio regar	respondence to Jeff Dunn tice. Meeting with Dave Z to ase. Telephone conference with ding settlement. Telephone eith Lemieux regarding meeting.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1560.00
71338 5/13/2009 Billed Review of all filing Z to discuss settle	s. Telephone conference with Dav	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope e	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
	lings in the case. Email exchange exchanges with counsel for	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope s	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1120.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71367 5/18/2009 Billed	TIME G:28531 6/8/2009 preparation of motion for summar	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
5/19/2009 Billed Telephone conferen	TIME G:28531 6/8/2009 Ice with BHJ regarding discovery. Igarding ex parte. Research cases 18.	•	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
5/20/2009 Billed Telephone conferer Bunn regarding disc	TIME G:28531 6/8/2009 ace with Francis Logan and Tom covery. Telephone conferences discovery responses. Receipt and	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
5/21/2009 Billed Preparation of letter	TIME G:28531 6/8/2009 to all Counsel for PWS regarding very. Receipt and review of emails		1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
5/22/2009 Billed Telephone conferer discovery, settleme regarding landowne with Dave Z to discuemails from counse	G:28531 6/8/2009 nce with Jeff Dunn regarding nt, cost allocation, and declaration or class from Bill Leever. Meeting cuss same. Receipt and review of all and review of filings. Review of egarding allocation of costs.		5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
Telephone conferer	nce with Tom Bunn regarding of filings in court. Review of motio	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope n	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
paperwork in suppo conference with Jef	G:28531 6/8/2009 ring on class notice. Review of ort of hearing. Telephone f Dunn regarding identification of ing with Dave Z to discuss MSJ	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71527 TIME 6/2/2009 Billed G:28602 Preparation of correspondence to all co regarding discovery. Telephone confere regarding motion to dismiss. Review of filed. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss ca	nce with BHJ pleadings	3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
71543 TIME 6/3/2009 Billed G:28602 Preparation of brief in support of allocat PWS. Research cases in support of sar		6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
71578 TIME 6/4/2009 Billed G:28602 Further preparation of motion to allocati Multiple telephone conferences with coulandowners including Bob Joyce and R.	unsel for	7.20 0.00 7.20 0.00	400.00 T@1	2880.00
71581 TIME 6/5/2009 Billed G:28602 Telephone conference with Keith Lemie discovery, conflict and attorneys fees. T conference with Francis Logan regardin production. Telephone conference with with David Z regarding trial and settlem Review of filings. Initial preparation of m Pendens.	elephone og document BHJ. Meeting ent strategy.	5.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2160.00
71603 TIME 6/8/2009 Billed G:28602 Further preparation of global settlement	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 7/30/2009 Antelope t agreement.	0.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	240.00
71618 TIME 6/8/2009 Billed G:28602 Preparation of Summary judgment motivation authorities.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 7/30/2009 Antelope on. Research	3.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1520.00
71624 TIME 6/9/2009 Billed G:28602 Telephone conference with Robert Kus settlement, in rem, and indispensable p Meeting with Dave Z to discuss status of Review of PWS filing regarding amenda complaint. Review of discovery respon purveyors.	earties. of case. ment to	4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1920.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71815 6/10/2009 Billed	TIME G:28602 7/30/2009 o Dismiss. Summarized discovery.	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	450.00
indispensable part discovery. Prepara	G:28602 7/30/2009 ation, coordination, and y rules. Review of filings and ation of reply to motion to dismiss.	·	6.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2560.00
71670 6/10/2009 Billed Organized respons	TIME G:28602 7/30/2009 ses to Uniform Discovery.	Ashley Discovery Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	375.00
East West Investn Receipt and review	TIME G:28602 7/30/2009 ence with Jessica, landowner of nent Inc., regarding status of case. w of emails from client regarding of emails with counsel.	•	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
71819 6/11/2009 Billed Summarize discov	TIME 1:45 PM G:28602 7/30/2009 very.	Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	180.00
71823 6/12/2009 Billed Interrogatories sur		Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	2.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	438.00
Review of papers conference with S and communication Meeting with Dave experts and retent	TIME 9:07 AM G:28602 7/30/2009 aring on motion to allocate costs. in advance of hearing. Telephone tefanie Headland regarding opt ou ons she has had with landowners. e Z to discuss motion to appoint tion of Thomas Harter. Further g indispensable parties.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope ts	4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1920.00
Research law incl	TIME G:28602 7/30/2009 ef in response to motion to dismiss uding coordination, consolidation, a parties. Meeting with Dave Z to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope 5.	7.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2880.00

71723 6/19/2009 Billed

TIME

G:28602

					. ago 10
Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description 71826 6/16/2009	TIME 1:45 PM	User Activity Client Reference Vic Merjanian Discovery	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 3.33 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status 150.00 T@1	Slip Value
Billed	G:28602 7/30/2009 A. County Waterworks)	Antelope Antelope	0.00 0.00		
stipulation to inclu Willis Class. Furth preparation of rep	TIME G:28602 7/30/2009 ence with Stef Hedland regarding de opt outs that wish to re-enter the preparation of stipulation. Finally to motion to dismiss. Meeting warguments to me made on brief.	l	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1800.00
Lemiueux's confliction Stefanie Hedland re-enter the class. from court regardiction conference with Stipulation. Teleph	TIME G:28602 Is with all counsel regarding of in case. Exchange of emails with regarding stipulation for opt outs to Review of all filings including ording small pumper class. Telephone tefanie Headland regarding none conference with Rowena stipulation to enter opt outs.	o er	6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
71828 6/17/2009 Billed Interrogatories (L. summarized.	TIME 3:10 PM G:28602 7/30/2009 A. County Waterworks)	Vic Merjanian Discovery 9 Antelope	1.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	288.00
Telephone conference brief. Research co	TIME G:28602 w of all briefs prior to hearing. ence with counsel for US regardin onsolidation rules. Research . Review of all discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope g	6.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2640.00
71831 6/18/2009 Billed Interrogatories (Resummarized.	TIME G:28602 7/30/200 osamond Community Services)	Vic Merjanian Discovery 9 Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	375.00
71832 6/19/2009 Billed Interrogatories (Resummarized.	TIME G:28602 7/30/200 osamond Community Services)	Vic Merjanian Discovery 9 Antelope	4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	660.00

Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance 7/30/2009 Antelope 3.30 0.00 0.00 400.00 T@1 1320.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
Mike M regarding pumping landowne	ence with counsel for Wood class motion to dismiss and serving ers. Appearance at hearing via n to dismiss. Telephone conferer g discovery.		0.00		
71835 6/22/2009 Billed Interrogatories (Lit summarized.	TIME 3:35 PM G:28602 7/30/200 ttleRock Creek Irrigation)	Vic Merjanian Discovery 9 Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	675.00
71729 6/22/2009 Billed Review of filings. I	TIME G:28602 7/30/200 Exchange of emails with counsel.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
71836 6/23/2009 Billed Interrogatories	TIME 1:05 PM G:28602 7/30/200	Vic Merjanian Discovery 9 Antelope	2.42 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	363.00
Telephone conferd and conferd Review responses. Prepa	TIME G:28602 7/30/200 ence with BHJ regarding discove ence with Tom Bunn regarding m w and summarized discovery ration of letter to all parties ry meet and confer.		3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
members. Exchar	Telephone conference with class age of email with all counsel. e Z to discuss status of case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1800.00
71837 6/24/2009 Billed Interrogatories	TIME 1:05 PM G:28602 7/30/200	Vic Merjanian Discovery 99 Antelope	4.08 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	612.00
	TIME G:28602 7/30/20 ories for Palmdale Water District readsheet summarizing same.	Arthur Connors Discovery 99 Antelope	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	375.00
71838 6/25/2009 Billed Interrogatories (A	TIME G:28602 7/30/20 dmissions L.A. County Waterwor	Vic Merjanian Discovery 09 Antelope ks)	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	600.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71742 TIME 6/25/2009	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery 9 Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
71790 TIME 6/26/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Review Interrogatories for Palmdale Water District and Phelan Pinon Hills Community.	Arthur Connors Discovery 9 Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	750.00
71753 TIME 6/26/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Call class members regarding the Opt in Form. Emailed them the form to fill out and return.	Ashley General 9 Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
71755 TIME 6/26/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Review of filings. Multiple emails and telephone conference with class members regarding opting in class. Review of responses to uniform set of discovery.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery 9 Antelope to	5.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2120.00
71756 TIME 6/26/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Listen to and log voicemails left on the 800 number Return phone calls and emails from people requesting Opt In forms.	Ashley General 99 Antelope	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	437.50
71839 TIME 6/27/2009 8:15 AM Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Interrogatories (Admissions)	Vic Merjanian Discovery 9 Antelope	2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	337.50
71840 TIME 6/28/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Interrogatories (Admissions Littlerock Creek)	Vic Merjanian Discovery 99 Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	180.00
71841 TIME 6/29/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Interrogatories (Admissions Littlerock Creek) summarized.	Vic Merjanian Discovery 99 Antelope	7.75 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	1162.50
71850 TIME 6/29/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/200 Review of filings and exchange of emails. Further preparation of summary of discovery from all PWS Review of spreadsheets in support thereof.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 09 Antelope	4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1920.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
71757 TIME 6/29/2009	Ashley General 2009 Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
71791 TIME 6/29/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/ Review Interrogatories for Quartz Hill Water Dis	Arthur Connors Discovery 2009 Antelope trict.	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	375.00
71852 TIME 6/30/2009 Billed G:28602 7/30/ Further review of discovery from all PWS. Review filings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2009 Antelope ew of	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
71842 TIME 6/30/2009 11:15 AM Billed G:28602 7/30/ Compiled/reviewed/edited/corrected Admis. Sur	Vic Merjanian Discovery 2009 Antelope mrs.	12.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	1938.00
71963 TIME 7/1/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/ Request for Admissions (Phelan Pinon Hills Community)	Arthur Connors Discovery 2009 Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	150.00
71964 TIME 7/1/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/ Request for Admissions (Palmdale Water Distri	Arthur Connors Discovery (2009 Antelope ct)	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	150.00
71855 TIME 7/1/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/ Exchange of email with Mike Moore and Stefan Headland regarding communications with class members. Review of filings. Review of emails. Telephone conference with class members. Preparation of summary of discovery responses		8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
72230 TIME 7/1/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4, Summarized form interrogatories.	Vic Merjanian Discovery /2009 Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	645.00
71962 TIME 7/1/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4. Request for Admissions (Cal Water Service Co	Arthur Connors Discovery /2009 Antelope .)	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	225.00
71864 TIME 7/2/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4 Travel to Pasadena to meet with all PWS count	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery /2009 Antelope sel and	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Marca di Mar	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
all counsel to discu	regarding discovery. Meeting with uss discovery.	7			
72243 7/2/2009 Billed Worked on form in Amendment.	TIME G:28692 9/4/2009 terrogatories and McCarran	Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	3.35 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	502.50
72231 7/3/2009 Billed Reviewed McCarra form interrogatorie	an Amendment and summarized	Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00
72037 7/6/2009 Billed Summarized Palm Form Interrogatoric	dale Water District's responses to	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00
72232 7/6/2009 Billed Interrogatories (Fo summarized.	TIME G:28692 9/4/2009 rm and Production of Documents	Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	4.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	615.00
72233 7/7/2009 Billed Interrogatories (Fo summarized.	TIME G:28692 9/4/2009 rm and Production of Documents	Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	3.45 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	517.50
72234 7/8/2009 Billed Interrogatories su		Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	525.00
72040 7/9/2009 Billed Summarized Cal V Form Interrogatori	Vater Service Co.'s responses to	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	150.00
72038 7/9/2009 Billed Summarized Quar Form Interrogatori	tz Hill Water District's responses t	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	1.75 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	262.50
72039 7/9/2009 Billed Summarized PPH Interrogatories (se	CSD's responses to Form	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	75.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72065 TIME 7/13/2009	Erica General Antelope	0.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	37.50
72044 TIME 7/14/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Summarized Cal Water Service Co.'s responses to Document Requests (set one)	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	150.00
72042 TIME 7/14/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Summarized Quartz Hill Water District's responses to Document Requests (set one)	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00
72043 TIME 7/14/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Summarized PPHCSD's responses to Document Requests (set one)	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	0.75 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	112.50
72235 TIME 7/14/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Interrogatories USA summarized.	Vic Merjanian Discovery Antelope	1.25 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	187.50
72041 TIME 7/14/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Summarized Palmdale Water District's responses to Documents Requests (set one)	Sarah Gingles Discovery Antelope	1.75 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	262.50
72063 TIME 7/15/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Scheduled and confirmed dates for joint meet and confer regarding objections to discovery.	Erica Discovery Antelope	1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	162.50
72244 TIME 7/15/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Research attorney fees.	Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	450.00
72245 TIME 7/16/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Interrogatories summarized and fees research.	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	510.00
72237 TIME 7/17/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Interrogatories final compilation and researched fees	Vic Merjanian General Antelope 3.	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	225.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72034 7/20/2009 Billed Conference call wiregarding alignme counsel Lemieux. landowners regard of discovery from I Tom Bunn regarding	TIME G:28692 th all PWS and Landowners nt of parties and disqualification Conference call with all ling discovery. Receipt and reversely. Telephone conference with all claims. Mealing status of case. Review of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management O09 Antelope on of view vith eeting	9.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3640.00
72238 7/20/2009 Billed Meeting with Ralpl document product	n. Consolidation, research and	Vic Merjanian General 2009 Antelope I	4.45 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	667.50
	h. Consolidation, research and ion review. Also, consolidation		3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	450.00
tomorrow's meet a production. Review	ith Keith and BHJ regarding and confer and document w of one disc received from Du per clippings. Review of one d		8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
72055 7/22/2009 Billed Spoke with Bob Jo regarding meeting	byce's secretary several times	Ashley General 2009 Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
72054 7/22/2009 Billed Reviewed Uniform of Documents.	TIME G:28692 9/4/2 n Discovery Requests for Prod	Ashley General 2009 Antelope uction	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
	Little Rock Creek ID. Meeting rm of Lemieux to review docur		9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
72067 7/23/2009 Billed	TIME G:28692 9/4/2	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 2009 Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

tomorrow's hearing ar of motion for appointn conference with BHJ r		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
7/23/2009 Billed G Create cd-rom discs of	:28692 9/4/2009 containing BB&K and Cal f Documents. Draft letter to d cd-rom discs.	Ashley General Antelope	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	187.50
7/23/2009 Billed G	IME :28692 9/4/2009 s produced to CD ROM Discs.	Erica Discovery Antelope	0.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	37.50
7/24/2009 Billed G Review of court filings Appearance at court of motions to disqualify. counsel regarding Just with Dave Z to discus with BHJ regarding comemo from David reg LACWW. Telephone	imE :28692 s in preparation for hearing. call regarding Wood class Exchange of emails with stice Robie meeting. Meeting s status. Telephone conference onsolidation motion. Review of parding documents produced by conference with Greg James ase and consolidation.		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
7/27/2009 Billed G Telephone conference Preparation of spread Exchange of email wire mediation. Review of	e with Malinda Moore. Isheet for Justice Robie. th all counsel regarding documents from LA. Review of one conference with Bill Brunick	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
7/27/2009		Erica General Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
7/28/2009 Billed G Travel to Palmdale to with Brad Weeks and	IME 6:28692 9/4/2009 6 meet and confer on discovery I BHJ. Meeting with BHJ post view of Quartz Hill documents at	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	10.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4040.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72117 TIME 7/29/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Spoke with Carolyn Dillinger regarding Opt-in Form; emailed her the form.	Ashley General Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
72240 TIME 7/29/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 1021.5 Public Benefit Motion research.	Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	3.35 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	502.50
72130 TIME 7/29/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Travel from Littlerock Creek. Meeting with opposing counsel Kristine Carson to discuss document production and document copying. Meeting with LDSI to discuss copying of Littlerock creek documents. Preparation of memo to file regarding document inspection of Quartz Hill.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3480.00
72241 TIME 7/30/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 LAC document review (overdraft/notice/prescription)	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	3.35 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	502.50
72207 TIME 7/30/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Research consolidation in preparation of filing opposition brief. Review of draft briefs from BHJ. Appearance at conference call with PWS.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
72242 TIME 7/31/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 LAC & Rosamond document review (overdraft/notice/prescription).	Vic Merjanian General Antelope	2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	337.50
72208 TIME 7/31/2009 Billed G:28692 9/4/2009 Further preparation of opposition to motion to consolidate. Further research regarding same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
72522 TIME 8/1/2009 8:10 AM Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Performed document review of electronic discovery from LAC & Rosamond regarding overdraft notice, and prescription. Organized documents and consolidated various categories into four and analyzed and categorized documents into four categories necessary to respond to.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	1.83 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	274.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72525 TIME 8/3/2009 1:10 PM Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Performed document review of electronic discovery from LAC & Rosamond regarding overdraft, notice, and prescription. Organized documents and consolidated various categories into four and analyzed and categorized documents into four categories necessary to respond to.	Vic Merjanian Case management	3.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	588.00
72206 TIME 8/3/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Further preparation of brief in opposition to motion to stay. Further preparation of brief in support of opposition to motion to consolidate. Research regarding stay and consolidation. Multiple telephone conferences with BHJ, Bill Sloan and Francis Logan. Appearance at landonwer conference call. Review o briefs filed by other counsel. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss case.		9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
72526 TIME 8/4/2009 1:10 PM Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Performed document review of electronic discovery from LAC & Rosamond regarding overdraft, notice, and prescription. Organized documents and consolidated various categories into four and analyzed and categorized documents into four categories necessary to respond to.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	3.83 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	574.50
72246 TIME 8/4/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Spoke with Keith Lemieux secretary several times regarding discovery production meeting.	Erica General Antelope	0.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	37.50
72311 TIME 8/4/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Travel to Anaheim to review and inspect documents of Phelan Pinion. Meeting with Susan Trager and Francis Logan. Review of documents.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
72527 TIME 8/5/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Called LDSI for e-discovery and Ralph K. researched and found 4 previous water judgments. Performed document review of electronic discovery from LAC & Rosamond regarding overdraft, notice and prescription. Organized documents and analyzed and consolidated various arguments into appropriate categories.	d '	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	390.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72247 8/5/2009 Billed	TIME G:28776 9/16/20 g and research documents.	Erica General 09 Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	250.00
documents. Meetin	TIME G:28776 9/16/20 ert and North Edwards to revieur with counsel Kristen Carson Roseana. Review of documents	and	10.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4120.00
	at were filed. Attention to docur documents produced by LA	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery 09 Antelope nent	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00
Evaluated, reviewe production from LA	TIME 1:00 PM G:28776 9/16/20 discovery. Meeting with Ralph led and analyzed document of & Rosamond regarding and prescription. Worked on me		4.17 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	625.50
72529 8/7/2009 Billed Reviewed and ana Rosamond. Prepa	TIME G:28776 9/16/20 lyzed e-discovery from LAC & ured memo on notice.	Vic Merjanian Case management 009 Antelope	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	420.00
	gs filed. Preparation of reply bri- nent of experts. Review of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Discovery 009 Antelope ef	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
Meeting with Franc with David Sunding	TIME G:28776 9/16/20 review documents of Phelan. is Logan. Telephone conferency g regarding expert work on ghts, correlative rights, and land		8.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3440.00
72535 8/10/2009 Billed Prepare memo on		Vic Merjanian Case management 009 Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	600.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72317 TIME 8/11/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Telephone conference with Malinda Moore regarding Justice Roby schedule. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding trial date. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn's secretary regarding Wildermouth. Multiple telephone conferences with Dan Roberts regarding information related to the classes. Multiple telephone conferences with Lemieux regarding document production and written discovery. Conference call wit Bill Sloan and BHJ regarding Borax operation and hearing on the 17th of August. Preparation of list of questions for Bill Leever.	e	10.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4120.00
72537 TIME 8/11/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Prepared memo on notice. Reviewed 3 production master folders.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	4.05 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	607.50
72584 TIME 8/12/2009 12:55 PM Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Reviewed 3 production master folders.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	4.08 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	612.00
72375 TIME 8/12/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Further review and preparation for case management conference.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope tt	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope to ss	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
72586 TIME 8/13/2009 2:05 PM Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Found documents and analysis of consolidation. Spoke with LDSI regarding previous e-discovery and future e-discovery. Researched and found cases presented by BBK in opposition to KKBS motion for expert witnesses. Reviewed Little Rock Creek documents produced through e-discovery.	Vic Merjanian Research Antelope	4.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	720.00
72374 TIME 8/14/2009 Billed G:28776 9/16/2009 Review of all pleadings and cases in preparation for motion for expert fees. Exchange of emails with Stefanie regarding demographics of classes.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

LDSI regarding document copying.

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72587 TIME 8/14/2009 1:20 PM	ichelle or	3.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	550.50
72389 TIME 8/17/2009 Billed G:28776 9 Travel to San Jose for hearing. Appearance hearing on motion for experts and motion to motion to consolidate. Meeting with expert E Sunding regarding economist opinions regarding	stay and David	9.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3760.00
72588 TIME 8/17/2009 1:10 PM Billed G:28776 9 Began Concordance document review, taggorganized documents. Confirmed and sche coordinated Palmranch, North Edwards and Lake discovery. Reviewed Palmdale Discordinated Palmdale Discor	duled and Desert	3.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	588.00
72589 TIME 8/18/2009 2:00 PM Billed G:28776 9 Coordinated North Edwards & Palm Ranch Searched for and found documents on cour Researched water banking rights.	•	3.08 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	462.00
72399 TIME 8/19/2009 Billed G:28776 9 Review of Justice Robie decisions. Review decisions regarding prescription.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Mediation 1/16/2009 Antelope of	5.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2240.00
72590 TIME 8/19/2009 1:10 PM Billed G:28776 S Reviewed documents and prepared binder memo. Worked on technical aspects for Alpresentation.		2.83 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	424.50
72461 TIME 8/24/2009 Billed G:28776 S Receipt and review of correspondence from Zimmer regarding settlement conference. I telephone conferences with BHJ regarding review of L.A. Water Works. Exchange of a LDSI regarding document conving	Multiple document	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72592 8/26/2009 Billed Document review f	TIME 10:15 AM G:28776 9/16/2009 or Palmdale e-discovery wed and Organized documents for	•	1.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	250.50
	TIME 9:30 PM G:28776 9/16/2009 or Palmdale e-discovery wed and Organized documents fo	·	1.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	250.50
	TIME G:28776 9/16/2009 or Palmdale e-discovery d folder of production. Reviewed uments for memo.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	3.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	555.00
72595 8/29/2009 Billed Palmdale memo oi	TIME 8:15 AM G:28776 9/16/2009 n notice.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	2.25 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	337.50
72596 8/30/2009 Billed Palmdale memo oi	TIME 9:00 AM G:28776 9/16/2009 n notice.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	1.75 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	262.50
	TIME G:28776 9/16/2009 diation. Review of cases and ice Robie. Review of pleadings an	•	7.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3040.00
72597 8/31/2009 Billed Palmdale memo o	TIME 1:45 PM G:28776 9/16/2009 n notice.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	3.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	550.50
Robie. Meeting wit discuss points of n	TIME G:28840 10/19/2009 nto for mediation with Justice h Greg James and David Z to nediation. Review of cases e Robie. Review of expert reports.	·	9.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3680.00
	TIME G:28840 10/19/2009 diation before Justice Robie. sel post mediation to draft	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	11.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4480.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description framework for an agreement. Travel back to San Diego.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72604 TIME 9/3/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/2009 Exchange of email with Eric Garner and Michael Moore regarding mediation. Research CA Class Acton Law.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
72608 TIME 9/4/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/2009 Exchange of emails with Bill Sloan and Mike M regarding principals meeting. Telephone conference with Mike Mclachlan regarding consolidation. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss consolidation and US government position.	·	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
72706 TIME 9/8/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/2009 Receipt and review of correspondence from Robert Hartsock regarding dismissal. Telephone conference with Robert regarding wells in AVAA. Review of Central Basin decision regarding storage rights.	<i>.</i>	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
72737 TIME 9/9/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/2009 Exchange of email with Mike Mclachlan regarding US and consolidation. Receipt and review of "framework for settlement agreement" from Eric Garner. Telephone conference with Bill Brunick's office regarding meeting. Preparation of email to Eric Garner documenting changes and revisions to Framework for settlement Agreement. Receipt and review of email from Tom Bunn regarding ethical rules for principals meeting.		4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
72812 TIME 9/10/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/2009 Telephone conference with Eric Garner regarding Framework of an agreement. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss same. Further revisions made to the agreement. Exchange of emails with Michael Moore regarding settlement. Exchange of emails with Eric Garner regarding settlement.	•	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
72862 TIME 9/14/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/2009 Receipt and review of minute order from court regarding Willis class members opting back in. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	200.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description forthcoming hearing.		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72868 T 9/15/2009 Billed G Preparation of reques Telephone conferencesame. Review of corr	IME ::28840 10/19/2009 st for dismissal of Mojave PUD. e with R. Hartsock regarding espondence from Mojave PUD. nended Complaint. Meeting with nsolidation issues.	·	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
9/18/2009 Billed G Further preparation o consolidation. Teleph regarding response.	IME i:28840 10/19/2009 f brief regarding opposition to one conference with BHJ Telephone conference with DZ arch issues related to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
9/22/2009 Billed Exchange of email wi	IME 3:28840 10/19/2009 ith Eric Garner regarding US earch of consolidation issues.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	200.00
9/23/2009 Billed G	IME 3:28840 10/19/2009 f reply to coordination motion by esearch same.		2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
9/24/2009 Billed G	IME 6:28840 10/19/2009 se with Mike Mclachlan regarding v of filings.		0.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	320.00
9/25/2009 Billed G Telephone conference hearing and Judge as to discuss case and o	IME 5:28840 10/19/2009 be with Rowena Walker regarding signment. Meeting with Dave Zoonsolidation. Preparation of arding questions in consolidation	g	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
9/28/2009 Billed G Exchange of emails v changes to framewor Government Code 94 with Greg James reg Meeting with Bill Brur physical solution that	EIME 6:28840 with Eric Garner regarding of the agreement. Research 40 et. seq. Telephone conference arding settlement agreement. nick in Oceanside to discuss includes all parties. Travel to evisions to Framework	·	8.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3360.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description agreement. Research judgments after consolidatio	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
72997 TIME 9/29/2009 Billed G:28840 10/19/200 Exchange of email regarding status conference statement for October 13 hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope	0.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	160.00
73101 TIME 10/2/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Review of filings and further research consolidation issues. Preparation for hearing on the 13th of October.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 99 Antelope	2.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1120.00
73136 TIME 10/5/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Further preparation of Case management conferent statement. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss same. Exchange of emails with Eric and Michael Moore regarding Framework Agreement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 09 Antelope nce	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
73139 TIME 10/6/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Telephone conference with Michael Moore regardi settlement and Framework agreement. Meeting wi Dave Z to discuss same. Telephone conference w Steve Strinticoff from Capa De Oro regarding settlement. Research consolidation and motion to sever.	th	5.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2120.00
73200 TIME 10/9/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/20 Review of file in preparation for hearing on consolidation.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 09 Antelope	3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
73229 TIME 10/12/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/20 Travel to San Jose regarding motion to consolidate Research case authorities and supporting papers.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance 09 Antelope e.	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
73230 TIME 10/13/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/20 Appearance in San Jose regarding motion to consolidate. Multiple conferences with PWS and landowner counsel and Wood class counsel. Trav back from San Jose.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 09 Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
73231 TIME 10/14/2009	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope	1.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	680.00
73259 TIME 10/19/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Exchange of emails with Mike Mclachlan regarding settlement agreement. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss terms of settlement and dismissal of Deser Lake and North Edwards.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 9 Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
73268 TIME 10/20/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Review of all filings from Feds and PWS regarding 170.6 issue. Review of cases. Meeting with Dave Z discuss settlement agreement. Exchange ofemail v Tom Bunn regarding settlement agreement.		1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
73274 TIME 10/21/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Telephone conference with landowners that opted of class but seek to rejoin the Willis class. Telepho conference with Robert Kuhs regarding new client a tenant and involved in both classes.	ne	2.60 0.00 1.10 1.50	400.00 T@1	1040.00
73286 TIME 10/22/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Telephone conference with class members regarding rejoining the class. Exchange of email with Rowens Walker regarding process. Meeting with Dave Z an Ash to discuss same.	a	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
73291 TIME 10/23/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Telephone conference with landowners that were served but were not members of the class. Telephoconference with Mike M to discuss terms of settlement. Exchange of email with counsel regard water banking.		2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
73304 TIME 10/27/2009 Billed G:28848 11/16/200 Appearance at hearing on 170.6 motion. Preparat for hearing. Telephone conference with Keith Lemieux regarding settlement. Telephone conferer with Bob Joyce regarding hearing. Telephone conference with Greg James regarding emails from Mike M. Exchange of emails with Mike McLachlan	nce	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description regarding settleme agreement.	ent. Review draft of settlement	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
regarding settleme with all counsel re agreement. Revie	TIME G:28848 11/16/2009 ith Jeff Dunn and Eric Garner ent agreement. Exchange of email garding terms of settlement w of other judgments in Chino, nta Maria, and Mojave.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3320.00
	TIME G:28848 11/16/2009 ence with opt out class members in the class. Further review of other nts.		3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
rejoining the class agreement and ju	TIME G:28922 12/9/2009 ence with class members regarding s. Further preparation of settlement dgment. Meeting with Exchange of email with Greg James ent.	,	6.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2720.00
rejoin the Willis cl	TIME G:28922 ence with landowners that desire to ass. Further review and preparation ement and judgment.	,	6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
	rence with Susan Trager regarding and terms of settlement agreement	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	760.00
meeting with Just settlement agreer	rence with Tom Bunn regarding lice Robie. Further preparation of ment regarding Willis class. rence with Landowners regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00

				Ū
Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
73504 TIME 11/9/2009	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing 2009 Antelope	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
73552 TIME 11/10/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Telephone conference with class members that served with cross-complaint. Research facts in support of writ.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice 2009 Antelope were	3.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1240.00
73551 TIME 11/11/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Research writs, procedure for filing opposition, case law in support thereof.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing 2009 Antelope and	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
73550 TIME 11/12/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Telephone conference with class members regalawsuit.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice '2009 Antelope arding	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
73589 TIME 11/16/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Telephone conference with BHJ regarding apper writ. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding appeal and writ. Exchange of email with counse regarding principal's meeting. Review of minute agenda of principals meeting. Receipt and review order from court regarding consolidation. Telept conference with landowers that wish to rejoin the Willis class. Review of outline of settlement from principal's meting.	rding el es and ew of hone ee	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
73607 TIME 11/17/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Review of all minutes regarding principals meet Preparation for principals meeting. Meeting with Brunick at City Hall to discuss status of case.		4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
73608 TIME 11/18/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Travel to Palmdale to attend principals meeting Appearance at principals meeting.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Mediation /2009 Antelope	10.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4000.00
73610 TIME 11/19/2009 Billed G:28922 12/9/ Telephone conference with landowners who wis rejoin the class. Review of documents produced		3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
principals meeting.	conference with BHJ regarding Review of Mojave adjudication. of disposition on writ.				
Mohave Basin. Tel Trager regarding s	ence with watermaster for the ephone conference with Susan ettlement agreement. Review of olution. Exchange of email with	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference 9 Antelope	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
73761 12/1/2009 Billed Drafted letter to Vi	TIME G:28997 1/11/201 ctoria Robinson Smith.	Ashley General 0 Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	62.50
73688 12/1/2009 Billed Receipt and reviev	TIME G:28997 1/11/201 v of letters from class members.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice 0 Antelope	0.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	80.00
73774 12/2/2009 Billed Telephone confere regarding status of	ence with counsel for class memb	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice 0 Antelope er	0.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	80.00
73839 12/3/2009 Billed Review of cases ir summary judgmen	preparation for motion for	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
settlement and cor with Brian Martin fi	Bunn to discuss status of ndemnation. Telephone conferen rom Pillsbury to discuss status of Mesa development. Meeting wit		1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
rejoining the Willis Jeff Dunn and Mik Meeting with Dave	TIME G:28997 1/11/201 ence with Landowners regarding class. Exchange of emails with e McLachlan and Curtis Paxton. Z to discuss same. Further g motion for summary judgment.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
73923 12/14/2009 Billed	TIME G:28997 1/11/201	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	0.90 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	360.00

	nce with landowner regarding ss. Receipt and review of email	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
from Eric Garner. F	TIME G:28997 1/11/2010 of revised settlement agreement Research revisions made regarding ally an order post settlement.	'	3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1360.00
Preparation of resp	TIME G:28997 1/11/2010 of emails from Lee and PWS. conse email. Review of prior court th Dave to discuss same.	,	2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1000.00
consolidation. Tele Mclachlan regardir	G:28997 1/11/2010 with all PWS counsel regarding phone conference with Mike ag settlement. Telephone om Bunn regarding consolidation, ent.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
to settlement agree	TIME G:29062 2/10/2010 with all PWS regarding revisions ement. Receipt and review of emai and client. Meeting with Dave Z to	·	3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
74065 1/5/2010 Billed Exchange of email settlement agreem	TIME G:29062 2/10/2010 with opposing counsel regarding ent.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	0.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	80.00
discuss changes in revisions proposed same. Exchange of principals meeting	TIME G:29062 2/10/2010 ence with Jeff Dunn and David Z to a settlement agreement. Review of d. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss of email with client regarding Telephone call to Bill Sloan with mediator. Research Rules of 9 (h).	•	4.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1800.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
74114 TIME 1/7/2010	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1480.00
74121 TIME 1/8/2010 Billed G:29062 2/10/201 Preparation of case management conference statement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
74157 TIME 1/11/2010 Billed G:29062 2/10/201 Further preparation of case management conference statement. Research Rule of court issues regarding entry of judgment in class cases.		2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
74263 TIME 1/12/2010 Billed G:29062 2/10/201 Receipt and review of consolidation order. Review of filings and exchange of email with opposing counse		4.30 0.00 4.20 0.10	400.00 T@1	1720.00
74264 TIME 1/13/2010 Billed G:29062 2/10/201 Exchange of email with counsel. Meeting with water expert. Review of consolidation order. Review of email from Eric Garner regarding changes to settlement agreement. Telephone conference with class members regarding status of case. Receipt or email from Rebecca Willis.		5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
74265 TIME 1/14/2010 Billed G:29062 2/10/201 Telephone conference with BHJ regarding status of litigation. Review of filings. Preparation for conference call initiated by PWS. Conference call with all landowners regarding complete consolidation order Meeting with Dave Z to discuss same. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding inter se adjudication.	ice	3.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1400.00
74268 TIME 1/15/2010 Billed G:29062 2/10/201 Appearance at case management conference befo Judge Komar. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding conference. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding settlement. Telephone conference with county counsel and Jeff Dunn regarding resolution of case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope re	2.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	920.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
74292 1/20/2010 Billed Telephone conferes settlement. Prepara agreement. Review	G:29062 2/10/2010 nce with Tom Bunn regarding ation of revisions to settlement of consolidation order. Revisions der. Email to counsel regarding judgment.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management	6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
regarding settleme management confe David to discuss st	G:29062 2/10/2010 nce with Eric Garner and Jeff Dunint. Preparation of case erence statement. Meeting with atus of settlement. Research final cases per Eric Garner and Jeff		7.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2920.00
Judge Komar. App hearing before Jud settlement. Telepho	G:29062 2/10/2010 tus conference hearing before earance at status conference ge Komar regarding status of one conference with Lee Leininger settlement. Meeting with Dave Z is to agreement.	·	4.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1880.00
74343 1/25/2010 Billed Research consolida settlement.	TIME G:29062 2/10/2010 ation and coordination in relation t		.4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
74344 1/26/2010 Billed Further research o	TIME G:29062 2/10/2010 n consolidation and coordination.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
response to PWS	G:29062 2/10/2010 us conference statement in order of consolidation. Research omplete consolidation versus on.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	5.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2120.00
status of case. Pre	TIME G:29062 nce with Greg James regarding paration of memo to file. Further consolidation and settlement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1440.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
74412 TIME 2/1/2010	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
74440 TIME 2/3/2010 Billed G:29114 3/9/201 Research cases in support of consolidation and ent of separate judgment. Review of all fillings in preparation of hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope ry	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
74441 TIME 2/4/2010 Billed G:29114 3/9/201 Preparation for hearing on consolidation. Travel to for hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope _A	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
74442 TIME 2/5/2010 Billed G:29114 3/9/201 Appearance at hearing on Consolidation. Meeting with Jeff Dunn post hearing. Travel to San Diego.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
74472 TIME 2/9/2010 Billed G:29114 3/9/201 Receipt and review of email from landowners regarding safe yield trial. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss approach to settlement. Review of revision to settlement agreement. Preparation of attorneys fees revisions to settlement agreement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1040.00
74489 TIME 2/16/2010 Billed G:29114 3/9/201 Telephone conference with landowners regarding status of case. Review of emails from counsel and Nebeker regarding principals meeting. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding status of case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	920.00
74497 TIME 2/17/2010 Billed G:29114 3/9/201 Receipt and review of emails from Zimmer and response thereto. Telephone conference with landowners regarding status of case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	200.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
74504 2/18/2010 Billed Exchange of email meeting.	TIME G:29114 3/9/2010 with Zimmer regarding defense	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	0.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	120.00
consolidation and of management. Med Email Sheldon Blo conference with Bloreview of another of	G:29114 3/9/2010 of orders from court regarding order regarding continued case eting with Dave Z to discuss order order regarding discovery. Telephoral regarding order. Receipt and order from court regarding order. Review of peremptory		2.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1000.00
case management	TIME G:29114 3/9/2010 udge's orders on consolidation an conference. Research notice idation for all purposes.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope d	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
notice to class me opposing counsel,	G:29114 3/9/2010 action administrators to discuss mbers, spreadsheets from and claim forms. Exchange of regarding meeting.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
upcoming trial. Co	th all landowners regarding onference call with opposing settlement. Review of orders from	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1560.00
conference with la Review of oppositi	TIME G:29114 3/9/2010 ot of hearing. Telephone indowner regarding status of case. on to 170.6 from all PWS. with Jeff Dunn regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 er from class members regarding Class. October 1, 2009 - March 1	Ashley Correspondence Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	625.00

Slip ID User Units Rate Slip Value Dates and Time **DNB** Time Rate Info Activity Posting Status Client Est. Time Bill Status Description Reference Variance 400.00 TIME 1400.00 74564 Ralph Kalfayan4 3.50 3/1/2010 0.00 Case management T@1 G:29181 4/15/2010 Antelope 0.00 Billed Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding 0.00 settlement. Review of another round of amendments to settlement agreement from Eric Garner, Exchange of email regarding the Willis position with respect to the amendments. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss the revisions. Exchange of email with Stefanie regarding class. Telephone conference with Mr. Zook regarding status of case. 74752 TIME 20.00 125.00 2500.00 Erica 3/1/2010 Case management 0.00 T@1 G:29181 4/15/2010 Antelope 0.00 Billed Calls from class members regarding how to rejoin the 0.00 Willis Class. Gave them contact information for court clerk. October 1, 2009 - March 1, 2010. 74753 TIME 20.00 125.00 2500.00 Ashley 3/1/2010 0.00 Case management T@1 Billed G:29181 4/15/2010 Antelope 0.00 Calls from class members regarding how to rejoin the 0.00 Willis Class. Gave them contact information for court clerk. October 1, 2009 - March 1, 2010. 74659 TIME Ralph Kalfayan4 8.00 400.00 3200.00 0.00 3/2/2010 Case management T@1 G:29181 4/15/2010 Antelope 0.00 Billed Multiple telephone conferences with Jeff Dunn and 0.00 opposing counsel regarding settlement. Review of changes made thereto. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss same. Review of all other parties status conference statements. Review of exparte filed by LA County. 74666 Ralph Kalfayan4 8.00 400.00 3200.00 TIME 3/3/2010 Case management 0.00 T@1 G:29181 4/15/2010 Antelope 0.00 Billed Telephone conference with landowner Jeff Tisza 0.00 regarding status of case. Multiple telephone conferences with Jeff Dunn regarding settlement. Exchange of email with opposing counsel regarding settlement. Further review of pleadings and preparation for case management conference. Preparation of case management conference statement. 74693 TIME Ralph Kalfayan4 8.00 400.00 3200.00

Case management

0.00

0.00

0.00

T@1

3/4/2010 Case ma
Billed G:29181 4/15/2010 Antelope
Review of 170.6 motion. Review of traffic email and
response to same. Review of all CMC statements.
Review of ex parte application filed by LA for service
by publication.

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 eles. Review of file in preparation ng with R. Zimmer, BHJ, and Bill tatus of case.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
with all PWS post	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 IC before Judge Komar. Meeting hearing. Telephone conference vid regarding status. Travel time to A.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
stipulation of settle	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 ail to PWS regarding revisions to ement. Review and exchange of insel regarding same. Review of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2760.00
74791 3/10/2010 Billed Preparation for me revision to settlem	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 eeting with PWS and further eent agreement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
74792 3/11/2010 Billed Further preparatio	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 n for meeting with PWS.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
Appearance at me	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 eles for meeting with all the PWS. eeting with all the PWS. Travel baceting with Greg James to discuss	•	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
revisions made to of email with Eric	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 regarding upcoming CMC. Further settlement agreement. Exchange Garner regarding agreement. il with class member regarding cas	·	5.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2120.00
regarding settleme	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 ence with James Markman ent. Telephone conference with Eri revisions to settlement. Review of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope c	4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1760.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description revised settlement 170.6.	agreement. Review of writ on	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
regarding settlemer from Warren and E	G:29181 4/15/2010 nce with Warren and Eric Garner nt agreement. Review of emails ric containing revisions to ent. Meeting with Dave Z to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
74840 3/22/2010 Billed Telephonic appears to discuss settleme	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 ance at CMC. Meeting with Dave 2 ent.		2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	800.00
court orders. Telep	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 mper class writ petition. Review of hone conference with Judge Irving n. Review of emails from class	F	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
and Warren Wettro of email with Tom E	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 nce with Jeff Dunn, Eric Garner, oth regarding settlement. Exchange Bunn regarding revisions. Email er preparation of paragraph VIII D.	e	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	800.00
	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 with opposing counsel regarding t. Review of filings by City of mdale.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
74892 3/29/2010 Billed Receipt and review	TIME G:29181 4/15/2010 of oppo to writ from Tom Bunn.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	0.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	160.00
75027 4/6/2010 Billed Exchange and revi regarding principal	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 ew of email with all counsel s meeting.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75043 4/7/2010 Billed Meeting with Dave	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 to discuss case. Email Eric Garne f settlement. Review of court filing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	520.00
of email with Eric	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 E Z to discuss settlement. Exchange Garner regarding settlement. Check garding small pumper class writ.		1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
Review of order fr	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 il with Eric Garner regarding status. om the court regarding motions. Dave regarding case.		1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
conference with p future principals n and acreage of A\ regarding principa	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 e Z to discuss results of settlement rincipals and participation of US in neeting. Review of class members V. Review of emails from Dave Z als meeting and demographics of femails regarding in presonam and	,	1.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	760.00
	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 in Bakersfield to confer with from Eric Garner regarding status o	•	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
75168 4/26/2010 Billed Review of resume conference with s	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 es for mediation. Telephone taff of mediators.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
agenda, and com	regarding principals meeting, mittee reports. Review emails from website. Meeting with Dave to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Mediation Antelope	1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	520.00
75190 4/29/2010 Billed Email Eric Garner	TIME G:29316 5/27/2010 r regarding neutrals. Email Tom	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Bunn regarding PWD meeting of the status of settlement. Lengthy telephowith Warren Wellen. Telephone confeduces regarding joinder in postponmed designation. Review of pleading filed class. Review of proposed modification.	one conference erence with Bob ent of expert by small pumper	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
schedule per BHJ email and email from Preparation of response to Tom Bunr refusal to pay attorneys fees.	om Lara Fowler.			
75197 TIME 4/30/2010 Billed G:29316 Meeting with Dave Z regarding developrincipals meeting. Telephone confer Dunn regarding settlement, BHJ extedesignation, and timing of hearings for approvals. Review of filings by couns status conference.	ence with Jeff nsion for expert or preliminary	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
75396 TIME 5/6/2010 Billed G:29321 Telephone conference with Dave Z re Telephone conference with BHJ regarders and filings.		1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
75407 TIME 5/11/2010 Billed G:29321 Meeting with to discuss state analysis of Scalmanini data.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 6/14/2010 Antelope us of case and	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
75408 TIME 5/12/2010 Billed G:29321 Telephone conference with Robert K pumping information, notice issues, a trial. Email from Dave regarding resu	and safe yield	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
75436 TIME 5/17/2010 Billed G:29321 Telephone conference with Landowr regarding transferability of property. email with Warren Wellen regarding	Exchange of	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
75450 TIME 5/19/2010 Billed G:29321 Email from mediator regarding safe y of response thereto. Review of cases for trial.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 6/14/2010 Antelope rield. Preparation s in preparation	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75460 5/20/2010 Billed Telephone confere	nce with class member Neil lational Bank. Preparation of mem	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	0.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	280.00
meeting. Telephon	TIME G:29321 6/14/2010 to discuss events at principals e conference with Jeff Dunn ee liability. Review of filing from	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
	TIME G:29321 6/14/2010 om Bank regarding settlement ration of response thereto.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
regarding transfere applies to Willis cla	G:29437 8/3/2010 to discuss status of case stillity. Review of filing from all particle liability. Research issue as it ass. Preparation of opposition to garding transferee liability.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
bind transferees. Madiscuss case. Exclude regarding opposition	TIME G:29437 8/3/2010 In of brief in opposition to motion to Multiple meetings with Dave to hange of emails with PWS on brief. Review of briefs filed in 6 motion to bind transferees.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
75643 6/2/2010 Billed Create Pumping H	G:29437 8/3/2010	Ashley Case management Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
binds transferees	ith Jeff Dunn regarding notice that and US opposition to proposed th David to discuss case and	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75648 6/3/2010 Billed Create Pumping Hi		Ashley Case management 0 Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	375.00
	s with Warren Wellen regarding e emails from all counsel regardi	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75649 6/4/2010 Billed Create Pumping H		Ashley Case management 0 Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	375.00
regarding mediatio	TIME G:29437 8/3/201 conferences with Bill Waldo n and expert Thomas Harter. with Dave Z to discuss same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
convince Lengthy telephone PWS reply brief. R	G:29437 8/3/20 conversation with Jeff Dunn to mediator Waldo. conversation with BHJ regardin eview of reply brief. Exchange of sel regarding case.		4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75691 6/9/2010 Billed Preparation of brie regarding transfere Review of filings.	TIME G:29437 8/3/20 ^o f in response to PWS brief see order. Legal research same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing 0 Antelope	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
reply brief. Telepho case. Telephone c	G:29437 8/3/20- n of brief in response to purveyoone conference with BHJ regard onference with Dave Z regarding ons with principals group.	ng	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75708 6/11/2010 Billed Review and prepar regarding transfere	ration for hearing on motion	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75704 6/14/2010 Billed Telephonic appear transferees. Pre an Telephone confere	ance at hearing on motion to bind ad post meeting with Dave Z. nce with Jeff Dunn regarding e conference with BHJ and Jeff	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
75705 6/15/2010 Billed Exchange of email appoint expert.	TIME G:29437 8/3/2010 s with David Z regarding motion to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	200.00
motion for court ap of letter from abser settlement. Prepar Telephone confere settlement. further	G:29437 8/3/2010 nce with Robert Kush regarding pointed expert. Receipt and reviev nt class member JMBM regarding ation of response thereto. nce with Warren Wellen regarding preparation of response to class f counter proposal to principals		6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
appoint expert. Ass recharge. Telephor class members. Re regarding settleme	G:29437 8/3/2010 Ince with BHJ regarding motion to semble blow up for pumping and the conference with BHJ regarding eview and meeting with David nt agreement. Review of posting bunn regarding modified transfered		3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1360.00
class certification of	nce with Bill West regarding Willing orders. Exchange of email with Bil eview of order entered by court		3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
expert fees. Meetir	TIME G:29437 8/3/2010 Ince with BHJ regarding motion for any with Dave Z to discuss incipals and other issues regarding		2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75752 TIME 6/23/2010		2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
75785 TIME 6/24/2010 Billed G:29437 8/3/2010 Telephone conference with Jeff Green regarding principals meeting. Telephone conference with BHJ regarding same. Telephone conference with David Z regarding revised proposal among principals. Research expert issues.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00
75801 TIME 6/25/2010 Billed G:29437 8/3/2010 Meeting with David to discuss proposed principals settlement meeting. Conference call with David to discuss proposed principals settlement meeting. Review of proposal. Exchange of email with counsel	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75824 TIME 6/28/2010 Billed G:29437 8/3/2010 Meeting with Dave to discuss settlement agreement. Telephone conference with Greg James regarding principals proposal. Telephone conference with Jeff Green regarding settlement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
75829 TIME 6/29/2010 Billed G:29437 8/3/2010 Exchange of emails with William West. Meeting with David Z to discuss case. Review of expert information		3.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1560.00
75856 TIME 6/30/2010 Billed G:29437 8/3/2010 Exchange of email with all counsel regarding settlement. Review of agreement. Meeting with Davi to discuss same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1840.00
75863 TIME 7/1/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Reviewed opposition briefs, conference with all counsel regarding settlement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
with BHJ, Greg Jar settlement. Review	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 from court. Telephone conference mes and David Z regarding of emails from counsel. eting with principals group.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management	Variance 4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1760.00
settlement with the	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 mdale to meet and discuss Waldo group. Travel time to and arted at 9:30 am and arrived home	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	12.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	4800.00
conference with BI conference with Je Telephone confere particiaption in Wa	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 arding Waldo process. Telephone HJ regarding mediation. Telephone iff Dunn regarding meeting. Ince Tom Bunn regarding Palmdale ildo mediation. Review of antelope in for meeting with Jeff Dunn.	•	6.70 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2680.00
settlement and the Antonovich. Preap	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 Dunn and Warren Wellen regarding ir meeting with Supervisor ration for meeting. Further meeting ss case. Review of order from cour		5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2200.00
and preparation of	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 I with counsel regarding settlement femail in response. Preparation for motion for court appointed expert. ration for hearing.	, ,	4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1760.00
	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 with counsel regarding cmc of proposed cmc statement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Correspondence Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
Company, then wit company, then wit Review of status c	TIME G:29441 8/10/2010 conferences with Jim Waldo and th landowners counsel and h Jeff Dunn and County counsel. onference statements filed by all in of status conference statement	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description for Willis class. Review of Waldo draft Accord.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
76049 TIME 7/14/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Multiple telephone conferences with County counsel and BBK regarding settlement. Multiple emails from all parties regarding CMC. Multiple telephone conferences with all PWS regarding status of Board approvals. Final preparation of CMC statement on behalf of Willis class. Meeting with Dave Z to discuss case. Preparation for hearing on motion for court appointed expert.	·	8.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3520.00
76100 TIME 7/15/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Appearance telephonically for motion on court appointed expert and on motion to continue trial date Preparation for hearing. Exchange of emails post hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
76160 TIME 7/19/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Preparation of case management conference statement. Exchange of email with PWS. Telephone conference with landowners counsel including Fife and Joyce. Review of willis settlement agreement. Exchange of email and telephone conference with Greg James regarding agreement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
76161 TIME 7/20/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Telephone conference with Robert Kush regarding settlement. Attention to posting on website of CMC statement and review of McLaclan letter to all parties regarding Robie mediation. Telephone conference with Bill Sloan regarding settlement agreement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
76180 TIME 7/21/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Meeting with to discuss case and dismissal of Lancaster. Lengthy telephone conference with Jeff Green regarding settlement. Response to email from Willis class member. Revier of email from Lancaster regarding Waldo mediation.		2,20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
76184 TIME 7/22/2010 Billed G:29441 8/10/2010 Exchange of email with Warren Wellen regarding settlement. Exchange of email with Keith Lemieux regarding settlement. Exchange of email with Jim	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Waldo regarding mediatio	n. Review of court order.	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
76194 TIME 7/26/2010 Billed G:294 Telephone conference wit continuance. Review of ex	h Jeff Dunn regarding trial cparte application to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	3.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1560.00
76203 TIME 7/27/2010 Billed G:294 Review of filed documents 29th before Judge Komar with Jeff Dunn regarding A Exchange of emails with E Waldo process.	s prior to hearing on the r. Telephone conference Addendum with PWD.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
76219 TIME 7/28/2010 Billed G:294 Review of CMC from Boltt emails with Jeff Dunn reg- settlement. Exchange of e regarding addendum. Fur addendum to stipulation of	nouse farms. Exchange of arding stipulation of emails with Tom Bunn ther preparation of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
	t hearing on case and request to continue tria one conference with David o mediation. Exchange of	•	3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1360.00
76296 TIME 7/30/2010 Billed G:294 Exchange of emails with signatures on settlement. Brad Weeks regarding sa preparation of notice to cl	Jeff Dunn regarding Exchange of emails with me. Review and further	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
	Jeff Dunn regarding d MSJ against non-settling call with Jeff Dunn and Davi Phelan. Research facts in xchange of emails with		3.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1280.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
76475 8/9/2010 Billed Exchange of email settlement. Review	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 s with Jeff Dunn regarding Willis of minute order from court ediation. Meeting with Dave z to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	400.00
	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 respondence to Susan Trager Receipt of response thereto. I Zlotnick.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
Trager regarding N	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 I to discuss status. Letter to Susan ISJ. Telephone conference with and Brad Weeks regarding of Accord.		4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
Jeff Dunn. Letter to	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 with counsel Warren Wellen and o Susan Trager regarding msj. Antonovich. Meeting with Dave Zon.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
of compromise. Ex	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 ation briefs and related agreement schange of email with opposing mediation. Review of court order.		4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
76532 8/18/2010 Billed Review of emails a mediation.	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 and related attachments regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
with Susan Trager	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 on briefs. Telephone conference regarding document production. ence with Greg James regarding t motion.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
76577 8/20/2010 Billed Telephone confere	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 ence with Mike M regarding ge of emails with all counsel.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
motion for summar tomorrow. Brief rev	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 ence with Jeff Dunn regarding ry judgment and mediation view of documents produced by arding changes to update Willis	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
76590 8/23/2010 Billed Organized and upl responses and red	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 oaded PPHCSD's discovery ords.	Erica Case management Antelope	0.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	37.50
	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 es with David Zlotnick regarding tice Robie. Review of emails from	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 I Z to discuss mediation of ge of email with Waldo group.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	520.00
76623 8/26/2010 Billed Review of mediation David Z to discuss	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 on summary and meeting with same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 n of case management conference g with David to discuss same.	•	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
Wellen and Jeff Di	TIME G:29512 9/15/2010 ence with Eric Garner, Warren unn regarding settlement, Robie stion against Phelan. Meeting with ame.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
76755 TIME 9/7/2010 Billed G:29569 10/12/2010 Preparation for case management conference. Review of all CMC statements. Appearance at hearing on CMC. Telephone conference with Susan Trager regarding settlement and court's response to settlement. Telephone conference with Jeff Dunn regarding hearing and status of judgment. Meeting with David Z to discuss timing of motions including motion for judgment on the pleadings or MSJ.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Hearing	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
76773 TIME 9/8/2010 Billed G:29569 10/12/2010 Preparation of motion for judgment on the pleadings. Research procedure for filing same. Telephone conference with Stefanie Headland regarding documents in support thereof. Exchange of email with Jeff Dunn regarding motions. Meeting with David and Vic to discuss motions.	r n	8.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3280.00
78408 TIME 9/8/2010 WIP Document review and preparation of motion for judgment on pleadings.	Vic Merjanian Briefing Antelope	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	825.00
78410 TIME 9/8/2010 WIP Document review in preparation of motion for judgment on the pleadings.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	1.08 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	162.00
78411 TIME 9/9/2010 WIP Document review in preparation for motion for judgment on the pleadings.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	1.92 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	288.00
76795 TIME 9/9/2010 Billed G:29569 10/12/2010 Research and preparation of request for judicial notice. Preparation of request. Research motion for judgment on the pleadings. Preparation of same. Review documents for court to take judicial notice. Exchange of emails with opposing counsel regarding Phelan Well number 14.	·	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
78409 TIME 9/9/2010 WIP Document review and research in preparation of judgment on pleadings.	Vic Merjanian Briefing Antelope	5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	750.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
78412 9/10/2010 WIP	TIME ote motion for judgment on the	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	4.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	700.50
9/10/2010 Billed Further preparation	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 of motion for judgment on the ne conference with Jeff Dunn	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	5.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2240.00
9/13/2010 Billed	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 In the pleadings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
9/14/2010 Billed Telephone conferen motion for prelimina preparation of order	G:29569 10/12/2010 Ince with Jeff Dunn regarding ry approval. Review and further on motion for approval. Meeting uses scheduling of motion for final to the control of the	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.60 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1440.00
9/20/2010 Billed Review of motion for	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 r preliminary approval and email th David regarding same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00
9/21/2010 Billed Telephone conferen to motion for prelimi emails with Tom Bu	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 ace with BHJ regarding opposition nary approval. Exchange of nn. Review of settlement one conference with Susan Trage s.	1	1.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	520.00
9/24/2010 Billed	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 filed by landonwers and onse thereto.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	5.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2200.00
9/27/2010 Billed	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 m AGWA, Bolthouse, and case authority.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
76988 9/28/2010 Billed Print and organize	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 cases on Westlaw.	Ashley Research Antelope	1.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	187.50
	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 support of finality of judgment and one. Preparation of reply brief.		4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1760.00
76999 9/30/2010 Billed Researched and s	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 aved cases from westlaw.	Ashley Research Antelope	1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	125.00
reply brief. Review	TIME G:29569 10/12/2010 f judgment. Further preparation of of Bolthouse supplemental brief inary approval of settlement.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
77133 10/1/2010 Billed Review of filings a	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 nd preparation for hearing.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	6.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2520.00
with Jeff Dunn reg discuss same. Em conference with Ro Resesarch finality	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 om court. Telephone conference arding order. Meeting with Dave to ail with counsel. Telephone owena regarding calendar. of judgment and further preparatio thouse supplemental briefs.		6.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2760.00
77153 10/5/2010 Billed Further research a Bolthouse brief.	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 nd preparation of sur reply to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	5.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2360.00
78415 10/5/2010 WIP Prepared final judg	TIME gment.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	3.33 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	499.50
	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 ence with Jeff Dunn and Warren status of hearing and terms of	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00

Slip ID		User	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Activity Client Reference	DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Info Bill Status	
77253 10/15/2010 Billed Preparation of mod	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 difications to website based on view of emails and filings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
77280 10/18/2010 Billed Research finality ore research.	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 If judgment. Preparation of memo	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
77282 10/19/2010 Billed Further research o preliminary approv	TIME G:29622 11/12/2010 cases regarding motion for val.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1760.00
78413 11/9/2010 WIP Reviewed docume preparation of oral	ents and prepared questions in argument.	Vic Merjanian Briefing Antelope	2.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	300.00
77543 11/11/2010 Billed Further preparatio Bolthouse claim. F preliminary approv	TIME G:29675 12/9/2010 For order and response to Further preparation for hearing on val.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	5.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2080.00
77608 11/12/2010 Billed Research cases a preparation for hea	TIME G:29675 12/9/2010 nd review of pleadings in aring.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	8.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3240.00
78407 11/15/2010 WIP Oral argument and	TIME d strategy discussion.	Vic Merjanian Case management Antelope	0.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	100.50
	TIME G:29675 12/9/2010 ew of cases and pleading in pearance at hearing on motion for val.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00
	TIME G:29675 12/9/2010 urt to argue motion for preliminary with counsel before and after San Diego.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	8.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3200.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
77626 TIME 11/19/2010	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
77628 TIME 11/22/2010 Billed G:29675 12/9/2010 Preparation of stipulation regarding class notice. Further preparation of notice. Email Jeff Dunn regarding same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
78414 TIME 11/29/2010 WIP Researched 1021.5 attorneys fees.	Vic Merjanian Briefing Antelope	2.67 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	400.50
77651 TIME 11/29/2010 Billed G:29675 12/9/2010 Telephone conference with Rowena Walker regardir Notice to class. Telephone conference with Bill Wes regarding AV Accord. Exchange of emails with Jeff Dunn regarding notice.		1.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	480.00
77659 TIME 11/30/2010 Billed G:29675 12/9/2010 Multiple telephone conferences with Jeff Dunn regarding revised Notice. Final review and preparation of same. Telephone conference to Rowena Walker regarding Notice. Exchange of ema with counsel regarding same.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference Antelope	2.90 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1160.00
77920 TIME 12/7/2010 WIP Met with Ralph, researched and drafted memo on "opt out."	Vic Merjanian Briefing Antelope	4.75 0.00 0.00 0.00	150.00 T@1	712.50
77944 TIME 12/21/2010 WIP Telephone conference with class members regarding re join. Review of filings.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Class Notice Antelope g	2.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	840.00
Grand Total			=	
	Billable Unbillable Total	4361.62 0.00 4361.62	_	1580770.50 0.00 1580770.50