EXHIBIT B

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75460 5/20/2010 Billed Telephone confere	nce with class member Neil ational Bank. Preparation of me	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference 0 Antelope	0.70 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	280.00
meeting. Telephon	TIME G:29321 6/14/201 to discuss events at principals e conference with Jeff Dunn e liability. Review of filing from	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	2.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	960.00
	TIME G:29321 6/14/201 om Bank regarding settlement ration of response thereto.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management 0 Antelope	1.10 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	440.00
regarding transfere applies to Willis cla	G:29437 8/3/20 ⁻ to discuss status of cassility. Review of filing from all parele liability. Research issue as it ass. Preparation of opposition to garding transferee liability.	ies	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
bind transferees. Maiscuss case. Exc regarding opposition	TIME G:29437 G:29437 Nultiple meetings with Dave to hange of emails with PWS on brief. Review of briefs filed in a motion to bind transferees.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing I0 Antelope to	6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
75643 6/2/2010 Billed Create Pumping H	G:29437 8/3/20	Ashley 10 Case management 10 Antelope	4.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	500.00
binds transferees	ith Jeff Dunn regarding notice th and US opposition to proposed th David to discuss case and	Ralph Kalfayan4 Conference 10 Antelope at	1.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	560.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
75648 TIME 6/3/2010 Billed G:29437 Create Pumping History Chart	8/3/2010	Ashley Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	375.00
75623 TIME 6/4/2010 Billed G:29437 Exchange of emails with Warren W settlement. Multiple emails from all mediation. Review of filings.		'	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75649 TIME 6/4/2010 Billed G:29437 Create Pumping History Chart	8/3/2010	Ashley Case management Antelope	3.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	125.00 T@1	375.00
75631 TIME 6/7/2010 Billed G:29437 Multiple telephone conferences wit regarding mediation and expert Th Multiple meetings with Dave Z to d	th Bill Waldo omas Harter.	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00
75644 TIME 6/8/2010 Billed G:29437 Lengthy telephone conversation w convince Lengthy telephone conversation w PWS reply brief. Review of reply b email with all counsel regarding ca	ith Jeff Dunn to mediator Waldo. Ith BHJ regarding rief. Exchange of	Raiph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75691 TIME 6/9/2010 Billed G:29437 Preparation of brief in response to regarding transferee order. Legal review of filings.	PWS brief	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	7.80 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	3120.00
75696 TIME 6/10/2010 Billed G:29437 Further preparation of brief in resp reply brief. Telephone conference case. Telephone conference with I status of negotiations with principal	onse to purveyor with BHJ regarding Dave Z regarding	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	4.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1720.00
75708 TIME 6/11/2010 Billed G:29437 Review and preparation for hearin regarding transferees.		Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		User Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
transferees. Pre ar Telephone confere	rance at hearing on motion to bind nd post meeting with Dave Z. ence with Jeff Dunn regarding e conference with BHJ and Jeff	Ralph Kalfayan4 Ct. appearance Antelope	4.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1680.00
75705 6/15/2010 Billed Exchange of email appoint expert.	TIME G:29437 8/3/2010 s with David Z regarding motion to	Ralph Kalfayan4 Briefing Antelope	0.50 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	200.00
motion for court ap of letter from abse settlement. Prepar Telephone confere settlement. further	G:29437 8/3/2010 ence with Robert Kush regarding experit Receipt and review nt class member JMBM regarding ation of response thereto. ence with Warren Wellen regarding preparation of response to class of counter proposal to principals		6.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	2480.00
appoint expert. As: recharge. Telepho class members. Ro regarding settleme	G:29437 8/3/2010 ence with BHJ regarding motion to semble blow up for pumping and ne conference with BHJ regarding eview and meeting with David ent agreement. Review of posting bunn regarding modified transferee	Ralph Kalfayan4 Case management Antelope	3.40 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1360.00
class certification of	ence with Bill West regarding Willis orders. Exchange of email with Bill eview of order entered by court		3.30 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	1320.00
expert fees. Meetir	TIME G:29437 8/3/2010 ence with BHJ regarding motion for any with Dave Z to discuss ncipals and other issues regarding		2.20 0.00 0.00 0.00	400.00 T@1	880.00